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No choice; Boyne plans
45 % water rate hike

BOYNE CITY—City water rates will
soon have to rise because the city
charter and the bonds issued for water
service improvement both require the
city's water services pay for them-
selves.

At the city commission meeting Tues-
day, City Manager Tim Gifton explain-
ed the city has been in violation of both
requirements since 1976 when it started
taking money from its general funds to
cover the deficit in the cost of running
the water service to city residents.

Every year the cost has increased, so
that the borrowing for 1980 is up to
$115,350, and this is not including such
things as depreciation costs.

In previous years efforts were unsuc-
cessful to raise water rates effectively
and finance more sweeping repairs to
the 70-year-old system of mains.

'' Now we have to pay for that," noted
Commissioner Catherine Jessup.

The price is high, the commissioners
agree. An average increase of 45
percent in water bills will hurt enough
to make lawn care a luxury. Water itself
will be a luxury, according to those who
attended the commission meeting.

While the actual water usage fee will
remain at 75 cents per 1,000 gallons, the
quarterly billing on service costs (like
the basic monthly charge on a telephone
bill) will need to jump from $10 on a

typical bill to $15.50. The sewer base
rate will also increase from $10 to
$15.50.

Proposed sewage charges, which are
figured on water use, also rise sharp-
ly—to $1.25 per 1,000 gallons. Con-
nection charges are another place where
the fees rise—from $200 to $300.

Water turn-off fee, which is now
below the cost of doing it—$2.50—will
go to $15 if the changes go into effect.

The whole proposed schedule will
appear in The Charlevoix County Press.

The commission has struggled to find
an alternative but everything else, as
Commissioner Martin Paul pointed out,
only postpones the day of reckoning.

According to City Attorney Harvey
Varnum, delaying affects the city's
standing in the bond market.

The increases in the schedule were
figured by a professional agency,
Clifton said, in a five-year projection of
water service costs.

Included is a modest capital improve-
ment fund, but Clifton said he couldn't
predict how fast renovation of the badly
leaking system could be made. As it
stands, the 33 miles of water lines and
33 miles of sewer lines would cost $10.5
million to replace.

Some repairs could be made, Jessup
noted, if the Small Cites Grant of about
$500,000 were to come through from the

U.S. Department of Housing and Urban
Development.

Hearings have been scheduled on the
proposed rates, the next one being Nov.

Some help to the city's struggle with
water mains will come from the first
stages of the Harborage construction.

Dave Trout,- Harborage architect,
proposed to the city commission Tues-
day a 15-inch sanitary sewer pipe down
Front Street, stopping at Phase I of the
project, and connecting to the present
fine at approximately Second Street.

Harborage only needs eight-inch
pipe, but the city, by paying the cost of
the additional* seven inches, would
benefit by new, adequate sewer, for
only $10,000. according to Clifton.

The commission noted there will
eventually have to be sewer lines
around the whole lake, and the cost of
even serving nearby growth would be
much greater if the city had to put in the
line.

In addition, Harborage will be putting
in eight-inch water lines connecting to
city lines in such a way as to create a
water loop, thereby increasing pressure
reserves.

Storm water will be handled by
directing run-off into the lawns and
permanent ponds.

These people, mo§t of them East Jordan residents, all ride the bos to work at Courter In Boyne City.

More and more riders
try new bus system

EJ schools make cuts...again
BY JIM BAUMANN

EAST JORDAN—It was a scene that
had been acted out many times in the
past six months.

The elementary school cafeteria was
two-thirds full of people who had come
to a school board meeting. Many of
them were teachers who had come to
talk about how they could cut school
programs to save money.

The fact that voters had finally
approved some operating millage last
Thursday didn't brighten anyone's spir-
its.

Two extra proposals totaling 1.7 mills
were defeated...and even if they had
passed, the latest in a series of state
budget cuts still would have left the
district short of operating funds.

Before the election, $158,000 in cuts
had been made. After the election,
administrators chopped another $74,000
out of the budget.

But the big problem still facing the
school system is that $150,000 in cuts

still need to be made unless more
millage is approved by voters.

Little was decided Tuesday night,
other than the voters must be asked for
the fourth time this year to approve
millage. An election date of Dec. 8 was
set.

The specific amount of millage to be
requested on the ballot will be decided
in a special school board meeting at 7
p.m. Monday.

Meanwhile, a steering committee of
teachers, citizens and administrators
will meet at 7 p.m. Thursday to make a
recommendation on the millage amount
—and programs to cut if the millage
doesn't pass in December. That group
will meet in the elementary school
media center.

A rough list of possible cuts men-
tioned Tuesday include: custodians,
high school building trades program, a
half-time learning center teacher, half-
time middle school counselor, half-time
middle school reading specialist, full-
time elementary school art and music

teachers, athletics, band, giving ad-
ministrators part-time teaching posi-
tions, and general curriculum cuts in
high school and middle school.

When the final cut list Is formulated
next week, some of the cuts would
probably be made immediately and
others would be made only if the
December millage did not pass.

Supt. Mel Rullman told the school
board and audience that the school is in
"an involved, complicated situation,"
because the State Legislature has not
finalized a permanent state aid formula.

The $150,000 in budget cuts is using a
conservative estimate provided by the
state Department of Education, Rull-
man said.

Other Lansing officials—"most of
them politicians"—think that the state
aid cuts won't be as severe as now
predicted. "If we use their formula, we
would break even or come out ahead
without making anymore cuts," Rull-
man said. "But he have no guarantee.
We can't build a budget on hope."

BY KATHY JOHNSON
Ask Kelly Stackus, dispatcher for the

u'\v Charlevoix County Transit system
or George Kraft, daily supervisor, how
they feel about the response to busing
in the area and they'll tell you they are
"very pleased."

Kraft said that overall they are
pleased with the response to the
system. "There are a lot of people that
we can't get to, but a lot of people are
satisfied with the system," Kraft said.

The county transit system got under-
way on July 21 and had a record day last
week when there were a total of 321
riders on Oct. 8. During the month of
September, 3,880 riders participated
with an average of 280 riders per day.

There are several bus runs that are
almost full, with places for just one or
two more riders, but most other runs
have space available on a regular basis,
Stackus said.

Most of the regular runs are set up to
take people to and from work. For
example, one bus leaves East Jordan
around 7:15 a.m. and arrives in Boyne
City by 7:45.

Another run starts in Charlevoix
around 6 a.m.. with a stop in East
Jordan, then at Grandvue by 6:50 a.m.
and into Boyne City by 7:15 a.m. That
same bus then returns to East 'Jordan

with a load of riders by 8 a.m.
There is another run from Boyne City

to East Jordan, arriving by 7 a.m. to go
to the iron Works, Gulf & Western, and
East Jordan Tool and Die.

One of the problems with the system
for many people is the lack of buses
going where they want, exactly when
they want them.

"We really need 24-hour notice in
order to assure people a bus," said
Stackus. Even then, because of limited
buses and runs that are already
scheduled, it depends on when a person
needs a ride as to whether they can be
scheduled.

One recent call to The Press came
from a lady who was upset because she
couldn't get a ride to the doctor's office.
The problem was that at 3:30 p.m., she
was requesting a ride (for 8:15 the next
morning) during a peak ride time. Kraft
indicated that at some time periods ail
buses are busy and that the system is
operating almost to capacity.

Regular runs are made on Monday to
Petoskey for doctor and hospital ap-
pointments. The bus leaves Charlevoix
by 9:30 a.m. and then goes to East
Jordan, Boyne City and on to Petoskey.

Asked about expansion, Kraft
explained, "We're somewhat limited to
what we can do. The program we are

under provides us with seven buses.
One of those is supposed to be on
standby to cover breakdowns and
emergencies, but we are actually
operating all seven buses now."

Kraft went on to say that the state is
trying to find another bus that is in
usable condition to be a standby bus.
"We'll be lucky if we can get another
one...and we really need it," Kraft said.

"If I have a bus break down for any
reason, then we are short because we
are using all we have now. A stand-
by could be pulled in to cover that
vehicle until it could be repaired without
loss of service to our customers."

Service is available Monday through
Friday from 6 a.m. to 6 p.m. and
24-hour advance reservations will
usually assure you of service. No
smoking, eating or drinking are allowed
on the buses.

Rates for the service are 40 cents a
one-way trip within city limits and not to
exceed two miles. Within the county
and exceeding two miles the cost is 70
cents one-way.

Trips outside of the county, not
exceeding 10 miles beyond the county
line, cost $1.50. Children under 12 years
of age, handicapped people, persons
needed to assist handicappers and
senior citizens pay half fare.

City won't have to repay grant?
BOYNE CITY—The engineering firm

that built the city's wastewater treat-
ment plant assured city commissioners
Tuesday they will not have to dig into
empty pockets to pay back their
$108,300 grant.

Williams and Works vice president,
Zane Miller, told the city commission
Tuesday, "We feel it was unfortunate
you should receive such a letter from
the EPA." He was referring to the
Environmental Protection Agency's re-
cent threat to require federal funds to
be returned by the city.

The funds have been spent on the
sewage treatment plant. EPA, not
specifically, questioned the use of part
of the money by W&W and asked to see
their books.

Miller said the only letter his com-
pany got from EPA was a brief one
asking for their position on auditing
their books.

Miller told the commission the pro-
cess "takes tremendous time" and the
expense is not covered, but that they
would provide answers to any specific
questions the EPA might ask.

"What is at stake is the government's
right to go into company books," Miller
said.

"I would like to assure you we would
do nothing at all to cause you embar-
rassment," he told the commission. He
assured the commission they were not
in jeopardy, adding the company had an
attorney standing by,

City Manager Clifton said, "It's a
legal question...it won't go away over-
night." Then he added, "You can't get
blood out of a turnip."

Press wins national award
The Charlevoix County Press

editorial page has been recognized
as one of the best in the nation for a
newspaper of its size.

The National Newspaper Associa-
tion announced this week that The
Press had been awarded an Honor-
able Mention certificate in the
editorial page division of its 1980
newspaper contest.

The Press was irr competition with
hundreds of other weekly news:

papers in the "less than 5,000"
circulation class.

The award was announced in
conjunction with National News-
paper Week, Oct. 12-18.

The honorable mention award
placed The Press editorial page
among the top five in its class in the
nation.

Beating out The Press were
weekly newspapers from
Plaquemine, La.; South Lyons,

Mich, and Sidney, Neb. Sharing an
honorable mention with The Press
was a paper from Yellow Springs,
Ohio.

The only other northern Mich-
igan newspaper to win an award in
the national contest was the Otsego
County Herald Times of Gaylord.
which won first place for a special
edition published when a local team
won the girls' Little League World
Series.

BC Community Ed hard hit by state aid cuts
BY KATHY JOHNSON

BOYNE CITY - Recent state budget
cuts have now moved Boyne City out of
the state aid formula, and one of the
hardest hit programs will be Com-
munity Education.

!ln a report to the school board
Monday, Community Education Direc-
(otvJudy Johnson, showed how state
aid funding and other programs had
enabled the school district to have a
$58,000 program with a "local cost" of
only $13,273,69 for the 1979-80 school

Funding included state aid of
$23,275.38, class fees of $4,459.50,
Johnson's salary reimbursement of
$8,289.98, CETA funding of $£,975.75
tad miscellaneous income of $372.08 for
a toUl of $45,472,69.

With, expenses for the program
running at $58,746.38, the local school
system paid only the $13,273.69 dif-
ference last year.

With the loss of state aid for the
current year and loss of some of the
salary reimbursement, the cost to the
-local school system could be closer to
$40,000 for the coming year.

Asked on Tuesday about funding for
the program, Superintendent Rich Kelly
said, ''We've tried to keep the
Community Education program costs
down to about the same as last year. I'm
prepared to bring in a balanced
budget."

Kelly also indicated that the latest
word, on salary reimbursement was "we
are going to receive some money for
Community Education. No one knows
how much,"

Kelly went on to explain that the
actual figures would not be available
until January. Estimated figures for the
year are around $4,000, but loss of all
aid could result in the program costing
nearly $45,000 for the 1980-81 school

y e a r . • / , , • •• '' : . , • •••'.•..

At the school board meeting Johnson
reviewed last year's programs and
discussed the programs for the Current
year. Community Ed. during the 1979-
80 year had over 1,100 participants in
enrichment, recreation OF high school
completion courses.

Thirty classes were offered last year
for high school completion and 65 for
enrichment or recreation. There were 93
school-related and community groups
that used the school buildings and some
982 people participated in activities at
the Holdings each month.

The 982 monthly participants did not
include the sporting events or those
participating in Community Ed.
programming. These figures would
push the total welt over 1,000 per
month.

Some of the special services Com-
munity Ed. offers include being a
G.E.D. Testing Center for the area,
sponsoring Men's Independent Basket-
ball League, the July 4th art show, and
the co-ed volleyball league.

The board seemed pleased with the
program and Johnson reported that
Community Ed. had also established a
Farmers' Market this past summer at
Old City Park. More than 100 vendors
participated during the course of the
summer.

In the past three years'26 adults have
received diplomas through high school

completion* courses and for the current
year there are 51 students enrolled.

When asked how many of those were
potential graduates for the coming
spring, Johnson said it would be
January before she could tell. "Many
people wili add classes and some will
drop out. We'II have to wait to see how
it looks in January."

Johnson also reported on the new
recreation program in the elementary
school. "There is an after-school
recreation program with about 40 kids
participating on Monday, Tuesday and
Wednesday," Johnson said.

"On Thursday we have an arts and
crafts day for grades one through five
and on Saturday we have about 25 kids
who arc participating in soccer," she

d ' ' " '
There are also currently 13 enrich-

ment classes operating at the high
school. Upcoming plans include an art
show to be held Dec. 6, in the high
school gymnasium. . \

Other items discussed at the Monday;
board meeting included an audit report-
from Hill, Woodcock and Distel for the1

1979-80 school year, tuition rates, and
discussion on the building usage policy.

Following the meeting, a closed
session was held to discuss non-in-
structional negotiations.

Kelly reported on Tuesday that the;
board had passed a resolution ratifying
the contract with the Michigan Educa-'
tional Support Personal Association.'
MESPA represents non-teaching
employees, including bus drivers,
cooks, secretaries and receptionists.
MESPA must still vote to accept the-

' c o n t r a c t . ; - ' ' * ' ' - •' • ' •• ' . ••;• .••''••• • , ''•
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year, best in the state.
This year, topk 5 in the nation
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We're proud!
Last year the Michigan Press Association

honored The Charlevoix County Press for having
the best editorial page in the state among weekly
newspapers of our size.

This year, the National Newspaper Association
awarded The Press an Honorable Mention
certificate. That puts our editorial page among the
top five in the United States*

We're proud of our Viewpoints page, and we're
proud of our staff for earning this latest award. And
we pledge to keep giving you, our readers, the best
newspaper we can possibly produce.

Qharlevoix Gounty

Your community newspaper

1 . . - / • ' • • • ' • ; ! / - . ' • • ' ; • / • • . ' .



Lawmen
honored

Prosecuting Attorney Scott T. Beatty, second from left, congratulates Charlevolx
County Sheriff George T. Lasater, Boyne City police officer Donald Hawkins and
sheriffs deputy Dale Boehm Jr., for meritorious service in handling a dangerous
arrest. The awards were given by the Michigan Sheriff's Association. The three
lawmen apprehended Paul Thackaberry on Dec. 8, 1979, on Ferry Road in Eveline
Township. At the time of his arrest, Thackaberry was armed with a 45 caliber,
semi-automatic gun and threatened Lasater with the loaded weapon. Says Beatty,
"It was due to their professionalism, and restraint that the arrest was effected
without any injuries."

Leftover funds help
Boyne buy computer

Janet Bogema

Boyne actress j

in college !

production

Janet Bogema, an Oakland University
student from Boyne City, will play Miss
Raynor in the student production of
"Black Coffee" opening Oct. 23 in the
Studio Theatre of Varner Hall.

Bogema is participating in the
Midwest premiere performance of this
old Agatha Christie mystery-comedy.

Bogema, a senior theatre arts major,
starred in "My Fair Lady" and other
productions at Boyne City High School.
She also has appeared in productions by
the Lakeside Players and Northwestern
Michigan Players.

At Oakland University, Bogema has
participated in the productions of
"Celebration," "Turn of the Screw,"
and "The Good Doctor."

Her other interests besides theatre
include playing the piano, singing,
writing, traveling and skiing.

n See our complete line office
equipment and machines,
Mita, 3M copiers. Smith
C o r o n a , R e m i n g t o n
typewriters.

Schafer s
113 E. Water

Boyne City

582-6331

EMMET
CONSTRUCTION

CO.
Authorized builder of

National Homes

VA mile North of M-75
on US-131

Walloon Lake, Ml.
Models approved

for low interest loans
(616)535-2131

BOYNE CITY - Moving into the
computer age, Boyne City will be in the
company of most other cities- and
counties in the area.

It will happen because the bonding
that put $500,000 in the bank to buy the
new city hall stipulated the money had
to be spent on city hall and not
transferred to something else.

Of the $50,000 remaining from the
purchase of the city hall building, some
went for a gas furnace and some for
firebarn doors.

The remaining $23,000 is going to
buy a data processor, city commission-
ers decided Tuesday.

For at least the past three years the
commission has explored the possibility
of using data processing. Governmental
advisors have recommended computer
use, and the financing of a 5120 I.B.M.
machine would, including the "soft
ware" to run it. fit the remaining city
hall money.

The present city hall staff would be
trained in the use of the computer. And
although computer use in figuring water
bills, payroll, accounts payable and so
on would save days of staff time, Clifton
says no one would be dropped from the
staff. Administrative duties would soak
up the computer-saved time.

We're glad you asked!
with Tom Vanderwall

Do survivors of a ^

feel the 'Stages oTDMth11?

In her book. On Death and Dying, Dr. Elisabeth Kubler-Ross indicated that
the acceptance of any death usually goes through these stages: shock and
denial; great anger and trying to place blame; a brief period of bargaining
followed by a long and often deep depression; then, hopefully, ultimate
acceptance of the facts of life • and death.

Dr. Kubier-Ross further states that the survivors of sudden-death victims
must go through the same stages of grief as for survivors of those whose
death comes slowly.

Reading about and becoming better acquainted with the stages of grief
can provide insights for thoughtful contemplation. Reaching a point of
understanding how others have had to cope with similar situations can
provide strength and consolation at the time of death of a loved one.

We have quite a few books and lists of others which may assist you in
coping with your loss of loved ones. We stand ready to help you as best we
can. Remember, your needs are our concerns.

VANDERWALL FUNERAL HOME

Serving With A Christian Concern
East Jordan, Mich. 536-7031

Do-lt-Yourseff Easy

Ornamental Iron

Available Now At...

BARDEN
HOME CENTER
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Boyne hires grant consultant
BOYNE CITY - It won't completely

restore the city to perfect water and
sewer-line health, but the city com-
mission thinks $500,000 would help at
least some of the most serious problems
of the system.

At their Oct. 6 meeting, the
commission members voted to have
Gove Associates gather the data neces-
sary for a pre-application to Housing
and Urban Development's Detroit office
for a grant in this amount.

HUD's grants and low-cost loans are
competitively awarded to small cities in
areas of low and middle income levels.
Besides renovating water and sewer
lines, the grant would include raising
substandard housing to code level.

This last feature will be available to
individual home owners by next
summer if HUD approval is earned.

Because Boyne City stands such a
good chance of fulfilling HUD require-
ments, the commission voted the

Congress
candidate
to visit

Dan Dorrity, Democratic candidate
for the House of Representatives from
the 11th Congressional District will be
in Boyne City, Thursday, Oct. 16 to
discuss issues concerning Northern
Michigan.

Dorrity, from Sault Ste. Marie, was
the chairman of the Kincheloe Air Force
Base Conversion Authority and has
served as a commissioner of the
Michigan Commission on Aging.

The meeting, which is open to the
public, will be held from 5:30 p.m. to
8:30 p.m. at the UAW Local 1403 Hall,
29 North Park St.

approximately $2,500 to have Gove
Associates meet the Nov. 17 applica-
tion deadline.

The total possible amount of the grant
is limited by the grant program to a
figure reached by multiplying the
population by $150, producing for
Boyne City, approximately $500,000.

The opportunity for input is Mon-
day's noon hearing scheduled for the
city residents> They can put forward
what projects they think would be
appropriate in addition to what the city
has outlined. At the same time, the
purpose of the city's choices will be
explained.

Zych earns Alabama degree
Ralph Thomas Zych of Boyne City

was one of 380 graduating students
honored at the August honors convo-
cation of the University of Alabama in
Birmingham's School of Community
and Allied Health. The ceremony

recognized those students who
completed their degree requirements in
the summer quarter of 1980.

Zych earned a certificate in the
Surgeon Assistant program.

Hbu're out if you
don t have clout!

Get it when you deal through me, an Independent Insurance Agent. Be-
cause I don't work for any one insurance company, I have clout to negoti-
ate in your behalf, placing your insurance coverage with the company that
suits your needs best.

For your car, home, business or life insurance, contact me at:

HK.J HOt
AUEGSiGGER

, 5TANUY INSURANCE AGENCY YOUR/independent
Insurance m/AGENT

RUEGSEGGER-STANLEY
INSURANCE AGENCY

106 E. Water
Boyne City
582-9381
582-6251

"Sportsmen
Boyne City has a new

location to serve "you'
in Charlevoix County.

//

We are having a
Pre Grand Opening

Introductory Sale going on now
Sale Price

Game Getter Arrows K«•.$.3.6£.(??.№. $23.95 or
,.. . , fci') Oft
(i/i doz.) &±£i*yo

Ben Pearson Hunting Arrows & Tips...R.e.8;??8.?5..$19.50
Arrow Head Cedar Arrows 3/$1.00
Cowhide Finger Tabs 47 { ea.
Cowhide Arm Guards 1-78 ea.

P.S.E. compound bows for the man
who wants

Precision Shooting Equipment

This is one of your best Compound
Bows on the market. Don't miss it!

55 lb. Darton Compound Bows

3 left Reg $89.95 J U S t
$39.95

Package Deal
P.S.E. Compound Bow
Vi Dozen Game Getter Arrows
1 Arm Guard
1 Finger Tab
1 Bow Quiver
1 Set Cobra Bow Sights
1 Compound Bow Case

Sale Price
$119.95

Keg. $220.00

This is a once in a lifetime offer; you'll never see
these prices again!

108 Grovelcmd, Boyne City 582-251 £

y
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Viewpoints
Ahhh, those

great old

newspaper

stereotypes

Kathy
Johnson

As Roarke and Tatoo watch the
arriving passengers all seeking joy on
Fantasy Island, a young John-boy
Walton type walks to them and explains
that he's always wanted to work for a
real newspaper. Always wanted to be a
reporter....and it's off to Somewhere,
U.S.A., where our young friend has the
following adventure

First he meets Charlie. Charlie runs
the hot metal linotype machine in back
and he's been there since just before
World War I. He's good-hearted, gruff,
and he can fix any hunk of junk and
make it run. All the equipment is junk,
but he is an all 'round good guy.

Then there is Gertrude. Gertrude can
sell ads, send out the bills and develop
photos in the closet just off the unisex
potty. Gertrude is really sweet and the
general salt of the earth. In her spare
time she delivers the paper to all the
subscribers.

Mac. Now Mac is your basic grouch
and one terrific newsman. He's been on
the streets since he was 15 and he
knows the score. He drinks too much,
smokes too much, his clothes all look
slept in, and he always wears a hat he
picked up in a bar in 1949. He likes
women in their place.

This unlikely threesome and young

John-boy produce the weekly news.
And then comes the day when Mac isn't
there. The big story comes and
suddenly John-boy has his big chance.

The story is a really big one. He
writes it and yells "Stop the presses!"
This is frontpage stuff...special edition
time.

Mac arrives just in time to tell young
John-boy that he did a great job and will
make a reporter yet. A stranger arrives
to hire John-boy for the Dallas Morning
News and there is another successful
trip on Fantasy Island.

Ahhh. to be on Fantasy Island.
Here at The Charlevoix County Press,

which is one of some 7.600 weekly
newspapers published in the United
States, there is no linotype machine. No
two-fisted, hard-drinking, womanizing,
hat-wearing editor. Well, he doesn't
wear a hat, womanize, or fight. Three
out of four isn't bad.

In the entire office there are only a
couple of people who even smoke. Good
hearted people, yes. Talented, I think
so. Hard-working, definitely.

In the place of the old hot metal
typesetting machine is a baby blue
Compugraphic Jr. that not only sets the
type quietly and electronically, but
justifies the margins into the nice even

edges that you see.
And no one ever yells "Stop the

presses." There are no presses to stop.
Our paper is printed in Traverse City.

There is no Charlie, although we do
have a diminutive young lady who runs
the production department with a small
iron fist and she can fix most of the
occasional illnesses that occur in our
electronic gadgets.

We don't develop our film in a closet.
We have separate potties and we don't
deliver our papers, but with the help of
a Pitney Bowes mailing machine it
arrives in mailboxes by Thursday

The one thing that isn't missing in
Boyne City that you would see on the
Fantasy Island version is the diversifi-
cation of the operation and generally
good times that you get while working

tor a small weekly paper.
Many of the employees here do more

than one job and even doing one job
provides a myriad of experiences. A
reporter here might write a people
feature, sports story, social items and a
school board report, all in the space of a
day. .,

The production department is
constantly busy producing not only a
variety of ads for customers but putting
news pages together to create the
paper.

The office assistant not only answers
the phone but sells classifieds, takes
care of subscriptions, advertising billing
and attempts to keep track of where
everyone is for messages and phone
calls.

Our office manager does some
billing, some selling, bill collecting,
financial reports and in general plays
mother hen to our eccentricities and
tries to keep peace in the office. She and
the editor try very hard to keep us from
hurting each other while attempting to
accomplish their own very busy jobs.

It is one of the "most funniest" jobs
I've had. Each week is a challenge and
I'm delighted to be a part of this revised
version of Fantasy Island. *

I like 'Newspaper Week' best
Of all the "Weeks" in the year I like

National Newspaper Week the best. It
gives editor, writers and ad chasers a
chance to whoop and holler and say.
"Look at me!"

Through the years, however, "Look
at me!" has raised less and less dust.

There was a time when reporters
rated right up there with policemen and
school teachers. It was an exotic
business with young folks envying those
busy fellows with press signs stuck into
their hats.

Reporters used to ride firetrucks and
get into shows free. They were even
trusted at restaurants until Saturday.

But through the years America woke
up. Or went to sleep. I don't know
which.

High regard for policemen, school
teachers and newspapermen drizzled
into something akin to apathy or
perhaps contempt. Respect for those in
the professions slumped, nearly failing.

Today a policeman is just another
cop, teachers are babysitters and
newsmen are people who change stories
around to fit their own biased thinking.
Things have gone so far that even
bankers are talked to as ordinary
people.

It could be that we brought this upon
ourselves. I don't know. But I think we
did have some help from those with just
enough education to find us out. And if
there's anything I hate, it's being found
out.

Regardless of the terms scattered at

Marshall
Sayles

our doorstep, I still think the press
satisfies an important need, with the
papers performing their greatest
service when they report public truths
that some people do not want to see in
print.

So, even though we are no longer
looked upon as the mysterious elite, I
feel we in the profession have some

right to honor ourselves with a National
Newspaper Week.

It is not a crime to pat ourselves on
the back when nobody else will. If we
didn't, we would have newspapermen
with no ego. And that's something I
haven't seen in my 40 years of putting
black marks on white paper.

My introduction to the new thinking
about newspapermen came a few years
ago. I was sitting in my office late one
night when a man came in to ask,
"What are you doing?"

"I am writing an editorial for tomor-
row's paper," I said.

"Oh," he said, "I thought you were
working."

English press puts ours in perspective
When James Burke of the British

Broadcasting Corp. visited Charlevoix
County recently, he was taking a day off
from his quest for funding of a high-
quality television scries that will cost $5
million to produce before it is finished in
1983.

When this newspaper seeks financial
help from local banks to purchase a
piece of cost-saving equipment, for
example, or some new type to make
reading a bit easier for our subscri-
bers, we're usually talking about $5,000
or less.

In a way, the difference in money has
to do with the highly sophisticated color
television equipment, and the fact that
our newspaper serves a very small local
audience in comparison to the national
audience for a series like "Connec-
tions" that Burke wrote and hosted
(now playing on Saturdays at 8 p.m. on
Channel 6).

But in another way. we are talking
about a major difference between the
United States and England when it
comes to "communicating" important
information to the general public.

In England, there are two or three
outstanding national newspapers, two
non-commercial BBC television chan-
nels and one commercial television
channel. There's no question in my
mind about the high quality of these
newspapers and the BBC public affairs
and feature programming.

(The commercial channel, like our
networks, rarely offers anything other
than adventure stories, sit-coms. and
soaps.)

Like Burke, most of England's
communicators for these outlets are
well-educated graduates of the
country's three great universities. They
like to communicate the "big picture,"
the philosophical underpinnings to a
major issue, the historical relevance of
an event, and so on.

And to my mind even the average
"Brit" is far better "educated" than
the average "Yank" because of the
editorial "slant" of these newspapers
and the BBC.

In the U.S., we're not really educated
by TV and newspapers, but we are
informed—far better informed than the
British.

Thanks to British TV, we probably
know more about British history than
we know about American history. And
you can look at "Connections" and get
a whole different view of the history of
science and technology than you got in
school (whee we studied the great
inventors). That's because the people
who run British TV see themselves as
educators rather than entertainers and
journalists.

But when you go to the hinterlands of
England, to Cornwall for example, what
can you learn about the area from the
national or local communications out-
lets? Very little. 1 learned recently.

ANOTHER NORTHERN MICHIGAN
Cornwall is to England what Northern

Michigan is to the Midwest. It is a
rugged peninsula where it never gets
too warm, where the beaches are
endless, where the locals never quite
accept the urban holidaymakers, al-
though they bring vital money into the
area, where second homes for well-
off professionals are commonplace, and
where frantic relaxing is on everyone's
minds at the end of summer.

No, the tourists don't eat fudge in
Cornwall, but they do eat lots of Cornish
clotted cream-^-on berries, in coffee, on
puddings—and like our "Fudgies" they
have to diet when vacation time is
finished. But they do eat pasties, a local
specialty, just like we do in Northern
Michigan.

Many things therefore seemed
terribly familiar in Cornwall and thus it
was a great shock to see the local
newspapers. Whenever 1 travel I buy
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the local newspapers, listen to local
radio and watch local TV trying to get a
"smell" for the new territory I'm in. (In
Cornwall, you do not have local
TV/radio.)

ENGLISH "NEWS"
The local press there, like our local

press, is a reflection of the big-city
press. In London, jfiost newspapers are
filled with gossip, sports, cinema and
political celebrities, sex and violence.
Even in idyllic Cornwall, this formula is
duplicated successfully by the local
press.

The week I visited there, the Cornwall
Courier front page was dominated by
the story of a middle-aged, unemployed
laborer who had left his wife of 20 years
to live with a 16-year-old girl who had
recently left school. Several stories
detailed all facets of the trio's lives—
how the lovers existed, where the
teenager had been in school, the sex life
of the older couple before the split, and
on and on.

The big story on the back page of the
tabloid with "screaming" headlines
similar to page one concerned a brawl
where a young man was badly injured
when someone jammed a stick down his
throat.

In no way did that newspaper give me
a "smell" for the beautiful country-
side, the fishing ports, the history, the
many tourist attractions (King Arthur's
Castle, for example), or the rugged
people of the area.

Now I am the first to admit that the
newspapers of our own land have great
failings, particularly in those areas
where one newspaper, or single owner-
ship, can give residents anything
management pleases to give. In such
places, coverage of local news is usually
limited and poor (wire service copy is
used to fill up the space around the
ads), and concern about local issues is
almost norl-existent except when an
issue might impact on newspaper
profits.

Nevertheless, one just has to compare
what we have in this country to what is
evident in the country closest to us in
culture and in democratic tradition to
realize how fortunate we are.

Small weekly newspapers like this
one-^and there are more than 7,000 of
them at last count—provide solid
information week after week to their
subscribers so that the activities of local
government, of school boards; and local
politicians are well known to those in
the community.

The personal activities of individuals
are usually considered private matters
t'xcepj when personal behavior affects

the way a public official carries out his
public duties.

When "lifestyle" warrants a story, it
is usually because an individual desires
it and almost always it is a "good news"
or "warm" piece rather than sordid or
sensational,

After spending half my life in the
newspaper business, I am more critical
of myself, of my newspaper, and my
colleagues than most average citizens
who merely "consume" the news we
report.

I am not one who is prone to patting
myself, or other journalism profes-
sionals, on the back regularly.

But every once in awhile, like during
this current National Newspaper Week,
I am provided with incentive to develop
a little perspective. My recent visit to
Cornwall helped me to develop that
perspective for this issue.

As I am grateful to James Burke and
his colleagues at the BBC for providing
Americans with high-quality television,
I am likewise grateful to the Cornwall
Courier for reminding me that the local
American press far surpasses in quality
anything offered anywhere else in the
world.

My hope, therefore, on this National
Newspaper Week is that nothing in our
economy, nothing in our tastes as a
people, will cause a further weakening
of the local press.

Television and radio have evolved in
this country to primarily provide enter-
tainment. Only the newspaper has as its
major goal the providing of news.

In many ways, it is one of the lifelines
that hold a community together.

To see the press corrupted, as it has
been in England for reasons I do not
understand, is to see a community come
apart.

For our common good, we must not
let that happen here.

That plain, common,
but essential thing

Fragile as a page of newspaper is, it
is still more durable than all the words
flying to us over our TV sets and radios,

And then, no one has yet said,
"Hearing is believing."

Maybe it isn't entirely fair to compare
the different media, because we need
their differences—the speed of radio,
the drama of TV, the thoroughness of
newspaper.

A newspaper, however—a home town
newspaper—has things to clip and mail
to family and friends. Its columns are
connections so a current of under-
standing can flow from town to house-
hold to committee to commerce, club,
commission, school, industry.

It wraps up the bustle of a com-
munity of activity and lays it all on the
lap of some solitary reader.

LrtbU ,̂ a sptxiai credit goes to the
home town paper. It provides, next to
the vote, the simplest, most direct

instrument of democracy there is.
Anyone of least or greatest influence
can bring an idea of community-
wide concern to public attention
through a letter to the editor. More than
a few times such letters have been the
acorns of oak-tree-sized events.

<Barb
Cruden
Back before the Revolutionary War, a

man named Peter Zenger was arrested
and jailed for printing unfavorable
information about the British colonial
government. His right to do was
defended and his vindication set the
precedent for America's free press.

For the future of free press this
Newspaper Week, we take a leaf from
the oak tree—and also once more salute
old Peter Zenger.

CareiuL.you are what you read!
A newspaper by any other name may

be a press, chronicle, edition, crier,
herald or record. Some newspapers
even proclaim themselves to be suns,
trails or barbs.
. Their format may be broadsheet,
which is exactly that, or a tabloid, which
is a magazine type format. Tabloids are
particularly popular on buses. There is
less intrusion on the passenger sitting
next to you if you are reading a paper
that is half the size of the traditional
broadsheet.

This digest of current local or national

physician is behind schedule when you
arrive for your appointment. If you are
accompanied by a newspaper you can

Trish
Wright

news is well worth the pocket change bury your nose between its pages. This
investment. What else can you buy for protects you from rudely staring into the ^^ w

two bits that will inform you, wrap your ^a c c s o f t n e ° * e r waiting: patients who advertising* and*news

may be labeled by the paper he Is
perusing. The Berkeley Barb either
characterizes you as a Bohemian or a
campus crusader. The Wall Street
Journal may indicate that you lack a
sense of humor. And anyone who totes
the hefty Sunday edition of the New
York Times is either masochistic or
independently wealthy, t o read this
giant text would take more time than
coffee breaks or lunch hours would
allow.

However, the small town weekly
newspaper Is safe. Its area of dominant
influence Is local. It can easily be
stashed in a purse or briefcase. And the

fish, protect your carpet from paint cans
or puppies and be rolled Into the

it's one of the best buys around.
It's also a good thing to take with you

when you go to the doctor. Too often the

may be staring back at you. So a tinent to either you
newspaper is good therapy. It relieves Reading
" % doctor's office

concerned citizen
you
sense

a
ofpaper he or she is seen with. As humor who •'''im'iiJuPK-"m ?"** w

eVfoneous as this may be, the reader sta?e po»<enough not to

I.
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320 ft. high

A nature hike that's elevating

Interpretive trail pamphlets are available year around at the entrance to the
Charles A. Ransom nature trail.

Constitutional - n. [Colloq.], a walk or
other exercise taken for one's health.

Grab a sv • .iter, pack a lunch and
head for the hills whether you need the
exercise or not.

Fall brings out the best colors in the
hills and they deserve your admira-
tion. Your colorful constitutional may be
in your own backyard or along a guided
nature trail.

The Petoskey Audubon Society will
hold a guided nature hike at the Charles
Ransom Nature Preserve, Saturday,
Oct. 18, at 10:15 a.m.

Kathy Bricker will be leading hikers
through the 1.5 miles of nature trail that
was opened to the public in July of 1980.
The Ransom Preserve is located seven
miles northeast of Charlevoix on Maple
Grove Road.

From its highest elevation of 320 feet
above Lake Michigan, visitors to the

preserve can see Lake Charlevoix and
Lake Michigan, Beaver Island, North
Manitou Island, the Leelanau Peninsula
and the Fox Islands.

The trail winds through open
meadows and woods inhabited by
white tailed deer, red fox, cottontail
rabbits, snowshoe hares and grey
squirrels. The 50 wooded acres includes
mature beech and maple hardwoods,
ash, trembling aspen, hop-hornbeam
and red oak.

A Japanese style caretaker's home
marks the beginning of the trail that can
be enjoyed by hikers at any time.
Guideposts and interpretive pamphlets
are available year around at the
entrance to the trail.

Susan Dye, executive director of the
Little Traverse Conservancy, says,
"The Ransom Nature Preserve was
donated to Little Traverse Conservancy
by Woodbury and Christiana Ransom of

Bettys
Restaurant

Stop in
and try some^

of Bettys
homemade

specials
Serving Breakfast,

Lunch & Dinner
OPEN DAILY
7 a.m. • 9 p.m.

IBOYNE CINEMA!
Theatre Information: 347-9696
BOYNE CITY 582-2411

October 17
through

October 19

Showtime
Friday & Saturday

7:15and9:15
Sunday 1 show - 8 p.m.

All seats $1.50

"Herbie
Goes

Bananas"

A
P
P
Y
H
O
U

P.

4 p.m.
to 7 p.m
Tuesday through Saturday t A

Wed: Bump Night
Happy hour 4 p.m. till 2

Open mike....
Musicians welcome

THUR. FRI. SAT.
Features...

Sean Ryan
9:30p.m.

Located on Old State Road
just off Highway M-75

Formerly the Homestead Inn

a.m.

OCv
HWY131

Boyne Falls
549-2680

Check the Color Tour pages for
more eateries. . • . etcetera

IRONTON FERRYr Ike
Lcmdiw

Charlevoix

547-9135

(Take out)

Fre§h Perch & Walleye

Served daily

Mexican Food

Featuring: Al Anderson
Fri. night - 9 p.m. to 1 a.m.

Little Lena's
Pizza

Old Family Recipe
UTTU UNA

Besides our famous pizza
we have delicious subs.

Sunday - Thursday 4 p.m. -Midnight

Friday & Saturday 4 p.m. -3 a.m.

118 S. Lake St.. Boyne City 582-2182

d Y

Ps & Q s

"EVERY WED. NIGHT"
Frontier days with Mac & Mariane at
the B.R.I. offering you, . . Pints and
Quarts of draft beer, . . Platters of
chunked top round w/bread, duJour
cheese and crackers;
BOYNE H1VEH XNN

Downtown Boyne City 582-2312

Sunday Breakfast
2 eggs, 3 strips bacon or sausage,

2 pancakes, hash browns and toast.

7 a.m. - 12 noon $2.50

Fish Fry all you can eat
every Fri. night 5 • 8 p.m. * > 7c

take out

Tuesday is Coney Island day

RAINBOW BAR
114 Mill St. Gqst Jordan

536-9228 J

Charlevoix in 1976,"
The conservancy, incorporated in

1972, owns eight nature preserves in
Emmet and Charlevoix Counties.
Current membership counts 450 with
100 lifetime members.

Says Dye, "Our purpose is to help
preserve natural lands for the general
public benefit, We identify parcels or
important natural areas that warrant
protection."

There are four particular types of land
that the conservancy attempts to
acquire and preserve: natural lands
with rare scenic qualities, environmen-
tally sensitive areas (lakeside marshes
and swamps), land that harbors endan-
gered wildlife species and areas that
provide open, undeveloped spaces.

"We look very carefully at parcels
before they are donated or purchased,"
says Dye, "although we haven't
purchased any yet."

Little Traverse Conservancy finances
its regular operations by dues and

donations. A donation of $1. secures
annual membership. A donation of
$100. or more qualifies the donor for
lifetime membership.

Volunteers supervise conservancy
lands. Dye explains the duties required
of her when she was caretaker last year
at the Ransom Preserve, "Hooked after
the trails and house that was provided
for me and maintained and enforced the
rules of the trail."

Dye, now a part-time worker for the
conservancy, plans to study Environ-
mental Law. "Gary and Jan Taporek are
the current caretakers at the Ransom
Preserve."

The Little Traverse Conservancy
urges anyone who loves Northern
Michigan and wishes to preserve its
natural areas to join the conservancy.
More information is available from
North Central Michigan College in
Petoskey or by calling its office at
347-0991.

The caretaker's house boasts unique oriental architecture and an energy efficient
heating system.

More scenic paths...

The Jordan River Pathway 1B especial-
ly popular at this time of year. It starts
at Deadman's H1U, one of the most
spectacular scenic lookouts in
Michigan.

Scenic paths that abound with fall
color are waiting to be traveled by
hikers with or without experience.
Topographic maps for the following
trails are available at the Department of
Natural Resources, at the corner of
State and East Streets in Boyne City.

SPRINGBROOK PATHWAY
Through the state forest on Chandler
Road. From Boyne Falls, turn east on
Thumb Lake Road (C-48), then north on
Slashing Road, and left on Chandler
Road, Four mile trail through hardwood
and pine, takes you past many streams.
Extra mile loop is available with steep
hills, great views.

WARNER CREEK PATHWAY - In
the Jordan River State Forest, IIV2
miles south of East Jordan on M-32.
Loop trail past pond, through hardwood
hills in 3.8 miles.

BELLS BAY - Two mile trail through
state forest hills and past old stone
quarry. Located southwest of Charle-
voix. Take U.S. 31 south to Bells Bay
Road, turn west, follow signs.

JORDAN RIVER PATHWAY In
Jordan River State Forest three and 18
mile trails, with a walk-in campground
after nine miles. Well-marked trail
features marked stopping points in
historical or panoramic areas. Take U.S.
131 south of Boyne Falls to Dead Man's
Hill Road. Turn right, follow signs.

Sweetest Day is Saturday, October 18.

LJOUP sweetest our

I I V) Douquet.specia ouque

The perfect №;<zz£$№&m
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Boyne Avenue
Greenhouse

"It's Worth The Drive Up The I11U. '
(Next to the high school)

Boyne City 582-6621
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Out & About listings are published as
a service to readers at no charge to the
establishments listed. If you know of
something you'd like listed, call The
Charlevoix County Press at 582-6761 by
10 a.m. Thursday,

COMMUNITY CONCERT at the Pet-
oskey Middle School Auditorium will be
held on Oct. 20 at 8 p.m. The program
will be duo-harpists Pinkerton and
Escosa. For this and other concert
information, contact the Crooked Tree
Arts Council office at 347-4337.

GASLIGHT CINEMA, in Petoskey
will be showing "Xanadu," rated PG,
starting this Friday. Showtimes are 7:15
and 9:15 p.m. and the feature will show
through next Thursday. 347-3.480.

BOYNE CINEMA will be showing
"Herbie Goes Bananas," rated G,
Friday through Sunday evenings. Show-
times for Friday and Saturday are 7; 15
and 9:15 p.m. Sunday, there is one
show at 8 p.m. and all seats are $1.50.
582-2411.

NORTHLAND DRIVE-IN, is located
on U.S. 31 between Petoskey and
Charlevoix. Showing this Friday
through Sunday will be "Carny," rated
R, and "Long Riders," also rated R.
Call for showtimes. 347-6972.

NEW MOGUL INN on M-75 South,
outside of Boy.ne City, is featuring the
group Threshold this Thursday through
Saturday night, Entertainment starts at
9:30 p.m. and goes until 1:30 a.m.
582-9955.

LITTLE CAESAR'S Pizza Parlor on
Bay View Road in Petoskey has disco
v/ith a DJ. Wednesday. Friday and
Saturday from 9:30 p.m. to 1:30 a.m.
Wednesday is Pitcher Night and Friday
is Ladies' Night. 347-87S7..

DUFF'S LOUNGE, one mile north of
Young State Park on the Boyne City-.
Charlevoix Road, features country and

western disco with Pep'e DePew of
WCLX every Thursday through Sunday
night. Disco is from 9:30 p.m. to 2 a.m.
582-9950.

COUNTRY HOUSE, north of East
Jordan on Boyne City Road, features
the group Adventures. Friday ' and
Saturday evenings from 10 p.m. to 2
a.m. 536-7062.

HUGGS, located in the Holiday Inn
on U.S. 131 at the south edge of
Petoskey. is featuring the group, Pearl,
throughout October- The group plays
every night except Sunday, from 9p.m.
to 1:30 a.m. 347-6041.

Slicks
BEL-AIR THEATRE in Bellaire, has

one show nightly at 8 p.m. For times
and features, call 533-8725.

CINEMA III, in Charlevoix, will be
showing "Herbie Goes Bananas," rated
G, Friday through Sunday at 7:30 p.m.
A 1:30 matinee will be presented on
Saturday. 547-4353.

RYAN'S PUBLIC HOUSE, Old State
Road, off M-75 North, has folksinger
Sean Ryan, performing Thursday
through Saturday, starting at 9:30 p.m.
582-6542.

WEATHERVANE INN of Charlevoix
features Tom Kauffman on the piano
from 9 p.m. to 1 a.m. each Friday and
Saturday evening. 547-9958.

44 Annual
Charity
Casino Nite"
Nov. X 8 p.m. t i l l I a.m.
Boyne AAt. Convention Center

$15 per couple $7.50 singles

Sponsored by: Eta Nu Chapter Beta Sigma Phi

Gambling - dancing - midnight breakfast buffet

For tickets call 582-2654

SKATING SCHEDULE
MON. 8 to II pm • Adm. $1.75 Rentals 75<J
TUES. 8 to 11 pm • Adm. $1.75 Rentals 75*
WED. 8 to II pm • Adm. $1.75 Rentals 75^

THURS...8 to 11 p.m. SMORGASBORD NIGHT
$1.50 to all—including skates

FRF. & SAT. 7 to 10 pm & 10 pm to 1 am
Adm. $2.25 Rentals 75f

DISCO DANCE Either Session $2.00

SAT. & SUN. MATINEES 1 pm to 3:30 pm

SUN. EVENING 8 to 11 pm • Adm. $1.75
Rentals 75f

AEROBIC DANCE CLASSES
for information call 347-4976, 347-1673 or
347-7845

Call For Additional
Information And Rates For

Private Parties, School
Groups, Church Groups.

Available Mornings
Afternoons and Evenings.

FOR
HEALTH'S

SAKE-
ROLLER
SKATE!

You'll meet
the nicest

people skating...

SKATES ]
Are Now I

AVAILABLE!
In All Sizes!

...and Prices \
...and Styles V

See Us For AA
Wheel & Deal")

Adult Supervision
^Open Days & Evenings

For Private Parties

Call 347-1032
Skating Time &

Reservations
100 River Rd. Petoskey

WHERE THE GOOD TIMES JUST KEEP ROLLING ALONG

Gocha^s
has the best Color Tour around

Stop by soon for a new
fall wardrobe

Gocha^s
Women's Apparel

Boyne City, Mi.

Luncheon
The perfect compliment to the

Fall Color Tour. Lunch at the
Perry Davis from 11:30 - 2. Fall
room rates now in effect.

Perry-Davis Hotel
Louts at Bay Street - Petoskey

347-2516

Downtown Boyne City

Wednesday • P&O night,
ask about it.
Fish & Chips - Every
Friday, noon-9 p.m.
Breakfast - 7 a.m.-11:30
a/m.
Sunday Spaghetti Special -
4 p.m.-9 p.m.
Kitchen Open 7 days aweek tul 1 : 3 ° a'm-

Enjoy the fall colors from our

Comfortable & modern rental chalets

Lodging by day or week.

Golf*Pro Shop'Carts & Club Rentals
Cocktail Lounge

Call (616) 535-2413

pringbrook Hills
Golf Resort

The Four Seasons Recreation Resort/

of Boyne

Serving the Finest Buffet In

BUFFET - Mon. through Sat.

$3.85 Adults
$2.19 Children

(10 & under)

City

Northern Michigan

Sunday BUFFET

$4.25 Adults
$2.19 Children
(10 & under)

Mon. Sat. 7 a.m.-8 p.m. Sunday 7 a.m.-6 p.m.
BUFFET HOURS:

Mon.-Sat. 4:30 p.m.-8 p.m. Sunday 12 noon-6 p.m.
Serving a full breakfast, lunch & dinner menu.

BOND COPIES

9*
WITH COUPON

" S'/jxll •White
Self Service,

Ask About Our
Volume Prlce«t

KWHOOe DUPLICATING
CENTERS OF CHARLEVOIX

111 Antrim St. Charj«voix
' Across from Otoson'* '

Shopping Ctrtter
. .; WiiJi ; ;.

Homemade food specials
Crepes - Soup
& Sandwiches

open Mon.-Sat. 7 a.m. to9 plnv
' 7a.im*'8p.m,

EMtJordu 336-2061

RQcquetbQll

MOriv-Fri, 7 am. to 4 p,k. $6
4 p.m. to 9 p.m. $8

Saturday , 7 a.,,:. t o 9;p.m. $&;
Sunday 8 a.m. to 8 p.W. $8

NO MEMBERSHIP REQUIRED
8 3 6 - 2 0 6 1 . ; •' •', •; .; v. ' , :V:

II COl

H

LAKE

H I G H W A Y

5»t>£ ROAT>

GRAIN TRAIN

Grain Train
A natural foods store
that will improve the

quality of your life

Merccuio
Restaurant

- A unique & memo-
rable dining experience.
Serving Mexican dishes,
quiche and gardenful
salads and much more.

All at 421 Howard Si , Petoskey 347-2381

And to add more color

cBoyn<

Open 7 (
Noon-

Stoi

Open7daj

Take a Fall trip on the beautiful Jordan River

-66 between Mancelona and Eaat Jordan - Alba 584*3481

Springbrook HUIs Rl<

Open Sat.
FallCok
tei«rvat

Sl.OOdiKount for Fall guided pleaaure toon i
Charlevoix County rettdentf.
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Guide
II color tours

Grain Train
A natural foods store
that will improve the

quality of your life

Mercado
Restaurant

A unique & memo-
rable dining experience.
Serving Mexican dishes,
quiche and gardenful
salads and much mote.

ird St., Petoskey 347-2381 J

And to add more color to your tour

Stop at
<Boy ne Country

Tarty Shop
DOWNTOWN

Open 7 days-9 a.m.-11 p.m.
Noon-10 p.m. Sundays

&
9oyne Country

•Party Store & Station
••" '• •• M - 7 5 H w y , - • •• :'•;•

Open 7 days-8 a.m.-i 1 p.m.
9 a.m.-lOp.m- Sundays

Open
8 a.m.-3:30 p.m.
serving Breakfast

and Lunch

BoyneCity 582-2532

the beautiful Jordan River

and BMtiortftQ - Alba 584-3481

:•••••#!•

Sprlngbrook Hills Riding Stable

Open Sat. & Sun. 10 a.m.-6 p.m. for
Fall Colors, during the week by
reservations only. - ; :V

 ; .••

535-2300
Children*' leason* available tor Fall
Call for scheduling.

Boarding: barn stalled $35 a month.

' lessons for all

Dining 7 nights a week of 2 locations
over/obkin0''-little Traverse Bay

Call us for our Fall specials

Stafford*

131 North In Bay Veiw
••• Petoskey .

IWONE 3474771

IN HARBOR SPRINGS
102 Bay St. - At the waterfront

PHONE 526.6201

The Jordan Inn
serving

Old world dining specialities
Fine wines and liquors

Dinners only 6-9 p.m. closed Mondays
By reservatipn only. Call 536-2631

Tad & Christina Dobrowohki
East Jordan

Dress Up Fall Fashions!
Jewelry from the Accents collection completes every fall
fashion with simplicity and taste. Choose the style just right
for you!

BARB'S *

H A R B O R (616)547 4941 CAPTAINS CORNER
Your card and gift headquarters for 10 AM to 6 PM daily S H O P P I N G C E N T E R

all seasons and all reasons Friday until 9 PM ' —-~-CHAfU-eVOtK.

Ike IHONTON FERRY

INC.

M-66 At The Ironton Ferry

Overlooking Beautiful Lake Charlevoix
Our day starts at 8 a.m. serving breakfast

Fresh perch & walleye
Homemade Mexican food served daily

Open daily 8 a.m.-2 a.m. Sun. till midnight Phone 547-9135

Color Tour
Scenic Walloon Lake

Boat rentals available by
the hour, day or week.

arrington
MARINE

ODE Of HOKlHtM MICHIGMS WOtT lUUTKUl MMI i tS

between Petoskey & Charlevoix 347-8206 - Camp Daggett Rd.
West Arm, Walloon Lake

OM t/J 31, IMi/c ScufH or Qt/ifiUvoiK C/rt
opt* dti'/y 'o 4» 6uHOAy /6

Tvustin^s

-OPEN ALL
YEAR-

BLENDS OF THE MONTH

"Milt's Blend"
& "Pure Gold"

49* oz.
Reg. 69* oz. _

•FUw Pipes & Tobacco
•Humidor Fresh High Grade Cigars

•Imported Cigarettes
•All Smokers Requisites

203 Howard St. • Pttcftkty • 347-1830

DISCO!

Wed., Fri.,
& Sat,

Wednesday
PiKher Night

Friday
Ladles'Night

Buy 1 to 10
any$iieplm

Small-M«dium-LaTQ«
^ t^Regular l»r ice , . .

And get the Same
Numtw of Identical

Petoskey - In the Crago Shopping Center
347-S757 i:- TW«oo«

\ !

'%
: \

;': 'it

A * • » > * • » • • • «
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Community events
Is your group planning an event that

our readers would like to know about? If
so, The Press will be glad to print the
details in our Community Events
column. Call us at 582-6761 or mail or
deliver your notice to The Press office,
P.O.Box A, Boyne City 49712. Our
deadline is 5 p.m. Friday.

Garden Club
The Boyne Valley Garden Club will

meet Wednesday, Oct. 22, in the
basement of the Boyne City Public
Library at 1 p.m. Anyone interested in
joining the club is welcome to attend.

Book sale

f
The Boyne City Public Library will

host a sale of used books on Sat-
urday, Oct. 18 from 10 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Proceeds from the sale will go to benefit
the library. Donations of used books will
be accepted at the library prior to that
time.

Obedience Classes
The Charlevoix County Humane

Society is sponsoring a 10-week basic
dog obedience class on Monday
evenings at 7:30 p.m. in the East Jordan
Elementary Gym. The classes will begin
on Monday, Oct. 20. The first class will
be for the dog owner only and will not
include the dog. All dog breeds are
welcome. Proof of rabies, distemper
and Parvo vaccines are required. For
more information, call Donna Wojan at
547-6866.

Geneology society
The newly organized Geneology

Society of Antrim, Charlevoix and
Emmet Counties is sponsoring a be-
ginners' class in geneology. The group
is based in Boyne City and will hold the
class at the Boyne City High School on
Wednesday nights from 7 to 9 p.m.
Classes will be held on Oct. 15, 22 and
29. The class will be taught by Aletha

Arnold of Charlevoix and the lessons
are free. There will be a small charge
for supplies. Those interested should
bring pencil and paper to the classes or
call Arnold at 547-2667 for additional
information.

Garden club
The Boyne Valley Garden Club will

meet on Wednesday, Oct. 22, in the
basement of the Boyne City Public
Library at 1 p.m. AH interested persons
may attend.

BC Library
"Domesticating a Wilderness*' will

be the seventh in the "America" series
to be presented at the Boyne City Public
Library on Oct. 20 at 7:30 p.m.

Business women
The East Jordan Business and

Professional Women's Club will hold its
October meeting at the middle school in
East Jordan on Thursday, Oct. 16. The

business portion of the meeting will be
held from 7 to 8 p.m. and the speaker
and demonstration will be held from 8 to
9 p.m. This month, Joanne Baker will
give a talk and demonstration on
slimnastics. Those attending should
dress to participate in this activity.

EJ Senior Forum
Lucia Kadzielski, clinical social

worker from East Jordan Area Counsel-
ing Center will show a film on Oct. 22,
"All your parts don't wear out at the
same time."

Health center film
"So now you're in your occupation

and have your own family and lots of
responsibilties....now what?" is the
topic of the film to be shown on
Thursday, Oct. 16, from 7 to 9 p.m. in
the lower level of the East Jordan
Family Health Center, 601 Bridge St.

Historical society
The Boyne City Historical Society will

hold a meeting in the Boyne City Public

Library at 7 p.m. on Tuesday, Oct. 21.
The public is invited. For additional
information, contact Dorothy Leslie at
582-9826.

Democratic Party
The Charlevoix County Democratic

Party will meet on Thursday, Oct. 16 at
7:30 p.m. in the Charlevoix City, Hall
Community Room. Any Interested
persons are invited to attend. For
additional information contact Bob
Morgridge at 582-9981.

30-Month
Certificates

30-Month $1000 Deposit or More

11.55%
Annual Rate*

12.424%
Effective Annual Yield**
•••Interest Compounded

Continuously.

All savings places
aren't created equal.

Some of today's new saving
plans make good sense for some
people. However, we feel ours are
unique in combining high interest
and the security most savers de-
sire.

So the choice is yours. You can
take the risk of earning other kinds
of high interest. Or you can relax
with the confidence that you're
collecting ours.

Money Market
Certificates

182-Day $10,000 Deposit or More

11.531 %
Annual Kate*

12.034 %
Effective Annual Yield**
Effective Thursday, Oct. 16, 1980
thru Wednesday, Oct. 22, 1980

•Federal regulations require a substantial interest penalty for early withdrawal from all certificate
savings accounts.

**The effective annual yield is subject to change at renewal and assumes that the interest rate
remains unchanged and that both the principal and the interest your certificate earns are
reinvested. The compounding of interest during the term of our 182-Day Money Market accounts is
prohibited.

Northwestern
Savings

FSLIC

& Loan Association
300 Howard St. Petoskey. Ml {616)347-4761

Because we sell a lot of acreage parcels we have a good selection to pick
from. However, we have a number of people seriously seeking acreage in
various size parcels in various locations; so if you have a parcel to sell
please call us. You will receive a prompt, courteous, confidential reply.
Write or call today!

582-6771

bieganowski & assoc.

221 water street

REALTOR

boyne city, mi 49712

Public Notices

BUDGET HEARING
Boyne Falls Public Schools

The Boyne Falls Public Schools will hold their Annual Budget Hearing
on October 20. 1980, at 6:00 p.m. in the School Cafeteria.

Copies of the proposed budget are available for public inspection at the
Office of the Superintendent.

MARY E. HAUSLER
Secretary

PROCEEDINGS OF THE
EAST JORDAN CITY COUNCIL

East Jordan City Council met in regular session Tuesday. October 7,
1980 at 7:30 p.m. Mayor Meredith presiding and all members present.

Minutes were approved, authorization was given to pay $153,632.16 in
bills as presented and the necessary transfers made.

The monthly ambulance and police reports were received and open
house for October 13th was announced for the fire department.

The police chief was authorized to attend a civil liability seminar; the
1976 Ford will be offered for sale (sealed bids) and three requests to use
the civic center were referred to committee with power to act.

Meeting adjourned about 8:30 p.m.
A copy of the official minutes of the above meeting are posted at City

Hall for perusal during normal working hours.
FERN L.MORRIS, CMC

City Clerk

NOTICE
Boyne City

SANITARY LANDFILL
Effective November 1, 1980 the Boyne City Sanitary Landfill will be

closed on Wednesdays during the winter months of November through
March, inclusive. The days and hours the Sanitary Landfill will be open
are Monday, Friday and Saturday form 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m.

BASIL MOORE
Landfill Operator

582-6597

Notice of
Public Hearing

South Arm
Township

A public hearing will be held at
the South Arm Township Hall at
7:30 p.m. on Oct. 21. 1980, for the
purpose of allowing public input on
proposed amendments to the town-
ship zoning ordinance. Addenda
may be seen at Helen Cherry
residence, 7143 Rogers Road, East
Jordan.

Patricia Berlo
Planning Commission.

CITY OF
EAST JORDAN

Bids Wanted
1976 Ford

The City of East Jordan is asking
sealed bids on one, 1976 Ford
(former police car). Sealed bids
marked "Ford Car" will be received
at the city clerk's office until 5:00
p.m., Tuesday, October 21, 1980.

The city reserves the right to
accept or reject any or all bids in the
best interest of the city.

FERN L. MORRIS, CMC
City Clerk

Public Hearing
City of East Jordan

An application for Commercial Facilities Exemption Certificate has
been filed at my office by Jerry and Patricia Sweet for Restoration of
Facility at 207 Main Street. Legal description as follows:

V1LL OF SOUTH LAKE COM AT A PT 22 FT 10 IN S NE COR
OF LOT 2 BLK 3 S 22 FT 10 W TO N LI OF LOT 2 BLK 3 TO
SPRING ST TH N 22 FT 10 IN TH E'LY TO POB PARK LOT 2
BLK 3.

The request is filed in accordance with PA 225 PA 1978 for a twelve (12)
year exemption on approximately $18,500 of Restoration of Facilty.

A Public Hearing to receive comments on this will be held Tuesday,
October 21, 1980 at 7 p.m. at City hall.

City of East Jordan
Fern L. Morris, CMC
City Clerk-Treasurer

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
CITY OF BOYNE CITY

Notice is hereby given that the City of Boyne City will hold a Public
Hearing on the proposed pre-application to the Department of Housing
and Urban Development for Community Development Block Grant
Funding. Grants providing 100 percent funding for various community
development projects are available from HUD through the Block Grant
Program.

The purpose of the Public Hearing is twofold: (1) to make available to
the public information concerning the Block Grant Program such as
funding to be applied for, range of activities that may be undertaken,
chances of grant approval, processes to be followed involving citizen
participation, and other important information; (2) to solicit input from the
public concerning community priorities and proposals for projects which
are eligible under the Block Grant Program.

A Citizen Participation Plan has been adopted by the City of Boyne City
and is available to the public at City Hall, 319 North Lake Street. This plan
shall be followed throughout the pre-application, application, and post
approval stages of the Community Development Block Grant Program.

The Public Hearing will be held on Monday, October 20, 1980, at 12:00
noon at 319 North Lake Street. Written comments will be received and
entered into the Public Hearing record through Monday, October 20, 1980
at 12:00 noon.

Please contact Timothy J. Clifton, City Manager, for additional
information CITY OF BOYNE CITY

Thomas Garlock, City Clerk

October 10, 1980

NOTICE
Public Hearing

Boyne City Zoning Board of Appeals
An application for a variance in the provisions of the Boyne City Zoning

Ordinance has been filed with the Zoning Board of Appeals by Mr. Fred
Ilier, 614 South Lake Street. The property is situated in the R-2 Residential
District.

The request, if approved, would authorize a variance to Article HI,
Section B.7, to delete seventeen (17) feet rear-yard setback to permit an 8
foot rear-yard setback in lieu of the required fifteen (15) foot rear-yard
setback depth.

A public hearing will be held on Monday, October 27, 1980, at 7:00 p.m.
in the City Commission Chambers of City Hall, 319 North Lake Street, at
which time interested citizens may present their views on the matter in
person, by writing, of by representative.

If you know of interested property owners who do not receive
notification from the city, it will be appreciated if you will inform them of
the time and place of the hearing.

Further information may be obtained from City Hall or call 582-6597.
Marvin Lodlng, .Chairman

BOYNE CITY ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Notice of Proposed Bank Consolidation
Notice is hereby given that the Northwestern State Bank. East Jordan,

Michigan, has made application to the Federal Deposit Insurance
Corporation, Washington, D.C. 20429, for its written consent to
consolidation with the NW State Bank, East Jordan, Michigan. The
purpose of the consolidation is to facilitate the establishment of
Northwestern State Bank as a subsidiary of Northwestern Bank
Corporation.

This notice is published pursuant to Section 18(c) of the Federal Deposit
Insurance Act.

Any person wishing to comment on this application may file his
comments in writing with the Regional Director of the Federal Deposit "
Insurance Corporation at its Regional Office, One South Pinckney Street,
Suite 813, Madison, Wisconsin 53703. If any person desires to protest the
granting of this application he has a right to do so if he files a written
notice of his intent with the Regional Director by November 21, 1980. The
nonconfidential portions of the application are on file in the Regional
Office as part of the public files maintained by the Corporation. This file is
available for public inspection during the regular business hours.
October 9,1980 Northwettern State Bank

East Jordan, Michigan

. ••',•" •• _ •' • ' '• ' . '• ' . •'•'. ' ' ..•':. ' . ' N W S t a t e B a n k

East Jordan, Michigan

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
TO THE RESIDENTS OF EVANGEUNE TOWNSHIP

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY, MICHIGAN

PLEASE BE NOTIFIED that there will be a public hearing of the
Township Planning Board of Evangeline Township, Charlevoix County,
Michigan, at the Township Hall, located on Wildwood Harbor Road,
Boyne City, Michigan, at 7:30 p.m.. on Tuesday, October 21, 1980.

The following change of zoning will be considered:

Case Number 101, Jerome V. Marts, Applicant, has requested rezoning
of property located at 3218 Jefferson Street, Evangeline Township,
Charlevoix County, Michigan, described as:

"The Southerly 100 feet and the Easterly 330 feet of the South Half (S ' / J )

of the South Half <SVi) of the Northwest Quarter (NWVi) of the Southeast
Quarter (SE'/i) of Section 26, Township 33 North, Range 6 West,
Evangeline Township, Charlevoix County, Michigan,"

from present zoning classification of Agricultural-1 to lndustrial-1, for the
purpose of junkyard for dismantling of cars, which will be subsequently
crushed and removed, or such other use as may be permitted under
lndustrial-1. These metal parts will be sold on the premises, along with
used cars. Tentative text and zoning map may be examined at the
Township Clerk's Home (H. Anne Thurston, Box 2640, Wildwood Harbor
Road, Boyne City, Michigan) between the hours of 5:00 p.m. and 7:00
p.m. during the weekdays Monday through Friday.

In addition, Applicant, Jerome V. Marts, has requested the Planning
Board to make a determination that the proposed use, as above described,
is similar to otner areas described in Section S.05(a) of the Ordinance (the
Industrial Zoning District) and therefore permits the proposed use as
described above. ,

H.ANNE THURSTON
Evangeline Township Clerk

NORTHWESTERN
STATE BANK

102 Mill Street
East Jordan, Michigan 49727

NOTICE OF SPECIAL MEETING OF
SHAREHOLDERS TO BE HELD

OCTOBER 28,1980

Notice is hereby given that a special meeting of the shareholders of
Northwestern State Bank, a Michigan banking corporation (the "Bank"),
will be held at the Presbyterian Church, 207 Williams Street, East Jordan,'
Michigan, on October 28, 1980, at 2 p.m., local time, for the following
purposes:

1. To consider and vote upon ratification, confirmation,
approval ard adoption of a Consolidation Agreement,
providing for the consolidation of NW State Bank, a Michigan '
banking corporation and a subsidiary of Northwestern Bank ;

Corporation, into the Bank, and the conversion of each '
outstanding share of common stock of the Bank into one share
of the common stock of Northwestern Bank Corporation, with I
such consolidation to be effected under the charter of the '
Bank and with the name of the bank resulting from the !
consolidation to be "Northwestern State Bank". .':>

2. To transact such other business as may properly come
before the meeting or any adjournment thereof.

The Board of Directors has fixed the close of business on September 30,
1980, as the record date for the del Ion of shareholders entitled to
notice of and to vote at the meeting oi any adjournment thereof. Only
shareholders of record at the close of business on that date will be entitled
t O V O t C .' • • " ' • ' . • . ;•••• •'• ; . " • •' : •. ; ' "• ' ' '

By Ortfcr of the Board of Dfrecton
Ed win Drenth

Eaat Jordan, Michigan -
October 2,1980
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Realtors9 page
Realtor*.

More real estate listings
on Classified page.. .

REALTOR'

Move in!!
4 bedrooms, neat and clean - Terms

JOHN BUICK
R E A L E S T A T E

REALTOR'

Located in the old
railroad office building

582-2261 - 582-6481
Boyne City

Mte Know A Special
Place

MOBILE HOME SITE
Great spot for skiing or hunting, Approximately 4Vi miles from Boyne Ski
area, this parcel is surrounded by State land. Complete.with well, electric
and storage barn. $2,000 down payment, 15 year balloon.

CHALET
Finish to suit yourself!!! 28x36 Chalet, possible 4 bedrooms. Located near
Dead Man's Hill. 4.8 Acres.

Call Linda Felton 582-6554 daytime or 582-7463 evenings.

WE ARE OPEN SEVEN DAYS A WEEK TO SERVE YOU

skkskore
i rue.

fltM.10* MLS

OF BOYNE

231 Water St.
Boyne City
582-6554

(Co/ne See Us FIRST)

Older East Jordan home in a good neighborhood being offered on rent
with option to buy terms. Call today for all the details. Charlevoix
Properties. Inc. 547-4411.

mis

APPROXIMATELY 18 ACRES with frontage on U.S. 131, 75% wooded,
trout stream, close to Boyne Mountain. Call now for more information.
$19,000. BC-2057
COMFORTABLE 2-BEDR00M COTTAGE located on Crooked Lake with
60 feet of lake frontage, furnishings included with possible terms.
$32,500, BC-3006
LAKE ACCESS - This 1-year-old, 3 bedroom home has 250 feet of
common access to Lake Charlevoix. Enjoy the use of the lake without
paying frontage prices. This home has 1,280 sq. ft. of plush living space, 5
walk-in closets, 28' X8' deck, white pine interior and carpeted throughout.
Excellent condition and complete with home warranty, $68,000. BC-3007
REDUCED FOR QUICK SALE - 10 acres with 330 feet of lake frontage on
Harwood Lake, partially wooded, sandy beach, beautiful building site,
Terms available. $18,000. BC-3008
FTVE-YEAR-OLD, RANCH STYLE HOME offers comfortable living at a
comfortable price. This home has 3 bedrooms, l'/j baths, full basement,
2l/i car attached garage, located on 5 acres with Porter Creek crossing
back of property. $59,000. BC-3009
LAKE FRONTAGE - Now's your chance for 3 lots located on Lake
Charlevoix, offers 50 feet of lake frontage, prime building location. Don't
wait!! Call today for your appointment. Terms available. $35,000.
BC-3011

KEITH DRESSEL REALTY
1 20 E. Water Street Boyne City

616-582-6767

(Come See Us FIRST)

ACREAGE
NEAR LAKE CHARLEVOIX - over 600 acres, Monroe Creek frontage,
hardwoods, some tillable acreage. Buy part or all. Good terms.

NEAR BOYNE MOUNTAIN - 160 acres with small stream, hardwoods,
good hunting.

CHANDLER TOWNSHIP -159 acres adjoining State Land, !/J mile county
road frontage, small stream. $55,900.

NEAR WALLOON LAKE - 40 acres with high countryside view, hardwood
and tillable acreage. $19,000.

WM'CM
•«•« IMM • • «

MLSQ

210 E. Water St. Boyne City
582-6781

We Know A Special
Place For

Waterfront Home
Year-around two bedroom home on 66' of beautiful sand-bottomed lake
frontage. Nice enclosed porch and brick fireplace combines to make this
under $30,000 home a super offering. See it for yourself today! Call SKI
& SHORE CHARLEVOIX, Inc. - 616/547-9905.

skisslure MIS
HEALTOR'

Of Charlevoix
Corner of Park & Bridge Charlevoix 547-9905

Come See Us FIRST)
.t

Older East Jordan home in good condition, 4 bedrooms, basement, large
workshop, and a separate one-bedroom rental cottage. Priced at
$28,000. Call Charlevoix Properties. Inc. 547-4411.

J

MLS
PROPERTIES. INC.

405 Bridge St., Charlevoix
(616)547-4411

BOYNE CITY - 3 bedroom home,
ideal corner lot, full basement, 2 car
attached garage. $34,900.

Boyne Country Realty, Inc.
216VJ N. Lake, next to Robert's Restaurant

Boyne City - 582-2242

Keith Dressel -• Betty Dressel -- Marilyn Roberts
Oliver Jodway -- Jeanne Bowman

BOYNE CITY - 3 bedroom, completely remodeled older home. Nice
neighborhood, wooded lot close to downtown and schools. $32,000, Land
contract terms.

Colwell & Co.
REAL ESTATE

222 South Lake Street
Boyne City, Michigan 49712

Telephone (616) 582-6724 or 582-9653

COLWELL
VOUA KEY TO BETTtft LIVING

lllMfll St., East Jordan Phone 536-2241 or 536-7521
BiirH. Drenth WaltThorsen

536-2885 536-2434
MLS

A RARE
Laktfront Horn*

Yes, this fine three bedroom, two bath home has 212 feet of lake frontage.
That's not all!I Large kitchen and dining room, nice living room with
fireplace. Lower level family room, rec room, bedroom, workshop and
walk-out, stove, refrigerator, freezer, washer and dryer and drapes. All
carpeted included. Two car garage, also. This home is in excellent
condition. Call today for an appointment to see this lovely hornet

ACRES-N-ACRES
"Woodlot"! 40 acre woodlot with two-track trail running the entire length
of the parcel, $400 per acre with land contract terms. As firewood gets
harder to come by the value of this parcel increases, have aerial photo, ask
about easy terms, call 582-6771.

Land contract terms with only $1800 down on this recently surveyed
twelve acres. 70 % hardwoods, some pasture and a natural gas line
passing through and its only two miles outside the Boyne City limits. You
really should see it. Call 582-6771.

JSO-acres all or part, four miles from Boyne City offered at $430 per acre. A
well wooded rolling parcel with two secluded meadows. A place to call
your own. A good value and worth checking into. Call 582*6771.

Eight wooded acres in Wilson Township offered on land contract with only
$1500 down. Beautiful acreage with rolling terrain. Very possible you
could buy all or part. To check on it call 582-6771. .

50% hardwoods and 50% cleared with road frontage right on M-66 near
East Jordan. There's even a couple apple trees. Only $3,000 down
required on this 40 acre parcel. Have excellent quality aerial photo, do
stop in to check it out! 582-6771.

160 acres "All or Part", located in southern Charlevoix County. A fine
spot to raise a horse or a few beef. Has old barn, water on property, some
pasture, some timber. A well rounded parcel that increases in value each
year, Come in or call, Have aerial photo and soil survey. Call 582-6771.

bieganowski
221 water street

& associates
boyne city, mi. 49712

mimmmmmm

Two bedroom log cabin with 100' frontage on Six Mile Lake. Cabin has
enclosed porch with utility room and dock for fishing. Ideal retreat for
weekend fishing. EJ 359

Deer hunter's delight. A nice forty. Paved road frontage/Adjoins state
land and a few hundred feet from the Jordan River, Great canoeing,
hunting and snowmobiling, EJ 314

Nice 30 acres in South Arm Twp. Mostly wooded. Nice timber. On a paved
road close to Six Mile Lake, Terms negotiable. EJ364

KEITH DRESSEL REALTY!
105 E. Main St. East Jordan

616-536-2295

1]
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Neigh
Surprise dinner for
25th anniversary

If
V

J

Gloria and, Ray Anderson of Boyne
Gty were turprUed Saturday, Oct. 4,
with a dinner honoring them 90 their
25th wedding anniversary. Their daugh-
ters, Kathy Fruge and Nancy Lynch,
and Gloria's sister, AnnDee Parks,
hosted a sit-down dinner at the Ander-
son home for 29 people. Guests came
from Grand Rapids and Livonia. On
Sunday morning, a group of 17 enjoyed
a breakfast brunch at the Harley Parks*
home.

Harold Tooley recently underwent
heart surgery and would like to hear
from friends while recuperating. His
address is: Harold Tooley, Veterans
Administration Medical Center, 3801
Miranda Ave., Cardiac Bldg. No. 1,
Rm. 308, Bed 10, Palo Alto, Calif.
94304.

Bill and Marilyn Behling have
returned from Cincinnati, Ohio, and
northern Kentucky where they attended
the Oct. 4 wedding of their daughter,
Lee Ann Herrington, and William
Lamb. Jim and Mary Ann Milks and
children, Michael, David, Kim, and
Karen, of Boyne City also attended.

Doris Earl and Bernice Carpenter of
Ypsilanti, spent this past week in Boyne
City visiting the Larry Williams family.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hampton of
Macedonia. Ohio, are here this week
visiting friends and enjoying the fall
color.

Mrs. Virginia Hegerberg returned
this week from visiting her son, Thad, in
Cape Girardeau, Missouri. Virginia's
daughter, Pam Schmidt, of Fairmont,
W. Va., joined them at a football game
at Southeast Missouri State.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Armitage of
Lansing, were here over the weekend to
visit Mrs. Genevieve Sutton. Mrs.
Sutton recently attended the 16th
birthday party for her granddaughter
Cynthia at the Raymond Franks' home
in Vasser.

Mrs. Carol Sutliff and son. John of

South Lyon, were here this past
weekend visiting at the Oral Sutliff
home.

Twelve couples met at the home of
Glenda and Terry Reinhardt on
Saturday night for their monthly Farm
Bureau meeting.

Weekend guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Phillips were Judy Sandburg,

Boyne
Area

NANCY NORTHUP
582-9174

Ann Macleod, Ann Taipale and Arlyne
Phillips, all of Dearborn.

Beth Hoaglund and friend Sue, both
students at Central Michigan Univer-
sity, were home with Beth's parents,
the Neil Hoaglunds. Also returning
home was their son Bill from Orlando,
Fla.

Mr. and Mrs. Pat Woody and friends
from Plymouth, were in Boyne over the
weekend to enjoy the fall colors.

Kent Boutilier and friend from
Washington, are here visiting his
parents, the Kent Boutiliers for a week.
Joining them over the weekend were
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Boutilier and Brie
of Garden City.

The Young Couples Club from the
Presbyterian Church, met on Saturday
night to learn square dancing. Bill
Grimm was the caller.

Weekend guests of Dr. and Mrs.
John Karkosak and family were his aunt
and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. James
Karkosak of Parma, Ohio. They were
enroute to Canada.

The Boyne City Nursery School is
planning an open house on Sunday, Oct.
26 from 12:30 p.m. to 2 p.m. Anyone

interested in seeing the school is
welcome to attend.

The general meeting of the United
Methodist Women's Group was held
Wednesday. Mrs. Robert Bryan was in
charge of the installation of new
officers.

Thornita and Bill Roweanof and
Shirley and Ed O'Conner were here for
a long weekend visiting Vi and Louie
Manglos.

Julie Kibby, daughter of Harley and
Edna Burris, was home over the
weekend. Julie, who was seriously
injured in a work accident in Kalkaska a
couple of months ago, will be re-
turning to the rehabilitation center at
Munson Hospital in Traverse City, -

G. Wade Jenkins, a student at Ferris
State, was home visiting his mother
Ann over the weekend.

It was a busy time at the senior center
this week with 36 people attending the
blood pressure clinic on Tuesday. And
125 more received their flu shots on
Wednesday.

At the bowling alley on Wednesday,
were Sarah Long, Norma McCary,
Dorothy Ward, Jean and Bill Marcham,
Pearl Frieden and Patricia Ecker. A
request is made for more participation
in this activity.

On Thursday, 28 people played
bingo. The winners were : Darcy
Savage, Hazel Reber, Rose Reinhart,
Eunice Burnell, Elsie Abbott. The
cover-all prize went to Bernice Car-
penter and the door prize to Veryl
Cornell. This week's donations were
from Leone Richardson and Mary and
Bob Rumfelt.

Three local residents are attending
the 114th annual session of the Grand
Chapter, Order of the Eastern Star at
the Wings' Stadium in Kalamazoo.
Delegates attending from Evangeline
Chapter will be Nan Howard, Marge
Hoekwater, and Ruth VanHoesen.

A recent bike-a-thon sponsored by the East Jordan Lioness Club raised $1,178.57
f o r ^ P 1 1 1 6 1 1 1 to ** w d t th l l C i i C Li D t h A h t riht

recent bikeathon sponsored by the East Jordan Lioness Club raised $1,178.5
Q I I f A _ r f « f n r% n f o r ^ P 1 1 1 6 1 1 1 to ** u w s d at the local Civic Center. Lioness Dorothy Archer, at right,
Ul r \ ^ W 11 l\SlI presents a check to City Clerk-Treasurer Fern Morris. Looking on, at left, we Tiin

• f _ ^ r c Brennan and Trlsha Armstron Ti 1 0 d b i l f l i i t
p y r g , ,
Brennan and Trlsha Armstrong. Tim won a 10-speed bicycle for solicit-
tog more pledges than any other bike rider. Mike Bos, not pictured, was the second
In number of pledges collected, winning a S4S gift certificate. Trisha Armstrong
won a radio for finishing third. [Photo by Mitch Ashley]

Camp Doggett elects officers

New manager for
Village General Store

Walloon Lake residents welcome Joe
Elliott of Gaylord, who has accepted the
position of manager at the Village
General Store. Joe and wife Nancy and
their two sons will be moving here on
Oct. 23. They will be living in Don and
Laura Barrett's home on North Shore
Drive.

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Hose of
Audubon, N.J., and Mr. and Mrs.
Howard Lorenz of Cinnamon, N.J.,
spent 10 days recently with the Hoses'
daughter and son-in-law and the
Lorenzes' niece, Cindy and Pastor
Rodney Ward.

Willis Planck Jr. and Mike Meadows
were in Lansing recently to attend the
Michigan State and Notre Dame game,
The boys were invited by a Boy Scout
tTOup from Petoskey, as guests.

Lenord and J ane t Adams and

daughter Shawn of Naubinway. spent a,',Y
recent weekend at the home of her
parents. A.C. and Versa Fineout. Also

Walloon
Lake

PAT TAYLOR
535*2234

visiting his parents were their son and
daughter-in-law, Jim and Jan Fineout
and family of Engadine.

Mrs. Laurene Morgan, Mrs. Louisa
Gross and Pat Taylor spent a recent
weekend visiting Mrs. Morgan's
brother-in-law, George Cutsinger of
Caro.

Jane Kondrat

New officers for the Camp Daggett
Board of Trustees have been elected.
President for the upcoming year will be
Edward K. Shanahan, who represents
the Charlevoix Kiwanis Club on the
board.

Robert Brummeler , r ep resen t ing
Petoskey Rotary, will be vice-president;
O. Michael Mills. Petoskey Kiwanis, is
the treasurer; Norma Eineder from
Boyne City is secretary.

Camp Daggett was established 55
years ago primarily for the boys and
girls of Emmet and Charlevoix
Counties. It has been governed during
this time by a board of trustees
comprised of representatives of the

Summer
wedding
planned

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Kondrat of
Boyne Falls announce the engagement
of their daughter Jane Ann to Kenneth
B. Doty of East Jordan.

The couple plan a summer, 1981
wedding.

Miss Kondrat is a 1979 graduate of
Boyne Falls High School, She is now a
student at Lake Superior State College
fn Sault Ste. Marie.

Doty is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Jay
Doty of Grayling. He is a 1976 graduate
of Grayling High School.

various service clubs in the two
counties. The Charlevoix-Emmet Inter-
mediate School District sponsors a week
camping session for special needs
during the middle of the regular
camping sessions.

The 1980 summer camping sessions
saw almost 600 campers enjoying the
many activities to be found at Camp
Daggett. Donations made to the camp
are tax free, since Camp Daggett is a
non-profit camp benefiting children.

Other trustees are John DiMartino,
Boyne City Rotary; Russ Eineder,

Boyne City Lions; Marge Greenway,
Petoskey Zonta Club; Clark Ketchum;
Dick Lauterback, Walloon Lions.

Ken Lemon, East Jordan Lions;
Marshall Lincoln, Petoskey Lions; Wil-
liam McClutchey, Little Traverse Bay
Kiwanis; Chuck McDowell, East Jordan
Rotary.

Pat McFall, Petoskey Business &
Professional Women; Mike Rosenow,
Harbor Springs Kiwanis; Tom Taber,
Petoskey Jaycees; T. A. (Art) Treioar,
Life Member.

Klevorn contributes
"Tracks" to youth

BOYNE CITY - Schoolchildren in
Boyne City will be learning more about
conservation this year, thanks to a
contribution from local attorney Bob
Klevorn.

In recognition of the importance of
promoting conservation education, Kle-
vorn has purchased "Tracks" magazine
for use in the Boyne City Elementary
School.

"Tracks" is a monthly conservation
reader produced by the Michigan
United Conservation Clubs (MUCC). It
is aimed at upper elementary and junior

high school readers, and seeks to give
young students an understanding and
appreciation of the natural world.

Each month, "Tracks" focuses on
basic conservation concepts, the habits
and habitat of wildlife species, outdoor
activities, nature lore, and much more.

"Tracks" is produced from Septem-
ber through May. It is available for
$1.50 per student, which includes all
nine issues and a teacher's guide each
month. To order, write "Tracks,"
MUCC, Box 30235, Lansing, Mi. 48909.
A minimum order of 10 per school is
required.

Parents Without Partners

There will be an open house to honor

the 70th birthday of Juanita Erber on

Sunday, Oct. 19.

The celebration will be held from 1 to

Qrand
Opening

appointment
or shampoo

evenings by appointment
GIbuch of Class
626 M-66 (on top of hill) East Jordan

Open house honors 70th
4 p.m. at her residence, 1497 Lakeshore
Dr., Boyne City.

The open house will be hosted by
Mrs. Erber's children. Friends and
family are invited to attend.

The Petoskey Chapter of Parents
Without Partners extends an invitation
to ail single parents to join their group
for the next general meeting on
Wednesday, Oct. 22, at North Central
Michigan College, room 57. Get ac-
quainted time will be from 7:30 to 8
p.m. and the business meeting begins
at 8 p.m. It will include a discussion
entitled "Being Single in a Couples'
World." Afterglow will be at Victory
Lanes.

For membership in PWP a person
must be a single parent. Custody of
children is not a factor. Upcoming
highlights for the group include a
regional weekend hosted by the Tawas
Chapter on Oct. 17 through 19. For
further information regarding the group
or the meetings, contact Nancy Massey

at 347-2078 or Mike Balgenorth at
582-9297.

Fall Savings
At The Main Store-

STORES
Custom Cut Meats

Mon. - Sat.
6a«m. • 9 p.m.

Sunday 9 a.m. • 6 p.m.

BEER ft WINE TAKE OUT [Package liquor In Charfovolx only]

Help us build a senior center
in Boyne City!

Pleaw send donations to:
Senior CHfama BvOdtaig Fund
Utowood Savtnfi and Loan
120N. Uk.SC

MI 49712

Dayton
Snow

Blowers

S»m»»c

PAINT
AVAILABLE HERE

JEANS
Boot cut
$12.99

All
others
$11.99

Your Trustworthy Hardware Store
We're the problem solvers.

East Jordan
HftftDUfRRE

STORES

East Jordan 536-2275

Sweetest
Day is

October 18th
Isn't there someone you
should remember with a

floral gift?

Stop at the Rainy Day Lady and
make someone's day special.

Teleflora Wire Service

116 Woter St. - Midtown
Boyne City
582-6796
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Boyne Falls
couple wed

Wilson and Patrick Smith,
both of Boyne Falls, !.were wed
Saturday, Oct. 11, at the home of Carol
Crouterfield. >/

The Rev. Ray Grienke, pastor of the
Boy ne City United Methodist Church
presided over the evening ceremony.
The bride was given in marriage by her
brother, John Gasco.

The bride wore a floor length pale
blue gown. Carol Crouterfield made the
dried flower arrangements.

Maid of honor was a sister of the
bride, Regina Gasco, of Boyne City, Joe
Gasco, brother of the bride, was best
man. the reception was held immed-
iately after the ceremony at the Crouter-
field home.

The couple, who will make their home
in Boyne Falls, honeymooned in the
Upper Peninsula. Deleta is a 1972
graduate of Boyne Falls High School.
She is employed at Betty's Restaurant
in Boyne Falls. Patrick is an employee
at the East Jordan Iron Works.

Pecks spend a week
• *

In the Upper Peninsula

Deleta and Patrick
Smith

Mr. and Mrs. Ora Peck spent last
week in the Upper Peninsula at New-
berry with the Virgil Groh family. Mr.
and Mrs, Virgil Groh of Newberry, were
Sunday dinner guests of the Ora Peeks.

Sunday dinner guests at the Charlie
Staneks' were the Bob Holzschus, the
Dale Holzschus and son Justin and
Betsy and Rick Olund. The group made
over 30 gallons of apple cider and juice.

Patty Crozier of Traverse City, was a
visitor last week at the hnmr of hor

parents, Howard and Peg Crozier.
Mr. and Mrs. Virgel Peck of Traverse

City, visited Saturday with the Ora

Deer
Lake

LEONASTANEK
582-98*1

Pecks. <
Chuck and Laurie Stanek and son

Charlie spent Sunday visiting Mr. and
Mrs. Leon Beal and family.
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Celebrate 50th
anniversary

Ernest and Edna McCleese were the
guests of honor at a 50th wedding
anniversary celebration held at the
William Topolinski residence in Boyne
City on Oct. 5.

The former Edna Ramey and Ernest
McCleese were married in Otsego
County on Oct. 5, 1930. Originally from
Mancelona, the couple now reside in
Boyne City,

The couple have eight children, 27
grandchildren, and two great-grand-
children. The party was attended by 37
people, including family and friends.

Ernest ana tana
McCleese

Girl Scouts need uniforms
BOYNE CITY - Somewhere in the

back of many closets hang unused or
outgrown Brownie or Junior Girl Scout
uniforms. . . each of which could be sold
or given* to a scout looking for a
second-hand uniform,

Four Boyne City Brownie troops and

three Junior troops are trying to get 100
percent of their membership in uniform.

If you have a uniform to sell, or if you
wish to buy one, call the scout uniform
exchange chairman, Mrs. Frank
Enochs, 582-7246. Worlds to Explore
handbooks may also be sold or pur-
chased second-hand.

WATGH
REPAIR

Repair on all jeweled watches,
wrist, pocket watches, electrics
& self-winds.

1

You must be looking foi my sister

Auto-Owners for
Mobile Home Insurance
If your present mobile home
insurance protects just your
mobile home, talk to us at Auto-
Owner's. You could be skating
on thin ice.

Auto-Owners mobile home
insurance protects more than
your mobile home. If you own a
garage or other structures on
your dwelling property (which
are not used for business, rental
or lease), an Auto-Owners policy
automatically covers it. For up to
10 percent of the value of your
mobile home. At no extra charge.

Ask your independent Auto-
Owneis agent about.mobile
home insurance. He'll help you
get your bearings.

\

\s4uto-Owners Insurance
Life. Home. Car. Business. One name says it best.

102 S. Lake Boyne City 582-6512
Listen to the Auto-Owners John Doremus Radio Show.

WILLIAM J. LINDSAY
R. A. Campbell Agency, Inc.

Bring in
this ad and
SAVE $5
on watch
repair.

Guaranteed
Service On

Our Repair Work

2 Repairmen
on our staff

Charlevoix PetosJcey
Cheboygan Gaylord

Wallcovering Sale

20% off
on our entire line of wallcoverings.

Several brands to choose from.
Sale ends November 1

OUR NEW LOCATION
1070 Bay ViewRd,

Oleson's Shopping Center J 347-1591
Mon.-Th.8-5

Fri, 8-6; Sat. 8-3

A Proven Energy Saver!

Complete copy
machine and

typewriter
REPAIR

Schafer s
113 E. Water
Boyne City
582-6331"

/Justmbvea^
in? I can help

you out.
Don't worry and wonder about

learning your way around town. Or
what to see and do. Or whom to
ask.

As your WELCOME WAGON
Hostess, I can simplify the
business of getting settled. Help
you begin to enjoy your new
town...good shopping, local at-
tractions, community oppor-
tunities.

And my basket is full of useful
gifts to please your family.

Take a break from unpacking and
call me.

Boyne City. Boyne Falls, East
Jordan - Donna Parsons, 582-6398.
Charlevoix Newcomers - Marilyn
Frledly, 547-4969.
Charlevoix Engaged Girls • MarUyn
Izor, 5476733.
Walloon Lake, Petoskey - Pat
FriedH, 347-7813.

Going south for
the winter?

Don't forget to take
The Charlevoix
County Press

along with
you!

Do you spend part of the year in Charlevoix County and part of the year
in the Sunny South? You can still keep up with news of your friends and
neighbors back home.... by subscribing to The Press. Just send in the
coupon below.

Gljarlevoix
County

P.O. Box A 106 S. Lake St.,
Boyne City, Mi. 49712 582-6761

YES, I want to keep getting The Press when I go South this winter. I've
checked the subscription I want. A check is enclosed.

. 3 months out of area, $5
4 months out of area, $6
S months out of area $7.50
6 months out of area $9
12 months, part local/part out of area, $1,3

S
WORK FOR YOU!

Holds in Heat'
Keeps Out Cold

Saves fuel!
CRYSTAL CLEAR-FLEXIBLE-SHATTERPROOF

TACK OVER SCREEN DOOH3 |

FOR
PORCH ENCLOSURES

FLEX-O-GLASS IS SO EASY TO
PUT UP-ANYONE CAN DO IT!

FOR
STORM WINDOWS

CUT FLEX-O-QLA88 TO ^
AND TACK OVER SCREENS /

OR WINDOW OPENINQS! jj

FLEX-OGLASS COSTS SO
LITTLE-ANYONE CAN AFFORD IT!

60t Run. I t .
36" Wide

Also 2 8 " - 48" Widths

WARP BROS. Chicago 60651 Pioneers m Plastics Since 1924
Take this ad to your Hardware, Lumber or Bldg Supply Store

Accept no substitutes—Gel top quality FLEX-O-GLASS

Start sending my paper South after this date:.

Name

Address
City

.Local phone

State. .Zip

I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I

NOTICE
Inflation Fighter Sale!

$3500 OFF on all Rustproof ing
$3500 OFF on all Paint protection

FREE Zeeguard or Mud Flaps
With either above

FIRST
NATIONAL
BANK AND
TRUST
LEADERS IN THE BANKING PROFESSION SINCE 1878

A SHORT COURSE ON MONEY. . .

QUESTION:
How can I make money, and spend it
at the same time?

BTA/l iNTERPRISES
1890 E. Mitchell
petoskey 49770

347-5545 Ask for Ston
Ziebart
APPEARANCE 4 PROTECTION SERVICES

Open a CHECKING/INTEREST PLAN
account at First National Bank!

• Earn 5 XA % continuously on all of
your money.

• We automatically transfer funds
from your savings account to cover the
checks you write.

• Why lose money by keeping your old
checking account?

• Call us today to sign up for our
exciting CHECKING/INTEREST PL AN.

WHEN IT COMES TO YOUR MONEY QUESTIONS;
W&vGbt

MEMBER FDIG. ...0 CONVENIENT LOCATIONS.. .PETOSKEY & BOYNB CITY. .347-7711

•' '•• '••-•' • f v .

№
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If it's under $100, you can advertise it FREE in The Press!

Help wanted
>•• l

OUTPATIENT case supervisor, First
Step Treatment Center, Inc. Outpatient
counselling and supervision of treat-
ment planning and case work. Super-
visory experience preferred. Contact
Marti Heuer, First Step Treatment
Center, Inc. 825 North Center St.,
Gaylord, MI 49735. 517-732-1786.

CHALLENGING POSITION in Title Co.
in Charlevoix. Must have excellent
secretarial skills. Boyne City resident
preferred. Apply at Northern Michigan
Abstract & Title Co. 547-4449.

Thank you
3

I WOULD like to thank all my friends for
their prayers, flowers, cards and visits
during my stay at Charlevoix Area
Hospital.

Thank you
Vera Tokoly _ _

Pets
5

I WOULD LIKE to give my dog away to
a good home. Year-old, housebroken,
well trained, mixed toy collie-Pekinese
house dog.582-9174,

FREE PUPPIES, 635 W. Michigan.
582-7876. Boyne City.

SPRINGER SPANIEL and labrador mix,
S5. Call 547-2057.

№ YOU NEED A PET, there's a pet that
needs you. Call the Charlevoix County
Humane Society. 547-9711. 1 to 6 p.m.,
5 days a week.

Garage sales

HUGE ANNUAL rummage sale -
Friday, Oct. 17. 8 to 5. Saturday, Oct.
18, 8 to noon. Presbyterian Church,
East Jordan.

THE SNOW IS ABOUT TO FAIL
and we are two good beagle hunters
with eight 10-week old puppies who
need good homes. Our master says
the First eight best offers will give
them homes. So would you help us
out and call 547-9600 and make them
an offer they won't turn down and
one that will make this ma and pa
happy by taking care of our puppies
for us. Thank you.

Garage sales
6

FOUR-FAMILY GARAGE SALE - Win
tcr coats and jackets in excellent
condition. Cheap clothing, men's and
women's of all sizes. Also household
items. Oct. 18-19. 9-5, 403 N. Park St.,
Boyne City.

GARAGE SALE • 9-5. Oct. 17-18. 801
Boyne Ave.. Boyne City,

For sale misc.
8

12 GAUGE western field shotgun, slide
action with extra slug barrel, $110. Firm
582-7011.

TRUCK TIRES, Goodyear tubeless,
8.75x16.5 takeoffs, JO ply rating, $75.
for all five. Firm. 582-7011.

BRASS FIREPLACE screen set, com-
plete, white bathroom sink, medicine
cabinet, fold-up type baby stroller,
Quasor 23-inch color TV, walnut con-
solotte. excellent condition, 536-2641.

RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT • Some
used. Range, fryer, grill, refrigeration,
hood, walk-in, worktable, sink, steam-
table, slicer, mixer, dishwasher, micro-
wave, furniture, softserve, salad bar,
deli, bakery, more. Call toll free 1-800-
632-7342.

PUMPKINS - Sugar pumpkins for pie,
ten cents a pound. Wilson Township.
Evenings. 582-6448.

6 FT. HIDE-A-BED, very good condi-
tion, $150. 582-2612.

ELECTRONIC ORCOA concert organ,
$100 or best offer. Portable Singer
sewing machine, $25. Call 582-6650.

GET READY for winter with K2 170
downhill skis with Solomon S444 bind-
ing Poles and Dolomite boots, size
IO-IO'/J. All one year old. Asking $150.
Call 582-6761 and ask for Mitzi.

PHILHARMONIC ACCORDIAN full
size, eleven reed, like new. Will
sacrifice, best offer above $650. Phone
616-536-7256.

ASPEN LOGS and small cedar posts.
Call after 6 p.m., 549-2428.

GENERAC GENERATOR, 15kw, regu-
lar gasoline, and automatic panel board,
automatic start. 547-2232.

SONNY'S GUN SHOP, Ironton. B u y -
Sell—Trade—New—Used. Antiques.
Winchesters and Weatherbys wanted.
547-6784.

"BE KIND to your feet!" Try Knapp
Shoes. Contact Bill Gaunt Jr. 536-7232.
East Jordan.

FENCE POSTS for sale, also cedar
poles. Call 549-2405, Boyne Falls.

TELEVISION - 21 inch black and white,
$50. Sears adding machine. $20. Call
547-9450.

4

It's easy to place
your Classified Ad

Call Us
at 582-6761. We will take your ad on
the phone and help you write it.

Deadline
is noon Monday for each Thursday's
paper, If you miss the deadline, we
can still get your ad in our "Too late to
classify" column if you call by 10 a.m.
TuesdayT

Rates
are only $1 for 10 words or less, plus
10 cents per additional word. If you
call in your ad, we will tell you how
much it will cost, and you can mail
your payment. If payment is noi
receiyed by noon Friday; we will bill
you and add 50-cents billing charge.

Free Ads
Ads are free for one week only in our
"$100 or Under" column. These ads
must:
• be 15 words or less.
• state the price of all items, with total
hot to exceed $100.
• be mailed or brought to our office.
(No phone-ins)
• be for non-business use.

Classifications
l-Help wanted
2-Announcements
3-Thank you
4-Lost & found
5-Pets
6-Garage sales
7-Auctions
8>For sale misc.
9-S100 & under
10-Items wanted
11-Motorcycles
12-Cars& trucks
13-Rec, vehicles
14-Boats & equip.
15-Farrn products
16-Stoves & firewood
17-Eop-re'nT^

JL&Real estate
19-Legal notices
20-Services
21 -Too late to classify

Box Ads
are $3 per column inch. Large
type and illustrations are no extra
charge.

Discount
of 5% is available for running the
same ad 4 weeks or more.

P.O. Box A, 106 S. Uk« St, Boyiw CHy, Ml, 4971* 582

$100 & under
9

FREE ADS! If you want to sell
something for $100 or less, you can
advertise it free in The Press, For
details, see the Classified information
box on this page.

BOYS' WINTER COATS, sizes 14 and
16, S3 each. Hardly worn. 549-2708.

BIKE, men's, 3-speed, $35. Call
582-2166.

. ' ————— _,
FOLDING COT, old but still useable,
$35. 582-9373.

TWO SNOWTERES, 4 ply, F78-14
Dodge wheels, good tread, $35.
582-7734.

BIKE RAMP for loading motor bike on
truck, aluminum, $35. Call evenings or
weekends, 547-5476.

CEDAR CHESTS - Two 36" x l 8 " x l8" ,
$50 each; one 32" x 16" x 16", $40.
Unfinished. Phone 549-2482.

Items wanted
IO

WANTED BASE PLAYER to work with
variety group in the middle. Minimum
of three nights a week. Please call
347-1021.

WANTED TO RENT, new business
family wants to rent 2 or 3-bedroom
house or apartment. Prefer East Jordan
location. Respond with details to P.O.
Box A, Boyne City, MI 49712 or call
collect 517-631-6102,

WE BUY Oriental rugs, Navajo rugs,
gold and silver coins. Ali's Persian
Carpets. 306 Howard St., Petoskey,
347-4542.

WE'LL PAY CASH for gold and
diamonds. Contact Reusch Jewelry •
Petoskey, Charlevoix, Gaylord or Che-
boygan,

Motorcycles
II

1975 HONDA , XR-75, excellent con-
dition. Sat in showroom one year. $350
or best offer. Call 582-7601 evenings.

Cars & trucks
12

1970 ELECTRA, beautiful inside,
mechanically good, outside fair, well
equipped. Best offer over $500.
582-7483.

1976 BUICK CENTURY. 4-door, V-6,
automatic, PS, PB, air' conditioning,
radial tires, 54,000 miles, $1995. US 31
Sales, Bay Shore, 347-6038.

1975 FORD GRAN TORINO, 64,000
miles. PS, PB, automatic, air condi^
tioning, $1,495. US-31 Sales. Bay
Shore, 347-6038.

'77 JEEP CHEROKEE S - Package,
fully loaded, best offer above $4,500.
37,000 miles, new tires, moving to
Florida, 616-536-7256.

1975 SUPER BEETLE Volkswagon.
New engine, new tires, new battery,
great gas mileafe, $2,500. Call 536-
7815. after 5 p.m. _ _

Farm products
IS

SAWDUST, corn, oats, chips—You may
pick up or we will deliver. Howard
Foltz, 347-4385. '

FREE SAWDUST - 50 years old. Good
for mulch. On Railroad Street, Boyne
Falls. ~

Stoves & Firewood
16

FIREWOOD for sale, all hardwood. Call
549-2719.

NEW FRONTIER FIREPLACE insert,
$550, Phone 536-3115.

PREMIUM QUALITY, seasoned maple
firewood, cut and split to your
specifications, Delivered or you pick up.
Also available, excellent dry elm at
unbelievable low prices. 582-9474 or
536-2134.

For rent
17

Real estate
18

Real estate
18

3 BEDROOM newly remodeled home,
$250 monthly, plus security. Phone
582-6751 days, 582-6955, evenings.

CONDOMINIUM for rent, at Landings
for holiday season. Phone evenings,
313-659-8878.

2 BEDROOM HOUSE on M-66 in East
Jordan. Carpets, drapes. Lake Charle-
voix view and excess, no children. $250
plus security. 536-7343, after 6.

MODERN RETAIL STORE or office
space for rent. View of Boyne
Mountain. "Join our other successful
merchants, $210 per month. Call
Barbara Bates, 549-2971 or owner in
Florida, (305)929-1540.

OFFICE SPACE, 3 rooms and bath. US
31 South Charlevoix, $200 per month.
Phone (616)535-2133 after 6 p.m.

FOR RENT - Houses & duplexes
available, call Boyne Country, 582-2242.
Betty, Keith and Marilyn.

OFFICE SPACE for rent in Boyne City.
Will remodel to suit. Call 582-6145 after
5 p.m.

Real estate
JS

BEAUTIFUL building sites with Deer
Lake Access-Association restrictions to
enhance your investments. Close to
Boyne Mt., golf, tennis, skiing. Priced
from $9500. Call Charlevoix Properties,
Inc. 547-4411.

12x60 MOBILE HOME in excellent
condition, ready for immediate occu-
pancy. All appliances and curtains
included. Features recent gas furnace,
new storage shed and aluminum
skirting. Owner will negotiate. You
can't afford to pass this one up. Call
582^9297 evenings.

LAND CONTRACTS-purchased, any '
amount, any where. Prompt local
service. Call anytime. Richard May,
Northern Michigan Investment Co.
582-6751.

BANK REPOSSESSED HOME - 2
family possibility or possible income
property. In town location, City of East
Jordan. Low down payment, excellent
terms to qualified purchaser. Call
Northwestern Savings, 1-947-5490.
Equal opportunity lender.

FT. LAUDERDALE - Plush oceanfront
condo. 2-bedrooms, 2-bath, balcony
overlooks pool and ocean. Will consider
trade for acreage on water. Valued
$169,000. Call (305)565-6350 or
(305)566-6127.

BY OWNERS - For sale • Houses,
housetrailers, mobile homes, land—
bought, sold, traded, rented, financed.
East Jordan Auto Parts, Inc.

MORE LISTINGS of area real estate
offerings can be found on the Realtors'
Page elsewhere in The Press.

For rent

BOYNE CITY •• One bedroom cabin,
includes electric and water, M75
monthly. 3 bedroom house, natural gas
heat and garage. 1 or 2 bedroom
apartment, 2 cat garage, all utilities
Included, $250 monthly. Charlevoix
Properties, Inc. 582-6781.

TWO ROOM furnished apartment.
Adults only. Security deposit, $36-2134.

REAL ESTATE

•Have your elbow room and heat it,
too, with this,roomy, super-insu-
lated, 4-5 bedroom, 11/J bath home
for the larger family. Natural gas
heat, fully carpeted, all major
appliances and you can move right
in. $32,500 on land contract or less
for cash.

Ettt Jordan
200 Main Stwt
1616] 536-7641

[616)5874301
MMottour

$275 down - Qualified farm home.
Assumable 8% farm home mort-
gage, 988 sq. ft., 3 bedroom ranch,
I1/* acres on paved road, near Six
Mile Lake. Excellent condition.
Priced to sell, now $27,900.

40 ACRES - Approximately 1000 ft.
on Coeling Rd., just outside of
Ellsworth. Good soil and good
homesites, $30,000, terms.

TORCH LAKE - Eight lots with 100
ft. or more of beautiful Torch Lake
frontage on West Torch Lake
Drive, north and south of Campbell
Rd. Health Dept. approval assured.
Well priced individually or DIS-
COUNTED as investor package or
for cash.

7800 SQ. FT. BUILDING • In
downtown Central Lake next to
bank. Former Auction House and
Arcade. Excellent opportunity for
multiple businesses, warehouse or
mini-warehouse or light manufac-
turing. Only $60,000 with EASY
TERMS! Will consider trade.

CHERRY ORCHARD - 65 acres of
young and mature tarts and
sweets. Another 110 acres for total
of 175 including good cropland.
Beautiful 4 bedroom, 2400 sq. ft.
home recently expanded and
remodeled. Good barn and silo,
40x64 tool shed. ALL EQUIP-
MENT. 2200 ft. airstrip and two
hangars. GOOD BUY! GOOD
TERMS!

EXECUTIVE HOME - Island View
Subdivision, 4Va miles south of
Charlevoix. Highest quality 3100
sq. ft. with outstanding hilltop view
of Lake Michigan and Fox Islands.

i Priced far below duplication costs
' and EASY land contract terms and

low interest. Call Gordon Priest,
Central Lake, 544-6568. SCHMIDT
REAL ESTATE, Acme, 938-2660.

EASTPORT AREA- Newer tri-level
home on a double lot featuring 4
bedrooms, 2 car garage, fireplace and
price reduction from $58,000 to $50,000.
Call Charlevoix Properties, Inc.
547-4411. "

Legal notices
19.

NOTICE OF SALE OF REAL ESTATE
ON FORECLOSURE

Public notice is hereby given, that
pursuant to a Judgment of Foreclosure
and Order Of Sale entered by the Circuit
Court for the County of Charlevoix,
State of Michigan, on the 18th day of
June 1980 in favor of plaintiffs,
JOHNNIE LEE ROBERTS and
CHERYL LYNN ROBERTS, against
defendants, RONNY RICHARDS and
MARY MARTHA RICHARDS, I shall
offer for sale to the highest bidder, at
public auction to be held at the main
entrance to the County Building, in the
City of Charlevoix, County of Charle-
voix, State of Michigan, on the 2nd day
of December, 1980 at 11:00 o'clock in
the forenoon, the following described
parcel of real property:

Commencing at the Southwest corner of
Section 26, Township 32 North, Range 7
West; thence North along the West line
of said Section 1,871 feet to the point of
beginning of this description; thence
North 226.2 feet; thence East at a 90
degree angle 226.2 feet; thence West at
a 90 degree angle 165^8 feet to the place
of beginning and being a part of the
Northwest 'A of the Southwest lA of
said Section 26, Township 32 North,
Range 7 West subject to existing
easement for highway M-66.

Jane E. Brannon
Charlevoix County Cleft

Ronald W. Powers
Powers j&.Cassidy
Attorneys for plaintiffs
3111/J East Lake
Petoskey, Michigan 49770
(616) 347-5334

(Real
(Estate

By Mark D. Kowalsk©

G.R.I. - C.B.C.
Ski & Shore Properties of Boyne

Metric System Coming

The real estate industry - and the country • is one step closer to metric
measurements with a Senate bill passed in mid-December.

The bill encourages voluntary conversion within the next two years on the
part of industries and other groups. The Metric Board would serve as
consultants to those industries undertaking conversion.

The National Association of Realtors has established a Metric Conversion
Committee, whose objective is to identify both problems and opportunities as
they affect the real estate industry.

What will it be like to sell real estate under the metric system? For one
thing, inches, feet and yards will be replaced by meters, centimeters and
decimeters.

More relevant to Realtors, land measurements will be in square meters
and hectares instead of feet and acres. Space in buifaings will be rented by
square meters instead of square feet. Listing information on for-sale homes
will probably have to carry dual sets of measurements for a period of time.

PROPERTIES
of Boyne

232 E. Water Street
Boyne City, Ml. 49712

Phone 616-582-6654

(Come See Us FIRST)

Older home that has been kept in very good condition. The home has all
the original oak woodwork, a Urge foyer, enclosed sun porch off the
master bedroom, blacktop driveway and a nice yard. $40. a month gas
budget. Call Charlevoix Properties* Inc. 547-4411.

PROPERTIES.

Brtdg* St. Charfevolx

e



I/1

Legal notices

STATE OF MICHIGAN
IN THE 9OTJ1 DISTRICT COURT

FOR THE COl^NTY OFCHARLEVOIX
F1LENO.:80-0447-C

NORTHWESTERN STATE BANK, a
Michigan Banking Corporation, Plain-
tins, vs,
TIM D COTTREU and BRENDA L.
COTTREU, Defendants.

ORDERS TO ANSWER
On the 15th day of July, 1980, an

acUori was filed by the Northwestern
State Bank, Plaintiffs, against Tim D.
Cottrell and Brenda L. Cottrell, in this
Court for collection of monies owed the
Plaintiffs pursuant to an Installment
Note, dated September 12th, 1979.

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED, that the
Defendants, Tim D. Cottrell and
Brenda L. Cottrell, of 11411 Katy
Freeway, Houston, Texas, 77079, shall
answer or take such other action as may
be permitted by law on or before the 20
day of October, 1980. Failure to comply
with this order will result in a Judgment
by Default against such Defendants for
the releif demanded in the Complaint
filed in this Court.
Dated: 9-11-80

DAVID FERSHEE
District Judge

Richard W. May, P-23180
Attorney for Plaintiffs
201 River Street
BoyncCity, Ml 49712
616-582-6751

Services
ao

WILL DO FENCE REPAIR and small
fence jobs. Have many years of working
with licensed installer. For estimate,
please call 582-2267.

PIANO TUNING AND REPAIRS - All
makes and, models, reasonable, R.T.
Loaladle Piano Service, R#2, Charie-
vote. Call 547-2677.
CRANE WORK, bulldozing, backhoe.
dump truck, air hammer, sand, gravel
and top soil, fill dirt, septic tanks,
demolition of buildings. Flynn's
Trenching. Call 347-4771 after 7 p.m..
•147-8469.

ADULTS RESIDENTAL CARE, a lovely
home with good German cooking. Das
Noscnhcim. 584-2030.

Services
20

BflHGHAM ft SONS WELL DRILLING
ft REPAIR - Water well repair, pump
repair and new systems, 536-3169.

ROOFING AND INSULATING. Free
estimates. Reasonable prices.
Gustafson Roofing, 347-5636.

FINEOUT'SDEEP
STEAM CARPET

CLEANING
Phone 5*2-6813 or 582-2391.

PROFESSIONAL EAR PIERCING -
Anytime. Call or stop at any Reusch
Jewelry, Petoskey, Charlevoix, Gaylord
or Cheboygan.
JORDAN STORAGE - Private units to
store motorhomes, travel trailers,
boats, furniture, motorcycles, anything.
Call Mercer L. Carey at 536-2554 after 5
p.m. Located Va mile off M-66 on Erie
Street, East Jordan.

A-l GARBAGE
SERVICE

For Charlevoix, East Jordan and
surrounding areas—We offer
specialized service with pickup at
your door—Special rates—Nobody
does it better. 547-4697.

ASHLEY & KING wood stoves are sold
and serviced by Bob Herrman, Boyne
City, 582-9528.
HIRE A TEEN program can provide you
with reliable teenagers ready and
willing to work odd jobs. For more
information call 582-6682 between 3 and
6 p.m.

CARPET & VINYL
INSTALLATION

Professionally installed. Excellent
and reliable work. Phone 582-7737.
Free estimates.

582-2267
ALL-TRASH

We Pick Up Anything
Residential

Commercial-Contract
DAy-Wcek-Month-Job

119 W. Cedar Street
Boyne City

RECEPTIONS, BANQUETS, FAMILY
REUNIONS AND ANNIVERSARIES
Affordable facilities. Catered or not
catered, with dance floor. Boyne Valley
Lodge, Walloon Lake, 535-2475.
AUTO PAINTING - Rust repair and
complete auto body service. Leonard
Brooks Auto Sales, Boyne City -
Charlevoix Road, 582-6348.

PIANO TUNING, Gordon Wheeler, 39
years experience. 12 years' factory ex-
pcrience. Phone 548-5592 or 347-1215.

JACK STEBE
Custom Carpentery

Building-Remodeling
Additions

RR3 Box 2O3B
CHARLEVOIX

547-9066

LOW COST DENTURES
MICHIGAN LICENSED DENTISTS

CALL TOLL FREE 1-800-2924708

Michigan Dental Referral Service will
furnish names of providing dentists.

Call: Mon.-Fri. 9 a.m.-5 p.m.

Sponsored by

MICHIGAN DENTAL ASSOCIATION

FULL DENTURES ONLY

FOSTER CONSTRUCTION
and Dickinson Homes
Present Something New.

Condominiums, Townhoaaet, Office Balkttngi, Apartments and Motels
Custom design, quality materials dhd workmanship make this

an excellent investment opportunity.
For More Information Call or Stop In to See U»

FOSTER CONSTRUCTION
2799 US 131 - 1 mile wrath of Holiday Inn, Petoskey 347-1731

Weekdays 10-5 p.m. Eve. & Sundays by Appointment

SINCE 1972
HELPING TO BUILD A BETTER COMMUNITY TOGETHER''
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Services
20

CHARLEVOIX ANSWERING SERVICE
Office, medical and residential use, 24
hour service, 6 days a week. 547-4214.

YOJWG MAN 27 years old and
spouse desire caretaker position in
Charlevoix County. Very reliable and
eager. References available. 582-
6761.

Too late to classify
ZX

IF YOU FORGET TO CALL in your ad
by our Monday deadline, we can still
get it in "Too late to classify" if you call
by 10 a.m. Tuesday.

FREE! Beagle, also registered collie.
must have a good home. 582-9314.

EAST JORDAN, Boyne City Rotary.
Fruit on sale Nov. 8. December dei-
ivery. Phone 536-7031.

THANK YOU
To the Boyne City Fire pepartment

for being at our home on Pleasant
Valley Road when we needed them.

Joe and Thurleen Eaton

East Jordan
School Menu

Oct. 20 - 24

MONDAY • Goulash, green beans,
applesauce.
TUESDAY • Submarine sand-
wiches, corn, nut cup, apples.
WEDNESDAY - Meat loaf. French
fries, pineapple.
THURSDAY - Pizza, salad bar.
bananas.
FRIDAY • Baked fish, tartar sauce,
cheese V taters. cinnamon rolls,
peaches.

Menus are subject to change.
Bread, butter and milk served with
every meal.

MENU COURTESY OFi

Gh&rlevoix
Gounty

'Press

Boyne City
School Menu
• • )

Oct. 20-24
MONDAY Hot dogs on a bun,
baked beans, pears.
TUESDAY - Goulash with cheese,
salad, applesauce.
WEDNESDAY - Submarine sand-
wiches, soup or French fries,
peaches.
THURSDAY - Ravioli casserole,
buttered corn, fruit.
FRIDAY - Chicken noodle casser-
ole, peas or salad, fruit cocktail,
cranberry sauce.

Bread, butter and milk served with
meals.

MENU COURTESY OFt

Bob's
Pharmacy

Boyne Falls
School Menu

Oct. 20 - 24

MONDAY - Turkey in gravy over
biscuits, cramberry sauce/ buttered
corn. "
TUESDAY - Goulash, shredded
cheese, carrot sticks, bread.
WEDNESDAY • Hamburgers,
French fries, cheese slices.
THURSDAY - Roast beef in gravy,
mashed potatoes, spinach.
FRIDAY • Pizza, cabbage salad.

Milk and dessert served
with all meals.

MENU COURTESY OFi

BayneUSH

Service Put your business
card in the

Service directory!
582-6761

AUTO&
TRUCK REPAIR

DRYWALLING PLUMBING & HEATING

Blake's Auto & Truck
Service & Repair

Wrecker Service

M-75
Boyne City, MI
616-582-2281

REDMAN ENTERPRISE
DRYWAUING: Hang, tape, prime
dry wall and textured ceilings.

Bill Redman

FREE ESTIMATES

582-6854Boyne City

Chipman Plumbing and Heating

° Licensed Plumbers
Kohler Fixtures

°Moncrtef Hot Air Furnaces
°U.S. National Boilers

Boyne City 582-7151

Boyne Country
Chrysler-Plymouth

(Formerly Jack's1 Aiit6Sates
& Jim & Charlies Auto Service)

Wrecker Service
Complete repair on all makes of cars

Paint & Bump Shop
Sales 582-6511 Transmission - Alignment M-75
Service 582-7881 B r a k e s Boyne City

Hellebuyck Dry Wall Co.
Hang, tape and prime drywall

Also ceiling texture
Quality workmanship

Residential & commercial
Free Estimates

Owner: Jim Hellebuyck
582-6639

Service
8a.m. -4:30p.m.

Office: 533-8397
Res.: 533-8400

Bellaire Plumbing & Heating, Inc.

P.O. Box 237
Bellaire, Mich. 49615

Robert Fryske, Master Plumber t
Residential/Commercial/Industrial

EXCAVATING ROOFING

BUILDERS

SEALS & ROBERTS
CONSTRUCTION

COMPANY

Complete Building
and Remodeling

582-6535

BULLDOZING

East Jordan-536-7507
Serving Charlevoix County

CALL

Dave Smith
Excavating

Sand Gravel
Septic Systems
Installed and

Pumped
Basements Dug

ROOFING COMPANY

nded Built-up Roof
Insulated Roof Decks
Steel Roof Decks
Waterproofing

Insured Workmen
5578 U.S. 131 Petoskey

347-8823

Camp Dagget Rd.
Boyne City
582-9392

EJ. Patterns
•Machining
•Welding
•Drilling
•Fabricating

Business (616) 536-2691
Home (616) 536-2485

Gerald F. Roberts
"Farm Tractor and Machine Repair"

East Jordan, Michigan

Drenth Brothers, Inc.
Land Leveling

& Clearing
Field Drainage
Road Building

Excavating
At Your Service

•Since 1948-

Sand - Gravel - Stone
Topsoil - Fill Dirt
Cement - Mortar

Blocks
Chimney Materials

Ellsworth, Mich.
[6161588-2277

QVS
Ow ti V*M« 01 llp»n*nc»

IfltwM £lfW<wnc»0 WofkmMl

Distributors

Roofing 347-9093
Siding

Insulation
Residential • Commercial

- Industrial
Specializing in;

Shingles Built-Up Roofs
Wood Shakes Rapid Roof

INSURANCE

BLAKE KENNEY
MASONRY, INC.

Residential-Commercial
Reasonable Prices

Boyne City, MI 616,582-9332

SANITATION
RUEGSEGGER—STANLEY

INSURANCE AGENCY
"COVERAGE FOR ALL"

•hotreationai vehicles •Home owners
•Boat . "Renters insurance
•Mobile homes •Automobile
•business owners »Lifc
106 E. Water 582-6251 Boyne City

•Residential
•Commercial
•Any size container

SUPERIOR SANITATION SERVICE
Rt. 1, Box 226 • Charlevoix, MI 49720
Rusty Mclntosh (616)547-6922

Serving East Jordan, Ellsworth,
Central Lake and N. Torch Lake.

SAYLES MASONRY
CONSTRUCTION

All Types of Masonry
Residential & Commercial

OWN*

M-75 South
Boyne City 549-2672

LAUNDRY &
DRY CLEANERS

CONCRETE

1 Dry
307 FRONT STREET

BOYNE CITY, MICHIGAN
PHONE 582-2200

•Professional Dry Cleaning
•Laundry and Dry Cleaning Service
•We do Alterations

NEWtOCATION

Boyneland Refuse and
Garbage Service

211$. Lake 582-6692
Serving floyne City, Boyne Falls, Horton Bay,
Advance and adjoining townships. We pick up
EVERYTHING.

Mon.-Frt. 10-12:30-1:30-5 p.m.
Sat, 10-12»12:30-3 p.m.
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STEEL

JORDAN VALLEY
CONCRETE

CONCRETE

.*.EASTJORDAN
CALL 53*7701

Serving Charlevoix IEDY-MIX CONCRETE
and Antrim County RE-ROD-WIRE MESH

302 Michigan Ave.
Petoskey 347*8151

ft* hoaw pickup Md D«Hvery
T»Mday ft Friday

Pickup & drop oif at Flneout's
Carpets of Boyne City

SEALS & ROBERTS
CONSTRUCTION

Angles-Plates
Channels-Beams

, •':.• - B a r s - •
Boyne City 582-6535
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Sports
Boyne rolls to 5-1;
Next 3 will be tough

Two of these East Jordan High School students will be crowned homecoming king
<m(' queen this weekend. Queen candidates, from left, are Dorlnda Vallance, Joan
Swanson, Coleen Thompson, Colleen MulhoUand, Katht Postma and Pat Meade.
King candidates are Jerry Fuller, Mike Spence, Del Ingalls, Chuck Hillaker, Mike
Cihak and Larry Huckle. [Photo by Mitch Ashley]

BOYNE CITY - Already assured of a
winning season, the Rambler grid team
will be facing the toughest part of its
schedule in the next three weeks.

Gaylord, Cheboygan and Charle-
voix—probably the three best teams in
the Michigan-Huron Shores Confer-
ence—are next in line for Boyne City.

The Ramblers take a sparkling 5-1
record into this Friday's home field
encounter with the Gaylord Blue Devils.

Boyne's latest victim was St. Ignace,
one of two teams to whip Gaylord this
year. Gaylord is coming off a 42-0 loss to
conference leader Cheboygan.

"We know they're good." says
Boyne City coach, Bob McCullough.
"We have no easy games in this
conference."

"They are pretty strong defensively,
and they have a real good passing
game," McCullough said.

Blue Devils quarterback Randy

Ogden is tied for the conference lead in
touchdown passes with four. Running
back Greg Gadowski is tied for third in
league scoring with four touchdowns.

If Cheboygan continues to overpower
all of its opponents, Friday's game
could be an important one in the battle
for second place. Boyne is 3-1 in the
conference, and Gaylord is 2-2.

Last week, the Ramblers dealt St.
Ignace its first conference loss, 32-14.

Boyne won the game in dramatic
style, falling behind 14-0 in the first
quarter and then dominating the
remainder of the contest.

Halfback Kerry Kruzel scored twice
in the second period on runs of six and
11 yards, and quarterback Todd New-
ville scored from the three. That put the
halftime score at 20-14.

In the third quarter, Newville scored
on a four yard sprint, and in the fourth

quarter he hit Daryl Tims on a four yard
touchdown pass.

"I was really proud and impressed,"
McCullough said after the game.
"Sometimes when you get two touch-
downs behind you want to go and hide,
but these guys bounced right back."

Newville chalked up 195 yards in total
offense, substituting for injured
quarterback John Tompkins. It wasn't
really a strange position for Newville,
however, .sjnce he played quarterback
for most of the 1979 season.

Newville completed nine of 15 passes
for 101 yards, and he ran for 94 more on
18 attempts. Doug Christy, who hurt his
knee and may not be able to play
against Gaylord, ran for 69 yards.
Kruzel added 54 yards, and Todd
Rickard had 53.

Senior defensive back Dave Smith
played an outstanding game,
McCullough said.

Red Devi ls mUSt aVOid Regional golf champ says

letdown after big win
EAST JORDAN - After squeaking

past Gaylord St. Mary in a battle of
league leaders last week, East Jordan
coach, Frank Holes, hopes his team
won't let up now that the worst part of
the schedule is over.

The Devils host Central Lake for
homecoming at 8 p.m. (his Friday.

Although the Trojans arc 0-4 in the
Ski Valley League. Holes says. "We're
a little concerned about a letdown."

"It doesn't matter who you're play-
ing, because you've got to be ready. On .
any given day. there are upsets all over
the place. When you're on top. every-
one points to you."

So, Holes said, "We're not going to
make it easy this week. We're going to
go at Central Lake like they were
Mancclona or St. Mary's."

Although the Trojans have a losing
record, and there are only 18 players on
their roster, they are good athletes.
Holes said. Central Lake gave
Mancclona a good battle before losing
28-12 last week.

Last Friday's 6-3 Red Devil victory at
Gaylord was played in a downpour for
the first half, and rain continued in the
third quarter. The miserable conditions

were to blame for a nearly unbelieve-
able 12 fumbles by East Jordan—and
five of those fumbles were lost.

"I think we fumbled every series we
had the ball." Holes said.

Giving vip that many fumbles meant
that East Jordan played defense for the
vast majority of the game.

"Our defense won the game for us ,"
Holes said, matter-of-factly. "All the
praise and credit for this one go to the
defense and defensive coach, (Jim)
Wod/.inski. They were amazing. They
were in terrible field position all night
long, and they never gave up a
touchdown."

St. Mary's only score came on a
15-yard field goal in the second quarter.

The Snowbirds ran 12 plays inside the
East Jordan 10-yard line in the second
quarter, but failed to score a touch-
down. One drive was stopped two
inches from the goal.

Leading the defense was Steve
Hildcn with \2 tackles. "He was all over
the field." Holes said.

Other leading tacklers were Bill
Spence and Jerry Fuller with nine
tackles and Mike Cihak with eight.

Steve Graham recovered two Gaylord
fumbles, Del Ingalls intercepted two
passes and Randy Morris had one
interception.

East Jordan scored its only touch-
down late in the third quarter on a
two-yard run by Graham.

The foul weather worked to East
Jordan's advantage for their touch-
down. A bad hike allowed the Devils to
tackle Gaylord's punter only 15 yards
from the goal line.

Graham was the leading ground
gainer for the Devils with 76 yards in 20
carries. Tom Peters picked up 59 yards
on 12 carries.

The East Jordan victory put the Red
Devils in excellent position to win the
league championship for the third year
in a row. The Devils are now 4-0 in the
Ski Valley circuit and 5-1 overall.

For St. Mary, the loss was a bitter
one. not only because the league title
may be lost, but also because the team's
chances for a state playoff berth are
greatly diminished.

The Snowbirds had been ranked as
high as third in the state in some Class
D polls.

Boyne runners place 2nd, 4th
BY RUSSELL TISRON

Student-Reporter

BOYNE CITY - The Rambler cross-
country team placed second in a
triangular meet and fourth in the
Petoskey Invitational last week.

In a tri-meet at Elk Rapids last

Tuesday. Boyne beat Mancelona 15-50
with 15 being the lowest score possible.

However, Elk Rapids put up some
tough competition. Tim Crumbaugh
placed third and Jim Brabbs placed
sixth, and Bcyne lost 36-19.

In the Petoskey Invitational Saturday,
Boyne placed fourth in the Class C

Football Fans
Boyne City Dairy Queen

offers you...

1 free.oo: PEPSI l

junior-senior race. Tim Crumbaugh
placed 10th, winning a medal. Brian
Vroman placed 21st and Matt Irwin
placed 22nd.

Although Boyne did not place in the
freshman-sophomore race, Mike Huiett
placed third and won a medal. Sopho-
more John Brabbs also ran well, placing
13th.

There were 14 Class C and D teams at
the invitational. Over 60 runners com-
peted. Rogers City won ,the invita-
tional. Charlevoix took second, and St.
Ignace was third, beating Boyne by only
two points.
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"Player of the Week"

todd Newville
Senior Todd Newville played

quarterback for the first time this
season Friday, and he rolled up 195
yards in total offense to lead Boyne
City to a 32-14 victory over St.
Ignace. Todd completed nine of 15
passes for 101 yards, and he also ran
the ball IS times for 94 yards.
Included in those impressive figures
were two touchdown runs and a
touchdown pass. Todd is the son of
Doiig and Sandy Newville,

he didn r play very well
BOYNE CITY - He says he didn't play

very well, but junior Steve Kircher still
walked off with the first place medal in
the high school regional golf meet at
Houghton Lake last Friday.

Kircher shot an 80 on the par 72
course, and that score tied him with
Rick Brown of Kalkaska after 18 holes.
Kircher won the sudden death playoff
on the first hole, sinking a six-foot putt
for a birdie four on a par five hole.

Taking medalist honors in the
regional meet qualifies Kircher to
compete in the state meet in Saginaw
this weekend.

If he has a good day, does he have a
chance at' winning the state title?
"Maybe," Kircher said.

Steve set the Boyne City High School
record earlier this season with a 36 at Ye
Nyne Olde Holies. That broke Lon
Kowalske's long-standing mark of 37. Steve Kircher

Petoskey golfer wins Parrish Open
BOYNE CITY - The Parrish Open

Golf Tournament, held Oct. 4 at Ye
Nyne Olde Holies was successful in
spite of cold and windy weather.

Over $300 in cash prizes were
awarded, including a 1981 club
membership to the low net winner, Bog
Gregory of Petoskey.

Other winners included Lon

Loggers second

Kowalske with a score of 70 in the
championship flight. Following
Kowalske were Mike Cummings with 75
and Bob Starback with 70. All are from
Boyne City.

Bob Baker of East Jordan and Steve
Moody of Boyne City tied for first in the
first flight with scores of 75. Tom
Kujawski also of Boyne City followed

with a score of 76.
Other winners included Jack Caverly

of Boyne City with a 69 and Chris Bulow
of East Jordan with 73.

Mike Cummings won the long drive
contest that followed the tournament,
with Lon Kowalske and Don Peck, Jr.,
all of Boyne City, finishing second and
third respectively.

victory Soccer team takes 2nd
BOYNE FAILS - The Logger girls'

basketball team won its second game of
the season last Thursday, blasting
Wolverine, 62-37.

Melody Wilson led the scoring with
16 points, and she also added four
assists. Pat Franckowiak chipped in
with 10 points and 10 rebounds.

The Loggers also won the junior
varsity game, 32-5.

BOYNE CITY • The Boyne City
Soccer Club begins tournament play
this Sunday after finishing the regular
season in second place in the Northern
Lights Soccer League.

Boyne opens tournament play be
hosting Traverse City Sunday at the
field behind First National Bank. The
starting time of 3 or 4 p.m. hadn't been
finalized as of Monday.

Boyne clinched second place in the
league by beating Alpena 5-1 Sunday in
Gaylord. Jakob Gantner had two goals
for Boyne City, and Chris Todter, Kevin
Kretschmann and Rolf Bethke each
scored one goal.

Northport won the league title with a
5-0 record, followed by Boyne City at
4-1, Alpena at 3-2, Charlevoix 2-3,
Traverse City 1-4, and Forest Area, 0-5.
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"Player of the Week"

Sieve Hilden
The defensive unit won East

Jordan's big league showdown with
Gaylord St. Mary last week, and
Steve Hilden "was by far the most
outstanding player in the game,"
according to Coach Frank Holes.
Hilden, a 5-11, 180-pound senior
linebacker, led the team In tackles
with 12. Steve is the son of Harriet
and Bill Hilden. \

High Game & Series
Mary Ann Gee 191 494
Judie Peebles 182 462
Lorie Vincent 450
Florence Goik 171

Susan Moreau had 89 pins over
average for her series.

Early Birds
Oct .?

Boyne Essex 120 60
Country Star Market 113 67
Hunt's Pallets 110 70
Sunsetters 102 78
Northwestern State Bank lOO'/a 79Vs
Moore's Hardware 82 l/i 97V4
Lindsay Insurance 81XA 98'/a
Masters 74 106
Boyne Falls Log Homes 70'/a 109'/a
Bob's Pharmacy 46 134

High Game & Series
Ella Peters 188 502
Rita Moody 183
Sandy Kildea 180 490
Pat Moore 473

Inter City League
Oct. 6

Legion 108'/a 41 '/i
Spike's • , , 84 66
Peters' Laundromat 81 69
Chuck's Place 75 75
State Bank 57'/i 92Va
Aardema's 44 106

High Game & Series
D.Gee 593 223
R. Dunson 536
P.Bennett 528 210

East Jordan Ladles League
Oct. 8

Dressel Realty H4Va 65 Vt
American Legion 105 75
Gulf & Western 102 7$
Taylor's IGA 99V» 80»/a
D.P.I, 93 87
Northwestern State Bank 91 Va 88'/a
Long Leasing 88 92
Campbell Agency 84 96
Gemini Lanes 83 97
Hite Drug Store 81 Vt 98Va
East Jordan Lumber 77 V? JLQZtt
U.S. t o b a c c o 60 l/a MWt

Ruth Chanda - 507 series ,
Most pins over average - Florence

parnett. 49 with a 187 game.

East Jordan Merchants
•

American Legion
East Jordan Lumber
Country House
Gemini Lanes
Jordan Valley Concrete
Rainbow Bar
Petrife Construction
Jerry's
Bartlett's Excavating
East Jordan Plastics

81
77

76 Vi
76
71

70 Va
68 Vi
59
55
50

69
73
75 Vi
74
79
79'/a
81'/a
91
95

100

Jordan Valley Greenhouse 1061/) 43 Vj
Dave's Mobil 101V* 48'/a

High Game & Series
T. Bennett 574 236
B. Cummins 560 205
B.Jones 550 203
R. Gagnon 543 247
P. Bennett, Don Mayhew 505 247

Thursday Night Women's
Oct. 9

Northland Tobacco 142 68
Mogul Inn 134 Vi 75 Vi
Betty's Restaurant 129 81
Country Star Market 118 92
Ace Hardware 117 93
Boyne City Lanes 116 94
Little Lena's 114Va 95Vi
Boyne Avenue Greenhouse 112 98
Advance Grocery ilOVi 99Vi
Sayles Masonry • HOVi 99Vi
Trumco, Inc. 107 103
LilPub 99Vi llOVa
Buick Real Estate 97VM12Va
Duffs Lounge 93 Va 116 Va
Buck's Body Shop 90Vi 119Va
Petoskey Plastics 88 Vi 121 Vt
Schafer's 88 Vi 121 Vi
Ron's Pro Shop 87Vi 122Va
REH Acres 74Vi 135V*
Denison's Party Shop 69 141

High Game and Series
Sally Looze 201 503
Sandy McGeorge 196 480
Laura Looze 195 492
Judy Hubble 173 475
Betty Hubbafd 471

Plntwistoirs
Oct.8

H's&J's 10 2
Whatevers 8 4
Help 7 5
NiteOwls 75
Hot Shots Again 6 6

The Fallen Angels 6 6
UncontroUbles 3 9
H's&W's 3 9
B's&D's Incomplete
Ferps incomplete

.V.

: • I:

. ! • • • Vi



The East Jordan branch of Northwestern State Bank opens its doors to the public this week.
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By TRISH WRIGHT

Banking in East Jordan is now twice as
easy as it used to be.

That's because there are now two
places where Northwestern State Bank
customers can do their banking in East
Jordan.

The bank this week opened a new
branch office near Glen's Market on
Highway M-66.

And although it's called a "branch," it
will offer virtually every service that is
available at its main office in downtown
East Jordan.

"We bailt this branch to take care of
our existing customers," says Chuck
McDowell, chief executive officer of
Northwestern State Bank.

"Many people prefer drive-in facilities
and one stop shopping and banking. We
will be well serviced at this location."

The branch office site was chosen
because of its frontage on Highway M-66
near Glen's Market, where there is
significant growth potential for East
Jordan.

Before construction started, an archeo-
logical survey was conducted to assure
that nothing of any archeological or
historic significance would He below the
brick and mortar building. "This archeo-
logical survey was mandated last year by
the federal government for all federally
regulated businesses," explains
McDowell.

Approval for the branch was granted
by the Federal Institutions Bureau last
December. Construction began in March.
No protests were filed by any other
banking institution in the area.

Rhea Parsons, branch manager, will be
assisted by Ruth Sadlowski and Mabel
Hudkins,

The full banking services available at
the branch will include: acceptance of
loan applications, banking by mail, night
deposits, drive-in banking, checking ac-
counts, savings accounts, foreign drafts,
money orders, traveler's checks and
Christmas Clubs. Safe deposit boxes are
not available at the branch but are offered
at the downtown Northewestern State
Bank office.

Northwestern State Bank invites the
public to tour the premises of its newest
branch. Refreshments and compli-
mentary gifts will be offered to the bank's
customers and visitors during the open-
ing week.

Lobby business hours will be from 9
a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday through Thurs-
day, and 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. Fridays.

Drive-up service hours will be from 8
a.m. to 4 p.m. Monday through Thurs-
day, 6 a.m. to 6 p.m. Fridays and 9 a.m.
to noon on Saturday.
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Congratulations and
much success on your

Grand Opening
We were glad to be a part of your

construction by providing all of your

Masonry work

SAYLES MASONRY CONSTRUCTION
Walt Sayles, owner

Boyne Falls

Locally owned banks serve their communities best."

Congratulations
to the staff of

Northwestern State Bank....

from the company who provided
you with the complete electricial
work for your new facilities.

Bellows
Electric

Residential*Commercial
Refrigeration

Charlevoix 547-9410

tea Parsons

Parsons to
manage
bank office

EAST JORDAN - Rhea Parsons has
been appointed manager of the East
Jordan Weststde office of the North-
western State Bank. This new office will
be open Monday Oct. 13.

Ms. Parsons has five years of banking
experience. She enjoys cooking, sew-
ing, and has a new hobby of oil
painting. She is also a charter member
of the East Jordan Lionesses.

Her three sons Randy, Dennis, and
Bob are living at home with her, and
daughter Pam is in the Air Force.,
stationed in Mississippi.

Thanks a Million...
We're proud to have provided

our services.

Dipzinski Decorating
Boyne City 582-7002

on the completion of your new
facility. We're proud to have been
a part of your construction.

Lynch Acoustical
Specialties Company

Traverse City 947-4200
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NWSB has expanded greatly since 1901
EAST JORDAN -• Northwestern State

Bank was originally chartered in 1901 as
the State Bank of East Jordan. It was the
first bank in East Jordan and for 79 years
remained the only bank in this city.

On Dec. 1, 1944, the East Jordan State
Bank opened a Boyne City office,
although deposits had been picked up
from Boyne City businesses long before a
Boyne City office was established.

Bank stockholders authorized changing
the name of the bank from State Bank of
East Jordan to Northwestern State Bank
in 1969.

Two years later the bank expanded
again. Boyne Falls was now in the
service area, as an office was opened
there.

In 1974 Northwestern opened a branch
in the Country Star shopping center in
Boyne City so that their customers could
shop and bank at the same location.

An Atwood branch, south of Charlevoix
on U.S. 31, and a Petoskey office on U.S.
131 continued the expansion program
more recently.

The newest Northwestern State Bank
branch is located in the bank's home town
of East Jordan.

Says Chuck McDowell, chief executive
officer, "We wanted a branch in East
Jordan because of people's preference for
one-stop shopping and banking. It's very
likely that any significant growth in East
Jordan will be along the M-66 highway."

Northwestern's East Jordan branch is
conveniently located near the new Glen's
Market, which opened less than a year
ago. More stores are planned for future
years to develop the supermarket into a
shopping center.

Pictured left to right are: Bill Grauel, President of Northwestern State Bank, Rhea Parsons, East
Jordan branch manager and Chuck McDowell, chief execative officer and chairman of the board.

Congratulations
Northwestern State Bank

r

A big Welcome from your new neighbors!
•GUNS MEANS

SCRVICf M THf NC*TH*

MARKffTS A
FAMILY CBfTOtS

11 FRIENDLY LOCATIONS:
Gaylord - Grayling • Mtncekraa - Kalktska

East Jordan - West Branch • Mio • Roscommon • Rose City
Charlevoix - Houghton Lake
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Mabel Hudkins

Manager-
Rhea Parsons Lobby: Mo

Drive-up: Mon

"our complete hanking service:
•Checking
•Savings
•Money Orders
•In-CIub
•Anytime Tellers

•Loan Applications
>Wire Transfers
•Traveler Checks
•Collections

Americas
INcredible

CLUB

"Locally owned banks serve their communities best,"
East Jordan Boyne Falls

Boyne City (Downtown, Drive-in and Plaza)
Petoskey and Atwood

Member F.D.I.C. dej
insured up to $1Q0<1
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Now through
Saturday,
October 18

Ruth Sadlowski

service:
^plications
ansfers

Checks
tions

by for FREE
refreshments and c

Manager-
Rhea Parsons

N&vtAweafovn.

Lobby: Monday through Thursday
Friday

Drive-up: Monday through Thursday
Friday
Saturday

9 a.m. - 4 p.m.
9 a.m. - 6 p.m.
8 a.m. - 4 p.m.
8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
9 a.m. - Noon

Americas
INcredihle a

A FULL
SERVICE

BANK

CLUB
TV*

''Locally owned banks serve their communities best/'
East Jordan Boyne Falls

Boyne City (Downtown, Drive-in and Plaza)
Petoskey and Atwood

0M0I1UMO

Member F.D.I.C. deposits
insured up to $100,000
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Best wishes in the years to come
From the company who provided the steel

Bob Greenwell & Son
Petoskey 347-3346

.

as you celebrate your Grand Opening

We were pleased to have provided you with
the complete mechanical work

ARMS & COLE, INC
MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS

TRAVERSE CITY 947-2750

We're proud to have been a part of
your growth. Best wishes on your

Grand Opening.

ROOFING COMPANY
INDUSTRIAL • COMMERCIAL • RESIDENTIAL

Camp DaggettRd., Boyne City - 582-9392
5578 U.S. 131 Hwy., Petoskey - 347-8623

The new East Jordan branch of
Northwestern State Bank Is located
near the new Glen's Market shop-
ping center. The drive-In window
makes It convenient for customers
to receive fast and friendly service.

Congratulations

Northwestern

State Bank

...on your

beautiful

new office

in East Jordan.

We share your optimism and
confidence in the future of East
Jordan and Northwestern Michi-
gan.

Gharlevoix
Gounty
Press

Your Community Newspaper

IL
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Friendly and efficient service
Two of Northwestern State bank's home office employees join Rhea Parsons,
right, at the East Jordan branch. Mabel Hudkins, left, who edits
Northwestern's newsletter, "The Hotline," has been an employee of the bank
for 15 years. Hadldns, an East Jordan resident, Is a part time teller. Ruth
Sadlowsld, center, Is a 1979 graduate of East Jordan High School. Sadlowski,
who plans a career In the banking Industry, is the drive-In teller at the branch
office. She has been associated with Northwestern State Bank for two years.

We extend our sincere best wishes
on your new building and hope your
Grand Opening is a tremendous
success,

From the company who provided
your concrete.

H&H Glauch Masonry
Traverse City 947-1098

Best Wishes
during your Grand Opening cele-
brations and in your future en-
deavors .

TWIN VALLEY CARPET CENTER

582-2391

We're proud to have been a part of
your growth

Besf wishes on your Grand Opening

Tri-City Asphalt
Charlevoix 547-2455
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MAY THE VALUE OF
YOUR SERVICE
CONTINUE . . .

trotu

. TO PYRAMID
FRIENDSHIPS

& GROWTH.

BARBER•MCCALrtN ASSOCIATES ARCHITECTS• ENGINEERS
OS34 Dlxi© Highway AnchorviHe, Michigan 49004 313-735-9^01

We sincerely thank you for the privilege of
cooperating in the completion of your New Facility.

THOMPSON • PHELAN, INC.
AnchorvMe, MlChljgart 460O4 313-725-84O1

•V).

.


