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Farm Security J 
Aids 190 Families 

IN CHARLEVOIX COUNTY. AVER-
AGE ONE OUT OF EIGHT 

FAMILIES 

During the last five years the Farm 
Security Administration has assisted 
a total of 190 farm families in Char­
levoix County, according to Edward 
E. LaBerge, PSA supervisor for the 
county. 

Supervisor LaBerge pointed out 
that the last agricultural census show­
ed that there were 1,-342 farms in the 
county. On this basis, he pointed out, 
the Farm Security Administration 
has extended loans and other forms 
of rehabilitation assistance to one out 
of every eight of the county's farm 
families. 

The financial assistance given by 
the FSA has taken three general 
forms, the supervisor explained. 

First, there are the' rehabilitation 
loans to enable borrowers' to ' carry 
out improved farm plans. 

Second, are emergency loans made 
to farmers in need of small amounts 
for immediate use in saving their 
crops or providing food for their fa­
milies andJeed for their livestock. 

Finally there are grants, made to 
supply urgent living needs to famil­
ies whose farms are not capable of 
producing income enough to pay 
both farm operating costs and family 
living expenses. 

In Charlevoix County since 1935 
the FSA has made 74 standard reha­
bilitation loans, 36 emergency loans, 
and grants to 80 families; Both stand­
ard and emergency loans are self-li­
quidating. 

In Charlevoix County a total of 
$50,799.26 has been loaned in the 
past five years. Repayments to date 
total $21,832.18 or 42.97 per cent. 
Since full settlement of most of the 
loans is not due for three or four 
years, Farm Security officials feel 
they can conservatively expect even­
tual repayment of an extremely high 
proportion of the total amount loan­
ed. 

Commenting on the collection rec­
ord, Supervisor LaBerge said, "We 
are particularly proud of this, be­
cause by ordinary business standards 
Farm "Security borrowers could not' 
be considered good credit risks, yet a 
bulk of the repayments have , been 
made and made when they were 
due."' 

A vital contribution toward the 
ability of the farmer to repay his ob­
ligation in many cases- has been the 
FSA's farm debt adjustment service, 
Supervisor LaBerge added. This ser­
vice is available to all farmers, whe­
ther or not they are Farm Security 
borrowers. 

"Since one of Farm Security's pur­
poses is to aid distressed farmers to 
achieve financial independence, we 
try. to bring the farmer and his credi­
tors together for a friendly and real­
istic appraisal of the farmer's actual 
ability to handle his obligations. 

"These conferences usually result 
in an adjustment of some kind," Su­
pervisor LaBerge said. "When the 
farmer's creditors see that these ad 
justments are to their own advantage 
as well as the community's, they usu 
ally are willing to scale down the am 
ount of the debt, reduce the interest 
rate, or lengthen payment period-." 

TO GIVE RECITAL 
NEXT MONDAY 

Piano pupils of Irene Snyder 
will give a recital for their par­
ents and friends Monday evening, 
June 3rd in the High School Audi­
torium at 8 o'clock. 

Beginners Band 
Will Be Organized 

Next Monday Afternoon 

School closes this week and with it, 
as usual comes the organizing of a 
new Beginners Band. Several young­
sters have made arrangements alrea­
dy to join and next Monday after­
noon, from 1:00 o'clock until 6:00 
o'clock, more will take advantage of 
joining' the year's group. Parents are 
asked to come with the children to 
make arrangements to get an instru­
ment. The meeting will be in the 
bandroom. 

LIBRARY NOTES 

Two volumes entitled "American 
Medicine" Expert Testimony out of 
Court. What is wrong — and what 
is right — with American Medicine 
as freely set forth by leading doctors 
and surgeons, including men from ev­
ery state, has been received by the 
Library from The American Founda­
tion. Some of the questions the Doc­
tors discuss:— "Is radical change 
needed in the present organization of 
medical care?" "What is 'adequate' 
medical caTe?" "It it were 'available' 
now to all, would half the population 
still prefer quacks, and patent medi­
cine?" "Is there too much specializa­
tion?" 

Four more books have been placed 
on the shelves: 

"The Everlasting Whisper", Jack­
son Gregory. 

"Trinity Bells", Amelia E. Barr. 
"The Gadfly", Voynich. 
"Chevalier d'Harmental", Dumas. 
"A Window in Thrums", James 

Barrie. . , 
Books for fiction readers have been 

given to the Library by Mrs. Mabel 
Secord and Dan Barlow. They are 
very much appreciated. 

New books, which have been on the 
Rental Shelf as soon as they are paid 
for, are placed on the shelf above the 
Magazine Shelves for the convenience 
of patrons who have read all the 
books in our book stacks. 

The umbrella table has been placed 
in the hall for umbrellas, packages, 
and hats. 

The following books have been 
presented to the Library by one of 
Yale's Friends, who has preferred to 
make the gift through the University 
and as an anonymous one:— 

"Up and Down California, 1860-
1864." The Journal of William H. 
Brewer, Edited by Francis P. Far-
quhar. 

"Lambert Wickes, Sea Raider and 
Diplomat." The Sfcory of a Naval 
Captain of the Revolution, by Wil­
liam Bell Clark. 

"Tsar of Freedom." The Life and 
Reign of Alexander II, by Stephen 
Graham. 

"The Savage Hits Back." By Julius 
Lips. 

Garden Gossip 
Editaal by CuoliM_ Harrington 

Letters and qutitlona on garden 
toplca will be welcome. They will 
be published and discussed in this 
column. 

Now that the frutt trees -are shak­
ing out their buds, it is time to spray, 
and spray we must if we would pro­
tect our fruit crops from insect and 
nther pests, but let's remember that 
not all insects are destructive. Much 
plant life has been developed by 
means ofv>the insects acting in part­
nership With it; Think of how much 
the bee contributes to our way of 
life! Not only does it supply us with 
honey, Ifut it poilirtates our fruit 
trees, our grasses; and our flowers, 
an infinitely greater service than the 
gift of honey. Buckwheat honey 
means more than just honey for your 
pancakes, it means the buckwheat 
for them, too. Clover honey means 
that the important clover crop will 
reproduce itself, and here, too, the 
clumsy, supposeldy; idle bumblebee 
helps out. If, suddenly, something 
were to destroy all the Mayflies (they 
are never described as anything but 
a nuisance) the fish would be greatly 
concerned for May flies are an im­
portant "hatch" In fish diet along 
with the ojher insects which after a 
short life fall back into the waters 
from, whence they came. The com' 
mon ladybug lives in your garden, 
harming nothing but the aphids which 
sap the life of your succulent plants. 
She and the birds, and Mr. Hoptoad, 
work faithfully on three overlapping 
shifts,, destroying the beetles, cut­
worms and plant lice that eat their 
way through your garden. And the 
bees see to it that your plants live 
again in seeds to grow another Bum-
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Parks — McBride 

>' Margaret M. Parks, daughter of 
)fr. and Mrs. John Martin, of East 
Jordan, and Robert J. McBride, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Luther McBride, 
were quietly united in marriage 
thursday evening, May 23rd, 1940, 
by the Rev. James'Leitch. The couple 
feft Friday morning for Fort Wayne, 
Ind., where'they Will make their fu­
ture home, the groom being engaged 
in road building Work there. 

WITH THE 
ANTRIM COUNTY 
AGR'L AGENT 

W. Klrkpatrick, Extension Agent 

4-H POTATO CLUB ORGANIZED 
AT ELLSWORTH 

. Seven boys living in the vicinity of 
Ellsworth met recently at the home of 
£ud Chellis with the County Agri­
cultural Agent, Walter- G. Kirkpat-
rtck, and organized a 4-H Potato 
Club. "Ellsworth Potato Growers" 
fcas chosen as the name for the Club. 
Bernard Best is the local leader. 

Members in the Club are Bud Chel-
fes, Harvey DeGrrfot, Peter G. Hen-
hip, Peter John Hehnip, Abel Van-
Btedum, Billy Best, and Bernard 
feest. From one-half to an acre of Po­
tatoes will be grown by each boy. Ap­
proved practices such as are used by 
Certified Seed Growers were adopted 
for use by the Club. It is expectd that 
hext year Certified Seed Potatoes will 
be grown by each member. As Club 
activities, it is planned that each in­
dividual will exhibit at the Potato 
Show as well as the group making a 
Club exhibit. A Club Potato Judging 
team is also contemplated. 

GARDENER'S CALENDAR 
By Lillian Brabant 

May 20th: Put up a plant box. 
Cleaned under evergreens. 

May 21st: Pulled quack grass from 
perennial bed. 

May 22nd: Sowed petunia seed. 
May 23rd: Pulled quack grass 

from around English daisies. 
May 24th: Sowed gourd seed Mrs. 

L̂  Duffy gave me. 
May 25th: Sowed balcony petun­

ias. / 

W. P. A. Hold Open House 
Week In East Jordan 

The open house week of the pro­
fessional and service branch of the 
WPA closed Saturday night with a 
very successful week. Many visitors 
attended the procedure of the work. 

The week was opened by a fish din­
ner held in the High School, Monday 
night, for the purpose of acquainting 
the public with the six projects with­
in our city. Dinner was served to 170 
people, following the dinner an en­
joyable program was given. 

A' J. Warne Davis, who is a foreman 
of the Guide Project, acted as chair­
man of the meeting, and later turned 
the meeting over to Toastmaster Hec­
tor McKinnon, who needed no intro­
duction. .Several musical numbers 
were given. The showing of several 
slide pictures by Dr. Beuker were en­
joyed very much. The evening closed 
with the singing of "God Bless Am­
erica." 

The closing of Open House Week 
does not close our Guide Project to 
visitors, who are always velcome" to 
visit our headquarters on the island, 
formerly known as the Sportsmen's 
Club. 

o 

South Arm Township 
Board of Review 

Apostle Edwards To 
Speak Here 

This Friday Night 

Apostle F. Henry Edwards will de 
liver a sermon at the Latter Day 
Saints church here this Friday night, 
May 31st, commencing at 8:00 o'­
clock. The public is cordially invi­
ted to attend. 

East Jordan Rotarians will remem­
ber him as'giving a talk to that or­
ganization at one of their weekly 
meetings laBt August. 

"And because the breath of flow­
ers is far sweeter in the air (where 
it comes and goes, like.the warbling 
of music) than in the hand, therefore 
nothing is more fit for that delight 
than to know what be the flowers and 
plants that do best perfume the air." 
So says Bacon, the essayist, and he 
names the flowers which "yield the 
sweetest smell in the air," as follows: 
First, the white double violet, next 
the musk rose, and then sweet briar, 
wall flower, pinks and carnations, 
honeysuckle. He also speaks of the 
fragrance of "strawberry-leaves dy­
ing." (I have never noticed this but 
intend to.) To Bacon's list I add 
flowers which perhaps he did not 
know: Evening-scented stock, nico-
tiana, mignonette, and white petun< 
ias. With the exception of the mig­
nonette, these flowers are fragrant 
only after dark when the night fly­
ing insects are on the wing. It is 
these, insects that pollinate the night-
fragrant flowers which usually are 
white or nearly white. 

GRASSHOPPER BAIT SIGN-UP 
NOW IN PROGRESS 

Supervisors in the various Town­
ships of Antrim County jire comple­
ting the Annual Survey of farmer 
intentions to use Poison Bait for the 
control of this pest in-Antrim Coun­
ty during the coming summer. 

In order for Antrim County to get 
Vadtarai asefetance in this program, it 
is necessary every spring for farm­
ers desirous of obtaining poison bait, 
for the control of this pest, to apply 
for such bait through their local 
Township Supervisors. 

Application for sufficient poison 
bait to control the pests on, all their 
tillable, pasture, and cut-over lands 
that may have Grasshoppers, later in 
the season is ma~de by every farmer 
wanting to receive County assistance. 
Poisoned baiting materials are fur­
nished by the Federal Gavernment 
are alloted Counties according to the 
sign-up. 

A recent Grasshopper Egg Survey 
in the County indicates that a very 
serious problem can be expected this 
year if weather conditions are favor­
able. All Antrim farmers who have 
any liklihood of requiring bait are 
urged to apply for such baiting mater­
ials with their local Supervisors at 
once if they have not already done 
so^and thus assure themselves of pro­
tection in case the situation sff^war-
rants it. 

Resolutions of Meguzee 
Association District 

of Northern Michigan 

East Jordan, Michigan, May 15th 
and 16th,'1940.,-. / 

With hearts full of gratitude for 
this past year with its many blessings 
and the opportunity it has brought to 
us for serving |he Order of the East­
ern Star in tKis wonderful State and 
Country, we approach our 37th An­
nual Meguzee Association meeting. 

We hereby resolve to expend our, 
thanks to :— 

The sisters and brothers of Mark 
Chapter, No. 275, who* so kindly ex­
tended to us the invitation to meet 
with them in 1940, to those who op­
ened their homes and for their won­
derful hospitality; 

To the citizens of East Jordan for 
their cooperation with Mark Chapter 
in helping to make our stay more 
pleasant while in their city. 

To Mr, Drew, theatre manager, for 
the uses of the TempleRoof for our 
Wednesday irieetjngs and to the 
School Board for the use of the Gym­
nasium for the banquet. 

To the East Jordan Lumber Com­
pany who so generously loaned and 
trucked the lumber used for the stage 
at the Temple Roof. 

To the various committees and to 
the General Chairman, Helen Cohn, 
and Worthy Matron, Lorene Wade 
for their untiring efforts to make this 
such a successful meeting; to those, 
not members of the Order, who as­
sisted in the programs or in other 
ways, and to the members who fur­
nished the splendid music. 

To the Jordan Inn for their de­
lightful luncheons and .to the Metho­
dist Ladies' Aid Society for the most 
splendid banquet, served in the Gym­
nasium. 
' To Sister Laura Courier for con­
ducting these Meguzee Association 
meetings so graciously and for her 
pleasing personality which we so 
greatly enjoyed. 

To our Worthy Grand Matron, Eth­
el Koronski for her efforts to attend 
our Meguzee sessions and for the in­
spiring message she gave to us. 

We thank all our Grand and Past 
Grand Officers for their presence and 
messages. — 

Resolved that these resolutions be 
included in the Minutes of the 37th 
annual session of Meguzee Associa­
tion and that a copy be sent to the 
local paper for publication. 

Signed: 
Clara Johnson 
Ruth McCarty 
Muriel Jensen. 

Pershing Urges Aid 
To Red Cross 

ASKS AMERICANS TO HELP TO 
ALLEVIATE WAR HORRORS 

Gen. John J. Pershing urged every 
"patriotic and sympathetic" Ameri­
can to support the Red Cross drive 
for a $10,000,000 war relief fund. 

In his second public announce­
ment relating to the conflict abroad, 
the 79-year-old commander of tho 
AEF in the last World war, said: 

"Only two decades;ago thousands 
of our best men gave their lives in the 
hope that the world would never re­
sort to war again. , , 

"The ever-lengthening trail of suf­
fering and misery which invading ar­
mies are now leaving behind them in 
Europe has blasted all our hopes. 

"There is one thing which all Am­
ericans can do now, and that is to 
unite to alleviate the horrors of war 
for the civilians of the stricken na­
tions." 

The State Bank of East Jordan 
will accept your gift, record it, and 
forward it to the National Red Cross 
Headquarters, for immediate distri­
bution through our own agent in the 
stricken countries who will see that 
the money is used only for the pur­
poses for which you intend it. 

o 

Former School Band 
. Members To Playln 

Band This Summer 

If they want to, all musicians who 
have an instrument of their own, are 
asked to join our school band this 
summer and come to their rehearsals 
which will be on Monday evenings, 
from 8:00 until 9:30 o'clock, start­
ing next Monday, June 3. 

o 

Announces Plans 
For Dairy Month 

Council Proceedings 

Notice is hereby given that the 
meeting of the Board of Review of 
South Arm Township will be held at 
the Township Hall on Monday and 
Tuesday, June 10th and 11th, 1940. 

CAL J. BENNETT, Supervisor,. 
»dv22-2 

Adjourned Regular Meeting, held 
.n the 24th day of May 1940, of the 
Common Council, City of East Jor­
dan. 

Present: Aldermen Sinclair, Mal-
pass, Shaw and Mayor Healey. 

Absent: Aldermen Bussler, Mad 
dock and Kenny. 

The following resolution was offer­
ed by Alderman Sinclair, who moved 
its adoption, seconded by Alderman 
Malpass, that the sum of $14,046.-
20 be raised on the real and person-
til property of the City of East Jor­
dan for t,he year of 1940, and that 
the sum 6t $1,000.00 be used for the 
Cemetery, $1,000.00 for Parks, $1-,-
000.00 for Library, $1,000.00 for 
Are, $1,600.00 for Police, $3,000.00 
for WPA and $5,446.20 for general 
purposes. 

Moved to adjourn. 
WM. ALDRIOH, City Clerk. 

Mrs. Phillips made me very wel­
come when I walked over to visit her 
garden now bright with tulips in ev­
ery color and shade against shrub­
bery which also shelters iris just rea­
dy to burst into bloom. I suggest that 
you make a point of seeing this gar­
den, so well arranged around a fine 
lawn, and planned BO as to make the 
best possible use of the yard space 
from the standpoint of convenience 
and effectiveness. Mrs. Phillips haB 
made a study of succession of bloom, 
with the accent on perennials. She is 
especially enthusiastic about her veg­
etable garden beyond the pergola, 
and screen by a hedge, where be­
sides vegetables she has ' recently 
planted strawberries and has little 
fruit trees in bloom. Mrs. Phillips did 
not say so, but I feel sure her garden 
!s the result of much thoughtful plan 
ning over happy years of work and 
play. 

ANTRIM TO BE HOST FOR HUGE 
NORTHERN MICHIGAN FARM 

ELECTRIC SHOW 
The farm of C. N. Powell, one-half 

mile South of Torch Lake Village on 
U. S. 31 has been selected as the 
place for the staging of a huge Farm 
and Home Electricity Show on Thurs­
day and Friday, June 20 and 21, ac­
cording to Walter G. Kirkpatrick, 
County Agricultural Agent. 

This big free demonstration will 
show electricity in use in many of 
the more than two hundred approved 
Farm and Home uses. One can see in 
tactual operation electricity in use 
grinding feed, refrigerating, poultry 
lighting, electricity in the dairy, its 
use in the bathroom, cooking, ensil­
age cutting, water supplies, garden 

Canadian Evangelist 
Brings Stirring"Messages 

The Evangelistic services now in 
progres at the local Mennonite Breth­
ren in Christ Church is well under 
way. Rev. Wm. Yates, Canadian 
evangelist, has nightly stirred his au­
diences by his plain preaching and 
convincing logic. Rev. Yates is a man 
of wide experience and pleasing per­
sonality. His messages, though plain, 
are sound and thought provoking. 

Friday evening, June 7, a special 
and intensely interesting service will 
be held for all young people. Every 
young person in the city is urged to 
attend. Also a very special invitation 
is extended to the graduating class of 
1940. 

Services will continue every even­
ing at 7:45 throughout this week and 
next. The public is cordially invited 
to attend all of these meetings. 

dwindling race of red trilliums. The 
specimen shown at Garden Club was 
sent by Mrs. Walter Davis who found 
a clump of the rare flowers near here. 

Try HornM Waal A * — TWr CU* 

The Weather Man did not cooper­
ate so we could not have our display 
of tulips,at Garden Club meeting last 
week, but the day was saved by a 
handful of tulips which decorated the 
tea" table. They came as representa­
tives of the lovely and very early 
blooming tulips in Mrs. Roscoe Mack-
ey's garden. 

Red trillium, also known as Wak« 
Robin or Birthroot, grows on the 
North American continent from No­
va Scotia to Ontario and Michigan, 
and south to North Carolina and Ten­
nessee, but it does not grow abund­
antly so when you find it^pare it to 
seed and 10 preserve the steadily 

Says one of Her neighbors. "When 
it was crocus time, I thought there 
was nothing in Mrs. Edith Carr's yard 
but crocuses. They seemed to be ev­
erywhere. Then one morning I look­
ed out, and where the crocuses had 
been I saw hyacinths, daffodils and 
jonquils. Now that these have faded, 
like magic the tulips are crowding in 
to take their places. It is a beautiful 
sight." 

Mrs. Vo^ruba was interrupted as 
she stood in her garden counting tu­
lips. "There are nearer 3000 than 
the 1300 reported last week in Gar­
den Gossip," she said. And then, mod­
estly, she added, "But maybe you'd 
better not gay too much about it." 
We do not need to "say much" —. the 
tulipt apeak for themselves. 

irrigation, lighting, farm workshop, 
and many other demonstrations put­
ting it to actual use. 

D. G. Ebinger, Extension Specialist 
in Rural Electrification, and Miss Hel­
en Noyes, Extension Specialist in 
Home Economics, both of Michigan 
State College, will be present to give 
talks and demonstrate some of elec­
tricity's many uses. There will also 
be a number of other specialists in at­
tendance. 

All present and future users of el­
ectricity both farm and village will 
want to attent this big free show. 
Large tents will be placed in which 
meetings will be held. 

The Top O'Michigan and the Cher-
ryland Rural Electrification Co-op­
eratives along with many local deal­
ers of electrical equipment are co­
operating in the sponsoring of this 
mammouth show which will attract 
visitors from eight Counties — An­
trim, Charlevoix, Emmet, Otsego, 
Kalkaska, Grand Traverse, Benzie, 
and Leelanau. Also, all.County Agri­
cultural Agents in the eight Counties 
are cooperating. 

These two cooperatives alone ser­
vice in the neighborhood of twenty 
Ave hundred families. In addition, the 
hundreds of other families in these 
Counties that are being serviced; by 
Public Utilities and municipal owned 
plants insures this show of an ex­
tremely large attendance. 

Deserved homage to the foster-mo­
ther of the human race •— the dairy 
cow —- will be among the -highlights 
of Dairy Month to be observed in 
Michigan arid throughout the nation 
during June, says A. C. Baltzer, Mich­
igan State College extension dairy­
man. 

During this period numerous na­
tional dairy organizations, both com­
mercial and educational, will spon­
sor efforts to increase public appre­
ciation of the health-giving proper­
ties of milk, butter, cheese, and ice 
cream. 

Among the services contributed by 
the dairy cow, in addition to her ob­
vious function of milk production, is 
that of helping to, maintain soil fer­
tility not only through manure but 
indirectly through the vast quanti­
ties of soil-maintaining crops grown 
for her consumption, explains Balt­
zer. «. 

He cites the record of a Berrien 
county registered Holstein cow, now 
in her ninth lactation period. This 
11-year-old cow, Marie, in the Doan 
Straub herd at Galien, Mich., has pro- • 
dueed a total of 161,044 pounds or 
80½ tons of milk, containing more 
than 3 tons of butterfat. Soil fertil­
ity has been conserved by the animal 
in that 27 tons alfalfa, 19 tons sil­
age, and 20 tons of grain have been 
consumed on the farm plus 2,000 
days of pasture in the last 10 years 
and 20 teas of bedding, leaving a re­
sidual manurial value on the farm 
totaling more than 90 tons. 

The milk production of Marie, ac­
cording to Baltzer, would be suffi­
cient to supply all boys and girls in 
the Detroit public schools with a pint 
for one day or it would provide for a 
five-person family a pint each for the 
two adults and a quart each for the 
three children for more than 40,000 
days or 110 years. 

Jack Benny At Temple 

All Star Week should be the head­
ing of this item for a glance at the 
Temple announcement informed us 
that Gene Autry, Jane Withers, Jack 
Benny, Roy Rogers, Lew Ayres, Andy 
Devine and Lionel Barrymore aTe all 
competing for honors in this enter­
tainment packed week. 

Saturday: Roy Rogers, Mary Hart, 
Russell "Gabby" Hayes in* "South­
ward Ho." 

Sunday, Monday: Jane Withers and 
Gene Autry in "Shooting High." New 
Crime Doesn't Pay subject, Sport-
light, Lew Lehr Comedy, News. 

Tues., Wed., Family Nites: Lew 
Ayres and Lionel Barrymore in "Dr. 
Kildares Strange Case." 

Thur., Friday: Jack Benny, Andy 
Devine, Rochester, Ellen Drew, Phil 
Harris in "Buck Benny Rides Again." 

• o 

Trilling Cott, Small Spac*, Bat 
Powor To Da Almost Anything — 
W « t Ad.. 
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CHAPTER XIX—Continued. 
- 1 7 - .1 

"I'll talk English to His Highness," 
said Rundhia. "The old sheep shall 
do one useful thing before he dies. 
You have the poison ready?" 

"Yes, but this is a crisis," the 
Bengali answered. "Are you in a 
fit condition to control a crisis? To 
me, you seem very nervous. Let 
m e feel your heart-beat. Why not 
postpone this until- tomorrow?" 

"Because tomorrow the old sheep 
might change his will. I've had a 
warning from the Resident. By the 
day after, tomorrow, they might al­
ready have vetoed m y succession 
to the throne. If he's already dead 
they'll let m e succeed, to save them­
selves trouble. So poison the old 
sheep tonight, and take your money 
and. go to the devil. I hope I never 
see you again. If you fail. I'll take 
damned good care you hang!" 

"There is no risk of failure, un­
less you are too excited and behave 
suspiciously." 

"Yes, there i s ," said Rundhia. 
"You do as I tell you. Be a little 
late with his tonic, so that he drinks 
it greedily. I'm going in to see him 
now. After I come out, you wait 
until someone else goes in to see 
him." 

"But if no one goes?" 
"I will take care that someone 

does go. If you give it to him in 
someone else's presence, it will look 
more innocent. . Will he be able to 
speak after he drinks i t?" 

"No. It will paralyze his nerves 
immediately," 

"How long will it take him to 
die?" 

"Perhaps ten minutes. Perhaps 
less. It will appear to be heart 
failure." 

"Very well then. Where's your 
needle? Give me a strong shot." 

"No. Not too strong. You must 
not get the habit. After this, you 
will need your faculties and self-
control, if we are not to be found 
out. I will give you just sufficient 
to steady your nerves ." 

The Maharajah stared, noted the 
expression on Rundhia's face when 
he entered the room anti-made a 
warning gesture toward the Punjabi 
stamp salesman, 

"Can he understand English?" 
Rundhia demanded. 

"I believe not." 
"Well, I will speak English. If 

he does understand it, it won't much 
matter. I want you to call up the 
Resident and demand the immedi­
ate arrest of Captain Norwood!" 

"Why?" asked the Maharajah. 
"He has not only taken a bribe 

from the priests, as you already 
know—" 

"I have heard it said." 
"You know it's true. And now he 

has assaulted me. He knocked m e 
out with a.punch in the face." 

"Were you drunk?" asked the Ma­
harajah. And, before Rundhia could 
answer: "It would be beneath my 
dignity to ask the Resident to take 
official cognizance of a braw! be­
tween two drunkards." 

CHAPTER XX 

Lynn changed from the Indian cos­
tume. She entered the Maharanee's 
boudoir in a chiffon evening gown. 

"Please don't get up, Maharanee 
dear. You treat me as if I were 
royalty and you a subject or some­
thing." 

"Why did you change your dress, 
Lynn? You looked so charming in—" 

"Oh, this dress feels more honest 
somehow. I mean more like my 
real colors. Maharanee dear, I'm 
afraid I'm all upset. I'm not fit to 
talk to." 

"Lynn dear, what has happened?" 
"Rundhia made love to me, and I 

wasn't even polite to him. Captain 
Norwood came, and punched Run­
dhia—he knocked him off the wall. 
I thought he had killed him. Oh, 
why do I keep on getting other peo­
ple into trouble!" 

The Maharanee's worried face 
seemed to age under Lynn's eyes : 

"Lynn, did he hurt Rundhia bad­
ly?" 

"No, I think not. Rundhia walked 
away." 

"Did you speak to Captain Nor-
wqod?" 

"Yes, I insulted him. I did it 
thoroughly. I suppose I shouldn't 
have, since it was I who injured 
him. But I couldn't help it. He 
tore up my letter, so I tore up his. 
I am not meek by nature. I'm not 
good at pretending." 

"And Rundhia wasn't hurt? You 
are sure?" 

"Captain Norwood went down off 
the wall to look. It wasn't long be­
fore Rundhia walked away. I don't 
know why he didn't come back and 
face Captain Norwood, but perhaps 
he was too stunned by being knocked 
off the wall. Rundhia didn't behave 
very well ." 

"He needs you, Lynn." 
Lynn laughed—bitter—contemptu­

ous: "Needs me? I need a friend. 
Rundhia. i s—" 

"Be strong," said the Maharanee. 
"I a m your friend." 

"Yes , b l e n you! Rundhia seemed 
strong," Lynn said. "And he talked 
like a perfect lover. I had almost 
feetfun to believe be cae lave. And 

then something happened. There 
Was shooting—perhaps nothing im­
portant—I don't know. I asked Run­
dhia, and I thought he was lying 
when he said he didn't know. After 
that—it was quite sudden—I didn't 
believe in him any longer. I can't 
explain it. Then Captain Norwood 
came." 

A servant entered. He announced 
that Prince Rundhia was waiting. 

"Lynn, will you see h im?" 
"Not alone," Lynn answered. 
The Maharanee thought a minute: 

"It is against precedent, against 
custom. Lynn dear, will you be 
shocked if I ask Rundhia to come m 
here to talk to us?" 

Lynn found a smile. "I-suppose 
you're afraid he might brag! Let's 
risk that. I won't tell." 

Rundhia strode in. He stood stock-
still in the center of the room. He 
Was wearing a blood-red turban and 
dinner jacket. He looked like the 
real Rundhia again. Easy to imag­
ine him horsed anoVriding hard at 
an enemy. He gazed at Lynn a mo­
ment, then at the Maharanee: 

"Has Lynn told you?" he asked. 
"Yes, Rundhia. What did you do 

to make Captain Norwood strike 
you?" 

Rundhia tossed his head* He 
looked like a man when he did that. 

"Lynn saw. Lynn heard," he an­
swered. "I went at once and de-

"Lynn dear, what has 
happened?" 

manded Norwood's arrest. His High­
ness your husband, my revered and 
beloved uncle, refused. Lynn must 
decide." 

"Decide what?" Lynn asked. 
Rundhia looked strangely at her. 

"Does he live or die? It was be­
cause you were there that Norwood 
struck me. I hadn'C offered to strike 
him. There is only one possible re­
tort to that insult—unless you for­
bid. That is what you must decide 
now. Lynn, I have offered you my 
heart and the throne of Kadur. 
What is your answer?" 

"Lynn," said the Maharanee—and 
stopped speaking. 

There was a knock at the door A 
servant entered: 
' "Captain Norwood sahib! He 
waits. He begs leave to speak to 
Her Highness the Maharanee. Cap­
tain Norwood says his business is 
very urgent." 

"I will not see Captain Norwood," 
said the Maharanee. "This is no 
hour for me to receive him." She 
stared at Rundhia. Then, slowly, to 
the servant: "Tell Captain Norwood 
he should ask for His Highness my 
husband. I will send word to His 
Highness, asking him to receive 
Captain Norwood." 

The servant vanished. 
-Lynn got up out of her chair. She 

looked desperate but perfectly calm. 
"Lynn darling," said the Maha­

ranee. 
Rundhia interrupted: "Norwood's 

fate is in your hands. I will do any­
thing for you—if—" 

"If what, Rundhia?" 
"If you accept my love." 
"I don't love you," she answered. 
"Accept my love. My love will 

make you love m e ! " 
"If not?" Lynn asked. 
"I will kill Norwood. After that, 

I will let happen what may. If my 
love means nothing, I will trample 
it into oblivion. Yes or no, Lynn?" 

"Rundhia." Lynn's voice was as 
quiet and controlled as if she were 
facing death. "The barrier between 
you and m e is your laugh when you 
boasted of Captain Norwood's ruin. 
You promised; m e that you would 
do your best to clear him. Did you?" 

"No," said Rundhia. "But if you 
will marry me , I will. I will accept 
your promise. I don't believe you 
know how to break one. I will keep 
mine." 

"Rundhia," said Lynn, "I will 
promise to marry you, if you will 
write, and sign, a retraction of any 
and all' accusations against Captain 
Norwood. You must put it in the 
form of • letter to the British Resi­
dent, and it must be witnessed by 
the Maharanee and the Maharajah. 

You must meet Captain Norwood in 
m y presence, and the Mahara­
nee's, and you must say to him per­
sonally that you withdraw. I won't 
ask you to beg his pardon, because 
I won't do that. I won't speak to 
him. But I insist on your behaving 
like a man." 

The Maharanee spoke suddenly 
with a ring of command in her 
voice: 

"Rundhia, go to the table and 
write!" 

Rundhia went to the table. Lynn 
sat down beside the Maharanee: 

"Maharanee dear, you must be 
my wise friend, for I am all in the 
dark. I Me] so western and so lone­
ly, and I don't know whether I am 
doing right or wrong. But I will 
do my best." 

"Lynn—" 
Lynn interrupted her: "Will you 

make m e a promise? Will you nev­
er, never tell Captain Norwood why 
I married Rundhia? Will you keep 
it a secret?" 

The Maharanee w a s silent for 
nearly a minute. She was riot quite 
dry-eyed. She spoke suddenly, low-
voiced: 

"Lynn, do you love Captain Nor­
wood?" 

"Maharanee dear. T~have prom­
ised to marry Rundhia." 

CHAPTER XXI 

Norwood stood stock-still, beneath 
a Tibetan devil-mask, between two 
suits of ancient Indian armor. He 
had sent up his card to the Maha­
ranee with a request for an imme­
diate interview. It was an outra­
geous request, and he knew it. The 
palace chamberlain approached 
him, stared—stared harder—hesitat­
ed, and then: 

"Captain Norwood? We had heard 
you are dead!" 

"Yes. I have been wondering who 
is sorry I'm not dead. Has the Ma­
harajah heard i t?" 

"No, I believe not. He is rather 
inaccessible this evening. And it 
was only a" rumor, unconfirmed yet. 
It was thought best not to mention 
it to him prematurely. May I con­
gratulate you on your escape. It 
was said that criminals attacked, 
your camp. I am sincerely—" 

"Thanks." 
"Your business at the palace? I 

think the Maharajah might be 
pleased to see you. He has a docu­
ment—" 

"I have asked to see the Maha­
ranee." 

"Oh, impossible! Captain Nor­
wood, please. • We have been very 
unconventional of late, but—" 

"Here comes the servant," said 
Norwood. 

The servant delivered his mes­
sage: the chamberlain accompanied 
Norwood upstairs as far as the ante­
room that led into the Maharajah's 
study: 

"I am sure His Highness will be 
glad to see you, because of that new 
document he has discovered. The at­
tendant in the anteroom will an­
nounce you. Hee-hee! You may be­
lieve it or not, but I wouldn't dare 
to do it. 

"Don't mention my name," said 
Norwood. 

"I wouldn't think of it. The doc­
tor and I are not cronies. I will 
simply say someone went in. I be­
lieve you will be admitted. His 
Highness spoke of you. I think he 
really wants to see you." 

The chamberlain left him. Nor­
wood was announced. The Punjabi 
stamp salesman was dismissed, 
smiling as if he had done good busi­
ness. The door closed, and Nor­
wood was alone with the Mahara­
jah. 

At last the Maharajah spoke: "I 
am pleased to receive you, Captain 
Norwood, even though the hour is 
unusual. You came to speak to me 
about the—ah—boundary dispute? I 

have news'. Since I saw you, m y 
secretary has found a document 
which seems to m e to make the 
priests' case so ridiculous that—" 

"Oh, I expect to find in the favor 
of the priests, Your Highness. Those 
documents may interest lawyers. I 
am only concerned with the bound­
ary line. I have been accused of 
accepting a bribe from the 
priests—" 

"Oh! Captain Norwood, you aston­
ish me. Who is your accuser?" 

"I supposed you already knew. He 
will tell you. As a matter of fact, I 
called on Her Highness the Mahara­
nee. I want to speak to Miss Lynn 
Harding. I have reason to believe 
that without the Maharanee's advice 
she might refuse to see m e until 
perhaps tomorrow. I need to see 
her tonight. I hoped to' persuade 
the Maharanee to arrange the inter­
view, but she refused, so I came to 
you instead." 

"Is it urgent? Won't you please be 
seated? Won't you read this docu­
ment?" 

"Your Highness, do you think I 
would disturb you at thta time of 
night if it wasn't urgent!" 

"Oh, well, possibly an interview 
can be arranged. I will enquire 
presently. Won't yoti read %that doc­
ument?" 

Norwood smiled agreeably: "1 
will. As you have reason to know, 
sir, I'm a bit slow at reading this 
ancient script." 

"I wouldn't care to let that out of 
m y possession," said the Mahara­
jah. 

"Suits me ," Norwood answered. 
"I ask nothing better than to sit 
here for the time being. You will 
learn why, later;" 

The Maharajah looked up sharply,, 
but Norwood raised the document 
between them. He couldn't see Nor­
wood's face: 

"You flatter me ," he said after a 
moment. 

At last came a knock at the door. 
The Maharajah tapped the gong 
with his fingers and the Bengali doc­
tor entered, making his suavest pro­
fessional bow. He was followed by 
the Maharajah's personal attendant, 

""carrying a big blue goblet on a Sil­
ver tray. The Bengali eyed Nor­
wood with horror. 

"You are late," said the Mahara­
jah. "Why are you late?" 

"I was delayed, your Highness. 
I—" 

Norwood had laid down the docu­
ment. He rose from his chair. He 
stepped behind the Bengali. He held 
his right fist ready for emergency 
and seized,the goblet in his left hand. 
The Bengali stepped back, out of 
reach of the fist. The Maharajah 
made a sudden exclamation, not un­
like a sheep's bleat, The white-clad 
servant backed away, showing the 
whites of his eyes. Norwood held 
the goblet toward the Bengali: 

"Drink it!" he commanded. 
The Bengali was speechless, ft 

was several seconds before he could 
s tammer: "Sir, are you mad?" 

The Maharajah, with his elbows 
on the desk, and one hand within 
reach of the drumstick of the golden 
gong, leaned forward, staring. 

Norwood spoke again quite calm­
ly. But it was a deadly calm. It 
frightened the Bengali: 

"You are, aren't you, the doctor 
who poisoned Mrs. Harding's 
toast?" 

"Sir, beware whom you slander!" 
The Bengali appealed to.the Maha­
rajah: "Is Your Highness pleased 
to hear me slandered by a mad­
man who is known to have been 
bribed by—'.' 

Norwood interrupted: "Cut thatl 
You heard me. Drink it!" 

"That is His Highness' tonic." 
"Drink it!" said the Maharajah. 

He looked -almost happy. He sound­
ed quite calm. But his fingernails 
drummed on the desk. Not a sign 
of humor. 

(TO BE CONTINVED) 

'Algae' Worry Scientists Seeking Pure Water Supply 

Supplying pure, good-tasting wa­
ter to a modern city has i tsj jps and 
downs. One of the biggest "downs" 
is the sudden appearance of a smell 
or taste suggesting moldy base­
ments, cucumbers, pig pens or long-
dead fishes. This means that algae 
is in the reservoir and instead of 
calling the police, with a drag-net, 
the trouble shooters at the water 
works go hunting with a microscope. 

Algae are the simplest .and most 
ancient forms of plant life. J h e y 
do not bother drinking water as long 
as they behave themselves. Usually 
they are taken care of by filtration 
and other purification. But, like any 
crowd, there is always a sovait aleck 
OT two. That is when the superin­
tendent of tb« "•••seruoir has his wor­
ries. 

Nearly every ctty water system 
that draws its supply from surface 
reservoirs m u s t be guarded" con­
stantly against sudden invasions of 
such algae and their relatives, 
writes Walter E . Burton in Nature 
Magazine. The chemist at the wa­
ter works keeps a rogue's gallery 
of photomicrographs of the offend­
ers. Once they are identified he 

starts in to round them tip—and o u t 
One of the most offensive "algae— 

Reservoir Enemy No. 1—is Synurit 
Uvella. He is a two-tailed creature 
that likes to travel in gangs of 60 
or so. Such a bunch, magnified 60S 
times, makes a spot' about the sizt 
of a quarter. Three of these gang* 
in a-- gallon of water will make it 
taste pretty awful—some say like 
geraniums; others like dead flsh. 
Synura loves the cold, so is specially 
offensive in winter. 

Anabaena is good-looking algae— 
under the microscope—with cells ar­
ranged in graceful curlicues. How­
ever, it creates an odor and taste 
described as "grassy, moldy and 
vile." Asterionella adds the delight­
ful touch of a pig-pen odor to the 
reservoir water, and it, too, is pret­
ty,, with ,its cells arranged like a 
star. 

These and other public water ene­
mies are one reason why you Have a 
wateT bill to pay. Just as you need 
a police department to protect you, 
so you need the-men at the water 
works, particularly the : trained 
chemists, to keep the water pure 
and tasty. 
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EPARTH ENT 
and a ribbon belt .to call attention 
to the fact! 

This is a lovely style not only for' 
prints, but for sheers like geor­
gette and chiffon, in c lass ic navy 
or black. It's an easy design to 
make , and includes a step-by-step 
sew chart. 

Barbara Bell Pattern No. I923-B 
is designed for sizes 12, 14, 16, 18, 
20 and 40. Corresponding bust 
measurements 30, 32, 34, 36, 38 
and 40, Size 14 (32) requires 3 ¾ 
yards of 39-inch material without 
nap; 1¾ yards of ribbon for belt. 

T J E R E ' s a charming way to 
A •* m a k e your silk print for after­
noon, and it's not too dressy for 
general wear, either. Everything 
about it is soft and graceful—the 
rippling skirt, the shoulder shir­
ring that co-operates with waist­
line tucks to make your bust look 
prettily rounded, and the plain v-
neckline that you can vary, with 
Howers, brooches or white lingerie 
touches Pattern No. 1923-B has 
a delightfully tiny-waisted effect, 

SEWING CIRCLE PATTERN DEPT. 
Room 1324 

211 W. Wicker Dr. Chlcaio 
Enclose 15 cents in coins for 

Pattern No Size 
Name 
Address 

Justice in Rebellion 
Men seldom, or rather never , 

for a length of t ime and delib­
erately, rebel \ .against anything 
that does not deserve rebelling 
against.—Carlyle. 

No child can be sore 
to escape 

BOWEL WORMS 
Maybe you ddn'tfreailie how easy It fi for 
youngsters to become infected with-round -
worms.witbout their parents even-knowing 
Ml Your child may catch" the infection 
from other' children, from a dog, from un- . 
cooked vegetables, from infested water. 

So, watch out for these warning signals: 
Uneasy:stoznach. Fidgeting and squirming. 
Itchynose and other parts, finicky appe­
tite. Biting nails. And if you even suspect 
that your child has. round -worms, start 
using JXrav's VSBHIJ-UQH alohcel 

JATKVB VKHMIFUOE is the best known 
remedy la America for expelling round' 
worms. It has been used by millions of 
mothers, for over a century, and is backed' 
by the most modern scientific study. 

JATNI'S VEBmmox has great ability to 
drive out large round worms, yet it tastes 
5:ood and acts gentiy. If there art r\o worm* 
1 works merely,as a mild laxative. Ask for 

"JATNJB'B VBE-UI-FCGB." 

Holding the Virtues 
Moderation i s the silken string 

running through the pearl chain 
of all virtues.'-^FuIleri • 

HOMER BERRY, veterair test pilot, says: 

SPEED-FLYING is 
/v»y BUSINESS, -

BUT I SMOKE THE 
SIOWSR-BURNIHG 
CIGARETTE, CAMELS-
FOR EXTRA MILDNESS, | 

EXTRA COOLNESS, 
•• AND EXTRA 

SMOKING! 
w^-jjp- T 

In recent laboratory tests , 
CAMELS burned 25% s low­
er than the average of the 
I S other of the-largest-Mll-
Ins brands tested—slower 
than a n y of t h e m . That 
means, on the average, a 
smoking plus equal to 

"^ TEZPACK/ 

FROM 50 to 500 miles per h o u r -
Homer Berry has flown them all. 

This veteran test pilot started flying 4 
back in 1913 . . . started smoking 
Camels the same year. "No other 
cigarette ever gave me anything 
like the pleasure of a Camel," he 
says. "What's'more—in 2(5 years, 
Camel's slower burning has always 
given me a lot of extra smoking." 
Try the slower-burning cigarette 
made from costlier tobaccos . . . 
Camel. Get more pleasure per puff 
and more puffs per pack (see left). 

FOR EXTRA MILDNESS, 

EXTRA COOLNESS, EXTRA FLAVOR -

CAMELS 
SLOW-BURNINO COSTLIER TOBACCOS 

For Their Sakes 
If we would build on a sure foun­

dation in friendship we must love 

our friends for their sakes rather 
than for our own. — Charlotte 
Bronte. 

en^riilSL * 
L«««ti^S«MtlMtRnt*gSUp*iii 

6>it1lakti-»ooiwi«f-ioo(w»wurf 
A thousand thrills await you on this glorious 2 0 0 0 
mile cruise! N e w friends, n e w romance.You'll cruise 
on Lakes Michigan, Huron) Erie and through Geor­
gian Bay, Green Bay, S t Mary's River. Stops at Chi­
cago, Detroit, Cleveland, Bufialo, N. Y. 12 Glorious 
hours at Fashionable Mackinac Island—also Famous 
Niagara Falls. You'll enjoy the luxury of good food 
—staterooms with running water, telephone; deck 
sports, dancing and thrJlUpg floor shows nightly 
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of Chicago. 

(Released by Western Newspaper Union.) 

Lesson for June 2 
Lesion subjects and Scripture texts se­

lected and copyrighted by International 
Council of Religious Education: used by 

TESTING CONDUCT B1 ITS / 
USEFULNESS 

(A Priciple of Temperate Living) 

LESSON TEXT—Ezekiel 15:1-6: Matthew 
5:13-16; 7:16-20, I Corinthians 10:8, 7. 

GOLDEN TEXT—Ye shall know them by 
theW fruits Matthew 7:16. 

Endearing and Enduring Gharm 
Of Quality-Kind Silk Prints 

WHEN YOU'RE PLANNING A MENU ESPECIALLY FOR MEN 
<See Recjpes Below) 

Just between us women, we'll 
have to admit that, if left to his own 
devices, many a man would enjoy 
living on a straight diet of meat, 
potatoes and pie. It requires a lit­
tle judicious scheming.on Mother's 
part to supply Father with his fa­
vorite foods and provide for him a 
wholesome, well-balanced meal in 
the bargain. 

Whether she's planning a menu to 
please the men folk in her family, 
or is chairman of the refreshment 
committee for the May meeting of 
the business men's dub, it's a wise 
Woman who rjemembers—and caters 
to—these masculine foilbles in food. 

Just how do a man's food prefer-
ences differ from those of women? 

Wel l , for one 
t h i n g ! ; a m a n 
wants . ' p l a i n e r , 
more substantial 
food. He likes a 
meal to be com­
posed of only a 
few dishes, but 
he wants those 
few to be tasty, 
full of flavor and 
cooked to a turn. 

And he likes to know just what he's 
eating — he wants none of the 
"masked identity dishes" that defy 
him to find what they're composed 
of. In a word, fancy cooking is 
wasted on the average man, but 4fe 
appreciates good cooking to the 
limit. 

Remember that for most men, 
meat makes the meat; that hot 
breads are a masculine weakness 
that they themselves acknowledge; 
and that for dessert men have a 
special fondness for pie, or choco­
late cake. 

You'll find more suggestions for 
planning masculine menus in my 
booklet, "Feeding Father." There 
are tested recipes, too, for over 125 
of father's favorite foods. 

Hot Muffins. 
2 cups general purpose flour 
3 teaspoons baking powder 
1 teaspoon salt 
2 tablespoons sugar 
I egg 
1 cup milk or water 
2 tablespoons shortening, melted 
Mix and sift dry ingredients,.add 

unbeaten egg, milk or water and 
melted shortening. Mix quickly. 
Pour into well-greased muffin tins, 
and bake in hot oven (450 degrees) 
20 minutes. 

Deep South Ham Sandwich With 
Hot Mushroom Sauce. 

6 pieces corn bread, about 3 
inches square 

6 slices ham, boiled or baked 
Mushroom Sauce: 

1 can condensed cream of mush­
room soup 

% cup milk 

Stir the J/4 cup of milk into'the 
condensed cream of mushroom 
soup. Heat, but 
do not boil. While 
the sauce is heat­
ing, split the 
pieces of corn 
bread and toast 
them. Then place 
the ham between the toasted slices 
of corh bread and pour the hot 
mushroom sauce over the top. 

Note: This is an excellent way to 
utilize' left-Over corn bread. If hot 
corn bread is used, we suggest the 
pieces be split and buttered, but not 
toasted. 

My Best Chocolate Cake. 
2 ounces bitter chocolate 
V* cup butter j[ 
1¾ cups sugar «••> 
3 *ggs • 
2½ cups cake flour 
Vi teaspoon salt 
2 teaspoons baking powder 
1 cup milk 
1 teaspoon vanilla extract 

Melt chocolate carefully over 
warm water. 'Cream butter thor-

: oughly and add sugar slowly. Sepa­
rate eggs, beat egg yolks, and add 
to butter and- sugar mixture. Add 
the melted chocolate. Mix and sift 
together the flour, salt, and; baking 
powder and add alternately with the 
milk and vanilla extract; Beat egg 

• < , 

Next week in this column Elea­
nor Howe will give you some 
clever suggestions for entertain­
ing a June bride. There'll be a 
menu and tested recipes, too, for 
a "Kitchen Shower"—and hints 
on what to give the bride. 

whites until stiff arid fold into the 
cake mixture. Place in 2 well-
greased, 8-inch layer cake pans. 
Bake in a moderate oven (350 de­
grees) for approximately 30 to 35 
minutes. 

Corn Bread. 
(Serves 6-8) 

1½ cups yellow (or white) 
corn meal (uncooked) 

% cup general purpose flour 
4 teaspoons baking powder 
1 teaspoon salt 
1 cup milk 
2 eggs (beaten) 
2 tablespoons fat (melted) 

Sift the corn meal with the flour, 
baking powder and salt. ' 'Combine 
the milk, eggs, and shortening and 
add to the dry ingredients. Bake 
in a well-greased 8-inch square bak­
ing pan, in a moderately hot oven 
(400 degrees) for 40 to 50 minutes. 

Garden Salad Bowl. 
1 head lettuce 
1 cucumber, peeled and sliced 
1 green pepper, cut in thin rings 
3 fresh tomatoes, cut in'wedge-1 

1 shaped pieces 
1 bunch radishes, sliced 
Roquefort cheese dressing 
Prepare and .chill vegetables thor­

oughly: Line salad bowl with large 
crisp leaves of 
lettuce and shred 
remaining lettuce 
rather coarsely: 
Place all vegeta­
bles in salad bowl 
and toss together 
with a well-sea­
soned dressing. 
S e r v e a t once . 

Welsh Rarebit. 
.1 pound sharp American 
2 tablespoons butter 
1 cup cream 
2 eggs 
2 teaspoons Worcestershire sauce 
V% teaspoon paprika 
Salt and pepper to taste 
lk teaspoon dry mustard 
Cut cheese in small pieces and 

place it together with the butter in 
the top of a double boiler. Melt 
slowly. Then add cream, eggs (well 
beaten) and seasonings. Cook, stir­
ring constantly, until mixture has 
thickened. Serve on hot buttered 
toast. 
Noodle and.Tuna Fish Casserole. 

(Serves 8) 
1 8-ounce package noodles 
1 tablespoon salt 
1½ quarts boiling water 
1 7-ounce can tuna fish (drained 

and flaked) 
1 1-pound can cream of mush­

room soup (not condensed) 
2 tablespoons catsup 
1 tablespoon prepared mustard 
xh cup American cheese (grated) 
Cook noodles in boiling water to 

which salt has been added, until 
tender. Drain and rinse thorough­
ly. Place one-half of the noodles in 
buttered casserole, add tuna fish and 
top with remaining noodles. Com­
bine mushroom soup, catsup and 
mustard and heat to boiling point. 
Then pour sauce over noodles in cas­
serole and top with grated cheese. 
Bake in a moderate oven (350 de­
grees) for approximately 35 min­
utes. Garnish with wedges of hard-
cooked egg. 

cheese 

To Please the Men Folk in 
Your Family. 

From the brand new 'bride, to 
grandmother, aren't most of us 
cooking largely to please Father? 

Eleanor Howe's booklet, "Feeding 
Father," is one every homemaker 
needs in her file. It 's full of tested 
recipes for the foods that Father 
likes best—and will give you mascu­
line menu hints, as well. 

Send 10 cents in coin to "Feeding 
.Father/ ' care Eleahor Howe; 919 N, 
Michigan Avenue, Chicago, Illinois, 

(Released by Wester* Newspaper Union.) 

Sound principles are foundational 
to right living. Right living is tem­
perate living. The first temperance 
lesson for the year emphasized the 
sacredness of life. This lesson, 
which is our second one on that 
subject, properly stresses the im- ! 
portance of testing conduct by its | 
true usefulness. | 

The emphasis of modern thinking . 
is upon learning, upon the brilliance ; 
of scientiflp" achievement, with little i 
Or no concern about personal char- | 
acter. Christianity and the Bible go : 
to the root of that matter, stressing ' 
the need of stalwart moral and spir-. 

TtualTjhaxacterr without which other | 
attainments are lacking in real 
value and meaning. Unless what a 
man accomplishes is the expression 
of the greatness of his character, it 
is transient and often detrimental in 
its effect on society. 

Tested by its results, the liquor 
traffic stands conclusively and com­
pletely condemned. Even its own 
frantic efforts, to clean up and be 
more presentable indicates that 
fact. McAlpine made a rather 
acute comment when he said, 

" IF I WERE A LIAR . . . 
I'd advertise beer as a food, 
whisky as the promoter of the 
abundant -life, and cocktails as 
the badge of social correctness. 
They say that if you repeat any 
thing times enough, people will 
believe it." 
The Scripture portions before us 

present five inconsistencies, five in­
stances where fact denies a false 
prdfession. 

I. Wood Without Strength. (Ezek. 
15:1-6)-. 

The branch of a vine is at its best 
too crooked and pliable to be very 
useful, but here we have a piece 
of vine which has been charred in 
the fire until it is so useless that it 
can only be burned up. This is the 
picture of a life, possibly somewhat 
limited in its abilities and gifts, but 

' nevertheless valuable, but made ut­
terly useless by careless or disso­
lute living. How tragic! 

II. Salt Without Savor (Matt. 5: 
13). - • . 

True salt is penetrating, antisep­
tic and purifying, but savorless salt 
is good for nothing but to make a 
road for the feet of men. "Ye are 
the salt of the earth." - Christians, 
if they have the true savor in their 
lives, will count, by their very spir­
itual pugnency, against sin and 
corruption in their comrminities. 

i n . Light Without Illumination 
(Matt. 5:14). 

A light is intended to give illumi­
nation to all around about it. It al­
ways does that thing unless some­
one hides it under a cover, and then 
it becomes not only useless, but 
dangerous. A life lighted by faith 
in Christ will shine to the very ends 
of the earth and, as a missionary 
once said, "The light that shines 
farthest shines brightest at home." 
We are the light of the world, but 
if we cover our light we deny the 
very essence of our natures. Here 
is no thought of proud or selfish dis­
play. Light does not shout about 
itself, it just shines—but it really 
does shine. 

IV. Trees Without Fruit (Matt. 7: 
16-20). 

Every plant brings forth fruit 
after its own nature. We do not 
expect figs from thistles, but we do 
expect figs on the fig tree. The 
countryside bears no more desolate 
figure than a blasted, fruitless fruit 
tree. Quickly the owner cuts it 
down and terminates its shame and 
uselessness by burning it. What 
about men and women? God has 
made them in His own image and 
likeness. He has given them intelli­
gence and personal .ability. He has 
a right to expect the fcuji of a useful 
life from every one, and particu­
larly from the Christian, who is "a 
good tree." 

V. Life Without a Purpose (I Cor. 
10:6, 7). 

Light and salt are inanimate ob­
jects. Trees and vines with their 
wood and fruit are alive, but they 
are without intelligence and moral­
ity. Man, however, as we have 
already suggested, is the moral and 
intelligent crown of God's creation, 
made in His own image and like­
ness. If they who know better, live 
lives of careless indifference, yea 
of outright wickedness, how shall 
they escape the judgment of God in 
the day when they shall stand be­
fore Him to give an account of the 
manner in which they have used 
this precious gift of life? 

By CHERIE NICHOLAS 

FABRICS may come and fabrics 
" may go but ever-lovely, ever-flat­
tering silk prints will live on in 
the affection of the fashion world 
forever. When an unexpected last 
minute invitation bids you hurry and 
join in a bridge party at your neigh­
bors; or a voice over the phone says 
"Meet me in an hour at the club 
for dinner," or your sorority club 
calls tor an impromptu get-together 
luncheon in honor of an unexpected 
out-of-town guest, we'll wager that 
it's the gay little silk print frock 
that answers the momentous what 
to wear question for most women. 

In regard to the three silk prints 
in the illustration, they are decided­
ly pace-setting fashions. Recently 
a second semi-annual fashion semi­
nar was successfully staged by Am-
ena Elliott Webster in Chicago. The 
vast audience at this all-day ses­
sion which drew teachers and stu­
dents in home economics from 
schools and colleges, and members 
of women's clubs and various or­
ganizations from near and far, was 
thrilled with a very style-revealing 
and highly educational number on 
the program "which feature)} "Tex­
tiles Yesterday, Today and Tomor­
row." Included in the fashions that 
went on parade in this noteworthy 
fabric demonstration were the origi­
nals of the modes here pictured 
which, be assured, gives these prints 
of pure silk unquestioned style pres­
tige. 

The high spot about the dress and 
coat ensemble to the right is the fact 
that a bowknot silk crepe fashions it, 
and bowknots, you must know, are 
trenendously important throughout a 
design^this season. If you are in 
quest of a new silk print ask to 
see bowknot patternings. They're 
the latest! The dress features a 
gathered yoke of twin print sheer, 
and the simple coat is a heavier 

weave. The cool-looking frost-white 
jewelry and the wide brim white 
hat confirm the forthstanding impor­
tance of white accents and accesso­
ries. -

When you buy silk print this season 
you do not stop at a mere dress-
length of material but you will want 
to have the fun of fashioning an en­
tire ensemble of gay print, which 
may include not only a matching 
hat, but gloves and parasol made 
of the same print. The biggest news 
of all is shoulder shawls made of 
squares of. silk print finished off 
about the edges with hand knotted 
fringe.. The costume ensemble of 
red and white printed silk crepon, 
to the left, adds a pillbox chapeau 
that is draped with matching crepon. 
Note the finely shirred white silk 
inserts that exquisitely detail the 
bodice top of the dress. Speaking 
of the color scheme of this striking 
costume, too much emphasis cannot 
be given the importance of red and 
white. Red and white prints are 
having a stupendous vogue, and as 
to red hats and gloves, bags, belts 
and red "hankies" watch the reports 
coming in from all style centers! 

Navy silk crepe, in spaced white 
tulip design describes the material 
used for the dress centered in the 
picture. This brings out a very 
important style trend this season in 
silk prints, namely the. two-color 
idea—one single color against a con­
trast color background, such as yel­
low or light green on gray, brown 
on white, or reverse the order, white 
on brown. Which reminds that 
brown prints are ever so smart, 
almost outrivaling navies or grays. 
Sunburst pleating over the bust and 
vertical stitched tucks below the 
waist are important styling details 
observed in the tulip print pictured. 
Here's something interesting in re­
gard to the white straw cartwheel 
she wears—the brim is removable 
leaving a fitted little toque-like shape 
of coarse straw mesh with a flange 
across the back which may be worn 
oh into the evening for informal din­
ner and dancing. 

(Released by Western Newspaper Union.) 

Hats of Fabric 

The Beginning of Wisdom 
He sent redemption unto hia 

people; he hath commanded his 
covenant forever; holy and reverent 
U his name. The fear of the Lord 
1« the beginning of wisdom; a good 
understanding have all they that do 
his commandments; his praise eci-
dureth forever.—Psalm 111: 9, 10. 

Lovely Spread Cloth 
Is Easy to Crochet 

wPattern 6665. 

J F YOU'VE never crocheted, 
* here's the medallion to start on. 
Easy—memorized in no time—it 
makes lovely accessories. Pat­
tern 6665 contains instructions for 
medallions; photograph and illus­
trations of them; illustration of 
stitches; materials needed. Send 
order to: 

Sewing circle Needlecratt Dept. 
82 Eighth Ave. New York 

Enclose 15 cents In coins (or Pat­
tern No 

Name 
Address 

DOCTOR'S FORMULA 
FOR EXTERNALLY CAUSED 

SKIN TROUBLES 
HUU&D FROM COAST TO COAST! 
N o matter what you've tried without 
success for unsightly surface pimples, 
blemishes and similar skip, irritations, 
here's an amazingly successful doctor's 
formula—powerfully soothing, Liquid 
Zemo--which quickly relieves itching 
soreness and starts right in to help nature 
promote PAST healing. 80 years continu­
ous success! I * t a m i ' s 10 different mar-
velously effective ingredients help YO U B 
BktnTGet a pottle of Zemo T O D A Y ! . , 

xemo 
Present as Past 

The present contains nothing 
more than the past, and what is 
found in the effect was already in 
the cause.—Henri Bergsoh. 

Milliners are doing interesting 
things with fabrics these days. En­
thusiasm for polka dots is wide­
spread and their popularity is re­
flected in a big way in hat design. 
The use of polka dots is manifested 
in such clever ideas as large straw 
brims faced with dotted prints or 
in drapes and scarf streamers of 
bold dot fabrics, especially silk 
prints. Particularly attractive are 
scarf and hat ensembles as here 
pictured. Plaids, likewise stripes, 
for hat and bag seta also are mak­
ing big appeal. The plaid silk hat 
and bag twosome shown interprets 
this trend. 

Family Heirlooms 
With Bridal Array 

You can believe everything you 
read in the society columns about 
the sparkling beauty of the bride. 
It 's all true and it's all real be­
cause brides are wearing jewels 
again. They are even arranging 
their veils to fall from the family ti­
ara or combining mother's heirloom 
lace with the bridegroom's gift of a 
modern clip or brooch. Notice how 
often you read in the social notes 
"the bride wore just one lovely or­
nament—a pin that belonged to her 
mother." 

Some girls even prefer a diamond 
instead of a wedding check—not so 
lightly cashed and spent! Also the 
symbolism of this gem (it's an­
cient meaning was purity, fidelity 
and devotion) .makes a lucky talis­
man for the bride. 

Of course all the revival fashions 
in wedding gowns, with their tight 
little waists, square necks or round 
collars, and puffs of tulle and satin 
form the perfect background for.tra-
ditional jewelry. 

Variety in Fabrics 
its Milliners 

INDIGESTION 
may affect the Heart 

Gu tripped in tha itonuch or gullet may act [ike a 
hair-trigger on the heart. At the first sign of distress 
•mart men And women depend on Bell-ana Tablets ta 
set gas tm. Ho Jai*tivt> but mads of the fastest-
mctinjr medicines known for add indigestion. If ths 
FIRST DOSE doean't |**v* Bell-ana better return 
bottle to OS and reeeiT* DOUBLE Money Back. 860. 

Pleasant Companion 
Good company in a journey 

makes the way to seem shorter. 

FOUR-FOLD WAY TO 

SCALP COMFORT 
REMOVE LOOSE DANDRUFF 
To belli the looks of you* hair and remove 
loose dandruff, just use En-ar-co. Quickly it 
atunulatet the surface circulation—and good 
circulation Is vital to u good head of hair. It 
lifts up and dissolves the loose dandruff-It's 
^ ^ ^ _ ^ £ H ^ k just grand for the hair. 
^ S i l ^ ^ v At all druggists or send 
K - * ^ ^ ^ K m P a W 1 0 c for trial size to 
^ ^ ^ B l f l N i t l o o i l Remedy Co., 

^ ^ V ^mS5 West 42nd Street. 

j^batfEN-AR-CO 
Variable Nature 

Nature is a mutable cloud which 
is always and never the same. 

IN 
YOUR "M 

11 

s 

Tempt 
Milliners are no respecters of fab­

rics this season. They use anything 
and everything from, silks and jer-
sies and nets and meshes and veil­
ing to calicoes and ginghams, bright 
flowered chintz and the new hats 
with enormous brims of spick and 
span white starched lace are simply 
"dreams come true." 

The smart trick this season is to 
have a hat made of the same ma­
terial as your dress. For an excit­
ing eye-catcher wear with your 
black or navy sheer this summer a 
hat of picturesque broad brim fash­
ioned of very flowery chintz arid see 
to it that your bag of ample propor­
tions is made of the identical chintz. 

Read This Important Message! 
Do you dreed those "trying years" (38 to 
B21T. Are you getting moody, cranky and 
NERVOUS? Do youtear hot Sashes, weak­
ening dlszy spells7 Are youjealous of atten­
tions other Women getf THEN LISTEN— 

These symptoms often result (rom female 
functional disorders. So start forfor and take 
famous Lydla E; Plnkham's Vegetable Com­
pound. For over 60 years Plnkham's Coot-
pound baa helped hundreds of thousands of 
ELteful women to go "smiling thru"-difficult 

ys. Plnkham's has helped calm unstrung 
nerves and lessen annoying female (upe* 
ttosal •'Irregularities." One of the meal «#•»• 
KM "woman's" tonics. Tr» ill 

WNU—O 22^40 

Idleness a Tomb 
Idleness is the sepulcher of the 

living man. 

ThatNa^in<3 
Backache 

May Warn of Disordered 
Kidney Action 

Modem life with Its hurry sad worry: 
Irregular habits. Improper eating and 
drinking—its risk; of exposure and Infec­
tion—thrown heavy strain on the wor« 
of the kidneys. They are apt to become 
over-Used and fall to filter excess acid 
and other Impurities from the life-gtvtng 
Mood. 

You may suffer nsgging .backache. 
headache, dlaameaa, getting up nights, 
leg pains, iwelllngr-feel constantly 
tired, nervous, all worn out. Other signs 
of kidney or bladder dlsotdsr are some­
times burning, scanty or too frequent 
sol nation. 

Try Doss's KHs. Doss's help the 
ttdnsystopasso« harmful•*«•••>>#J 
waste. They have had more than half a 
eeatury of public approval. Are rscom-

DOANS PILLS 
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NAT QNAL€DITORIAL_ 
SSOCIATION 

"Every government official or board 
that handles public money, should 
publish at regular intervals an ac­
counting of it, showing where and 
how each dollar is spent. This is a fun­
damental principal of democratic 
government." 

ADVERTISING RATE 
Readers in Local Happenings Column: 

Three lines or less . -i_ 30c 
Over three lines, per line 10c 

Display Bates on Request 

SOUTH WILSON 
(Edited by Miss Anna Brintnall) 

TERMS OF SUBSCRIPTION 
' (Payable in Advance) 

One Year , ^ $1.50 
Six Months : .75 
Three Months __•_„.- .50 

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Zoulek of Pe­
ninsula, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Zoulek 
and family of Echo and Mr. and Mrs. 
Wn. Zoulek and family were Sunday 
callers at Peter Zoulek's. 

Mrs. Loviiia Brintnall spent Friday 
with her son, Luther Brintnall. 

Mrs. Francis Bishaw and Mr. and 
Mrs. Clem. Kenny and family of East 
Jordan isited Mr.' and Mrs. Frank 
Rebec, Sunday. . ,• 

Miss Margaret Weldy spent Mon­
day evening with Marion Jaquays. 

Mrs. Lovina Brintnall and Anna 
and Minnie Brintnall visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Peter Zoulek, Friday evening, 

Born to Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Pin-
ney, a daughter, Sunday, May 26th. 

Zestal Clark called at Geo, Ja­
quays Monday. 

Mrs. Frank Cihak and daughter 
Miss Minnie and son Emil were Sun­
day-afternoon visitors at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Peter Stanek and fam­
ily, last week. 

PENINSULA 
(Edited by Mrs. «. Harden) 

MAKE YOUR FOR SALE 

f IN WORK, NOT SHIRK 
UT IT HERE, IN t H E 

WANT ADS 

CRUDE RUBBIR A D V A N C E D 

W I T H I N THE PAST 6 0 DAYS 

BUY NOW! 
WHILE YOU CAN STILL GET 

Tire$ton* 
STANDARD TIRES 

AT THESE LOW PRICES 

The w o r l d - f a m o u s 
reputation of these tires, 
backed by Firestone's 
name and l i f e t ime 
guarantee, is proof of 
their extra quality and 
extra safety! Don't take 
chances! Save money — 

: Buy today! 

\ PICK YOUR SIM AT THESI 

LOW PRICES 

LIFETIME GUARANTEE 
Every FLrcitone Tire Carrie* a 
written lifetime guarantee — not 
limited to 12. IS or 24 monthi, 
but for the full life of the tire' 
without time or mileage limit* 

Uatuafe/fttt-aa-aŝ ia'., 

S I Z E 

4.40/1.50-21 
4.7S/5.00-19 
4.50/4.75/5.00-20-
5.25-21..-, 
5.25/5.S0-17_ 
5.25/5.50-18.. 
5.25/5.50-19 
5.25/5.50-20.. 
6.25/6.50-16. 

PRICE 

$5.58 
5.78 
6.21 
7.77 
7.08 
6.75 
8.37 
8.66 
9.37 

Price Include! Your Old Tiro 
Other Shot Proportionately Low 

THINK OF IT 11 ! 

Tinstone 
C O N V O Y T I R E S 

AT THESE tOW PRICES 

Listen to the Voice of Firestone with Richard Crooks, Margaret 
Speaks and the Firestone Symphony Orchestra, under the direction 
of Alfred Wallenstein, Monday evenings, Nationwide N. B. C. Red 
Netwark. 

Northern Auto Co. 
PHONE 97 EAST JORDAN 

* • First Insertion 
26 words or less —: ——;_ 26c 
Over 26 words, per word --* lc. 

'". , Subsequent Insertions 
(If ordered with first insertion) 

26 words or l e s s — - . 16c 
Over 26 words, per Word __^_„ 4»c 
10c extra,, per insertion if charged. 

LOST AND FOUND 

LOST — Ladles Gold Wrist Watch 
; on a Sunday a few weeks ago, Se­

ward for it's return. — LOUIS PE 
. TERSON, 307 Third St. . ' 22x1 

HELP WANTED 

SALESMAN WANTED —Three men 
-with cars for Sales and Service 
'Work in Charleoix and-surrounding 
counties. Steady year around work. 
Good wages for those who can 

•qualify. Surety bond and charac­
ter ref erense required; Write to 
Lock Box 204, Boyne City^ or In­
quire at Herald office. 22x3 

FOR SALE — MISCELLANEOUS 

FOR RENT — 106 acres 
See H. A. GOODMAN. 

WM. BUSSING — RADIO SERVICE 
Herald Building, East Jordan. 22x1 

FOR SALE—• Dining Table and 
Buffet, in good condition. — W.TEr 

! HAWKINS. 20t. i. 

pOR SALE -*- Rural Russet Potatoes 
i eat them or plant them; ARCHIE 
|: MURPHY. 21x2 

f"OR SALE — Kitchen Range in good 
j condition. $10.00. HOWARD DAR-
i BEE, East Jordan. 22x1 

PARCEL POST MAILING LABELS 
' —blank form — for sale at The 
! HERALD office. Twenty-five for 
i 26c. 13 t.f 

POR SALE,— 1929/Model A Ford 
; Coupe, in good condition. $45.00 

CLARENCE LORD, R. 2, East Jor­
dan. 

TOMATO PLANTS FOR SALE 
HARDY — only 10c per dozen, —, 
MRS. MATT QUINN, phone 172, 
East Jordan. 22tf 

FOR SALE OR EXCHANGE — 
Horses, Colts, Mules. Several mat­
ched teams. -—M. B. HOOKER & 
SON. Charlevoix. 19x4 

FOR SALE — House Logs, excellent 
quality, up to 50 ft. long. Also 
aome good new lumber.— ARCH­
IE, MURPHY, East Jordan. 18x6. 

- "Our Faithful Pat" was on the 
route again, Monday, after a two-
week lay-off because of illness. 

"Bob" Evert Jarman and Richard 
Guerin of Gravel Hill, south side, did 
some repair: work on buildings for 
Mr, B. R. Winborn at Holy Hill, south 
Side, last week. , 

Percy Tenfold'of the Jordan Val­
ley Co-op Creamery was Calling oh 
the stockholders and patrons Tues­
day, delivering certificates of indebt­
edness. 

Supervisor Wm. Sanderson of 
Northwbod was taking the assess­
ment, Wednesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hayden and 
family of Pleasant View farm spent 
Monday and Tuesday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Beyer in Chaddock 
Dist. helping with the farm work, and 
Mrs. Hayden sewing. 

Little Miss Joan and.Louise Haw­
kins of St. Ignace are staying with 
their grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Beyer in Chaddock DiSt. 
while their mother, Mrs. Lydia Bey­
er-Hawkins is attending summer 
school at Ferris Institute, Big Rap­
ids. 

Miss Arlene Hayden of Pleasant 
View farm was confined to the house 
Saturday and Sunday by illness. 

Mr. and Mrs. Derby Hayden and 
son James of Bob White farm were 
dinner guests at Orchard Hill, Wed­
nesday. --^-.. ,' r -

The Tainter Sunday school near 
Boyne City are coming to Star Sun­
day school in a body, June 2nd to 
visit. It is hoped there will be-a good 
attendance-from our own District. 

The pie vyalk at Star School house 
Saturday evening was not very well 
attended, but all. the pies were sold, 
netting $6.46 which will be used to 
purchase cement to repair the foun­
dation. Lloyd Jones of Stoney Ridge 
farm was the lucky one, winning four 
pies besides having a pleasant even­
ing. 

Mr. and Mrs. F. K. Hayden and 
younger children of Pleasant View 
farm spent Thursday at Orchard Hill. 
Mr. Hayden shearing sheep arid Mrs. 
Hayden helping with house cleaning. 

Mr. Pearson of the Farm Security 
Office was on the Peninsula Tuesday, 
making official visits. 

Miss Arlene Hayden of Pleasant 
View farm spent Wednesday night 
with her grandparents,' Mr. and Mrs. 
T. J. Hitchcock in East Jordan and 
took in the Mother and Daughter 
banquet. Little Miss Oryaline Ben­
nett of Honey Slope farm attended 
the party with her teacher. 

Company at Pleasant View farm 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. Franks 
tosher "and family of Petoskey andj 
Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Hitchcock of Easts' 
Jordan. . ] 

Mr. and Mrs, Orval Bennett and' 
family of Honey Slope farm were-
Sunday dinner guests of her sister, 
Mrs. Tracy LaCroix and family, 
south of Advance. 

Those to have their sheep sheared] 
the past tw.o days were Ted Wester-. 
man of the F. H. Wangeman farm: 
and Alex Cury of Mountain Dist. F. 
K. Hayden, the local shearer, did the 
work. 

The Misses Alberta and Edith Tib-; 
bits of Lansing, and Miss Quigley of. 
Detroit arrived at Cherry Hill, Thurs­
day to attend the graduation of Don 
Tibbits at the Boyne City High School 
Friday evening. They returned to 
Lansing, Sunday afternoon. Don Tib-
bits went with the Senior Class to 
New York City for a week's trip of 
sight seeing. 

The Misses Edna Reich, Vera Sta-
ley and Erma Kitson took dinner 
with Mrs. John Seiler near East Jor­
dan, Friday. 

Curtis Nicloy of Sunny Slopes 
farm , Edna Reich "of Lone Ash farm 
and Wm. Sanderson Jr. of Northwood 
the Peninsula graduates, wore their 
caps and gowns home Friday evening, 

Several from the Peninsula atten­
ded the Baccalaureate services in 

"East Jordan, Sunday evening. 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Erber and 

family and Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Beh' 
ling and son Bobby, of Boyne City 
were Sunday guests of Mr. and Mrs, 
Will MaeGregor in Whiting Park, 
Miss Betty Erber of Boyne City spent' 
Saturday night with them and wonj BOWER BATTERIES 
two pies at the pie walk at the Star| 
school house. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herb Sutton of Deer'j 
Lake were Sunday visitors of the C 
Healey families at Willow Brook 
farm. 

The three Elwood Cyr boys ofi 
Boyne City spent part of last week; 
with their grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Wurn in Star Dist. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Gaunt and 
daughter Freda and a grand-daugh 
ter of Flint motored up Saturday to; 
the David Gaunt home to : celebrate; 
his mother's, Mrs. David Gaunt's 77th 
birthday. They returned to Flint Sun 
day. Mr. and Mrs. Robert MyeTs of; 
Mountain Dist joined the family, Sun 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marion Russell and 
family of Boyne City were Sunday 
guests of the Russell's at Ridgeway 
farms. 

Frances "Bill" Russell of Ridgeway 
farms made a business trip to Grand 
Rapids, Saturday. 

"Bob" Jarman of Gravel Hill, 
south side, took Arthur-Bradford to 
Petoskey on a shopping trip, Satur-
day. 

The abundance of rain and not too 
cold weather has produced the great­
est crop of mushrooms ever in the 
open fields and in fence rows of the 
finest quality. 

Pasture. 
16t.f. 

ECHO 
(Edited by Mrs. Densll Wilson) 

Mrs, Leslie Gibbard of East Jor­
dan spent Thursday with Mrs. Walter 
Petrie. 

Rex Blanchard is visiting at the 
home of his sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lyle Warner. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Wilson and Mrs. 
John Taylor were Wednesday callers 
at Densil Wilson's. 

Margaret Lord of Charlevoix spent 
Saturday night arid Sunday with Re-
va Wilson. 

Dora Derenzy • spent Saturday 
night and Sunday with Leola Henley 
of Charlevoix. 

Mrs. Frank Bartholomew was a 
Thursday afternoon visitor at Mrs, 
Elmer Murray's. 

The Ladies Get-to-gether Club will 
hold their June meeting with Mrs. 
Earl Danforth, Thursday, June 6. 

Sunday callers at Mr. arid Mrs. 
Wm. Derenzy and family were: Mr. 
and Mrs. Theo Jeffries and Mr. and 
Mrs. T. Campbell of Charlevoix, Peg­
gy Woodcock, Evelyn Collins" and Re-
va Wilson. •» 

Mr. and Mrs. Densil Wilson and 
three children spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Gordon Dawson near Cen­
tral Lake. ' 

Mrs. Lyle Warner and children 
spent Friday with Mrs. Denzil Wil­
son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Otto Bolser and boys, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernie Sommerville and 
family, and Mr. and Mrs. James Fol-
som and family had a picnic dinner 
Sunday at Echo Park on Six-Mile 
Lake. 

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Graham and 
boys spent Sunday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. Hugh Graham and family. 

Donna Warner spent the week end 
with Shirley Barnett in East Jordan. 

Mrs. D. E. Carpenter is spending 
this week with her daughter and fa­
mily, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Vance. 

Sunday visitors at Mr. and Mrs. 
Elmer Murray's were Mr. and Mrs. 
Percy Penfold and two children and 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Danforth. 
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SOUTH ARM 
(Edited-by Ruth Goebel) 

Mr. and Mrs. R. V. Liskura and fa­
mily were Sunday dinner fnesti of 
her sister, Mrs. Clyde Warner of 
Charlevoix. 

Mr." and Mrs. Welter Goebel end 
daughter, Art Benn and Douglas Nel­
son were Sunday dinner guests of 
Mrs. Constance Marithie of Petoskey. 

The Ranney school had their pic­
nic last Wednesday. tt looked like 
rain in the morning but the after­
noon was lovely. There was a nice 
attendance and a pot luck lunch was 
served at noon. There were races and 
a base ball game after dinner and all 
had a good time. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Nice and 
daughter Doris and her husband ar­
rived Wednesday night to visit a few 
d a y s . - ^ / , , . ••••:•..•' 

Betty Louise Warner of Charle­
voix spent a few days with her cousin, 
Arvita Liskiim. 

Miss Ina Gilkerson was a caller at 
the Walter Heileman^s, Friday. 

Mrs. R. V. Liskum and two of the 
children were on the sick list last 
week. 
- Mr. and Mrs. Charles,Murphy cal­
led on her parents, Mr. arid Mrs. Ike 
Flora, Friday afternoon. 

Mrs. Clyde Warner.of Charlevoix 
spent Wednesday helping her grand­
mother, Mrs. Ike Flora, wall paper­
ing.' " • 

JFOR SALE — Small all Electric new 
Battery, Brooders, all Metal, fire 
proof and Sanitary. $4. each CHE-
RRYVALE HATCHERY East Jor­
dan. 21-2 

FOR SALE — in perfect shape, 1939 
Two-door Dodge Sedan, 11,000 
miles, Spotlight, Radio, Heater, De­
froster. Inquire of MRS. PETER 
HIPP, 601 Mill St. 22x1 

FOR SALE — Newly Built Cabin on 
Lake- Charlevoix. Price $760.00; 
completely furnished, water and 
electricity. — LEO LA LONDE, 
410 Main St. Phone 68, East Jor­

dan. - _ . _ 20-3 

WALL PAPER FOR SALE — A 
quantity of Wall Paper, from the 
stock handled by my late husband. 
In good condition and will be sold 
cheap.— MRS. C. H. WHITTING-
TON, 406 Second St. 22x1 

LAWN MOWERS ELECTRICALLY 
GROUND $1.26; cleaned and 
ground $1,75, plus whatever re­
pairs are necessary. 25c extra for 
grinding old models without ball 
bearings. Called for and delivered 
free. — PAUL LISK, East Jordan. 

DANDY. BIG BAY HORSE for sale 
1500 lbs; 4 years old; gentle 
working. Isn't scared of anything, 
even a German tank. Will eat the 
paint off your tractor. Come "and 
see him; can pull as" much as a 
tractor alone. Will trade for cattle. 
WM. SHEPARD./ - 22x1' 

i 

Longer life 
more power. 13 plate, $6.60 list, 
$3.75 exchange. 16 pfate, $8.50 
list, $5.50 exchange. 17 plate, $14.-
20 list, $7.60 exchange. Bowers 
Best Batteries are guaranteed as 
long as you own your car. BOYNE 
CITY AUTO PARTS, 210 Water 
St, Boyne City, Michigan. 16t.t, 

DANDY NICE HOT POINT Elect­
ric Stove for sale —oven and 

" everything on it. Come and see it. 
Never had over $5.00 worth of 
electricity put through it. Rea­
son for selling it — We just don't 
use it. Just got a silly notion and 
bought it. WM. SHEPARD. 22x1 

BUILDING SUPPLIES Better made 
, cement blocks, cement brick, cin­

der blocks and manhole blocks. We 
also Colorcrete masonary building 
in any color desired. Prices on re­
quest. We deliver. NORTHERN 
CONCRETE T-RODUCTS CO., 
Phone 7018-F21 Petoskey, Michi-
igan. 18t. f. 

600 USED TIRES — Like New. All 
standard makes; all sizes; guaran­
teed 90 days — $2.76 to $3.60. 
600 cans of Paint; Gen­
erators, Fuel Pumps (exchange). 
Mufflers for all cars. $1.60 up — 
BOYNE CITY AUTO PARTS, 210 
Water St, Phone 28. 18-t.f. 

THE SHOW PLACE OF 

TEMPLE THEATRE 
THE-_NORTH 

EAST 
JORDAN 

SATURDAY ONLY, JUNE 1 ^ ¾ ^ % - ?£': &c 

ROY ROGERS — MARY HART •— GABBY HAYES 

SOUTHWARD HO! 
AH. STAR COMEDY — SPORTS — NOVELTY "SILENT WINGS'* 

S U N D A Y —- M O N D A Y Sunday Mat. 2:30 10c,- l6c 
0\JI\LU\I m U H U A I Eves 7 and 9 10c - 26« 

YOUR FAVORITE STARS — TOGETHER AT LAST! 
JANE WITHERS — GENE AUTRY 

SHOOTING HIGH 
Special Added Featurette*:-— 
Sports, Over The Seven Sea.. 

^tJeW Crime Doein't Pay Subject 
Lew Lehr Comedy. ' Latest: News 

TUESDAY - WED. 
LEW AYRES 

FAMILY NITES 2 for 25c 
— LIONEL BARRYMORE 

Dr. Kildare's Strange Case 
EXTRA 1 THE DRUMS OF FU MANCHU 

THURSDAY FRIDAY, JUNE 6 - 7 f^aJ0f ? ^¾ 
JACK "BUCK" BENNT-G- ANDY DEVINE -^ ELLEN DREW 

PHIL HARRIS — EDDIE "ROCHESTER" ANDERSON 

Buck Benny Rides Again 

HERE ARE THE 3 THINGS 
YOU WANT IN A 

FLOOR VARNISH! 

A BEAUTIFUL FINISH 

LONG WEAR 

QUICK-DRYING I 

Lowe Brothers Neptunite Floor 
Varnish has these three quslities 
because it's designed for floors. 
It isn't one of those varnishes 
claimed to be "good for every, 
thing." It gives you a smooth, 
glistening, beautiful floor that can 
be walked on in s few hours—the 

r finishwlllstsndupunderthehard' 
est kind of wear you can give it. 

Lowe Brothers also mske other 
high quality Neptunite vsrnishes. 
Each one is designed 

gloss for woodwork: "Rubbing" 
—for use when the finish is to be 
rubbed; "Rubtone"—forarubbed 
effect without rubbing; "Spar"— 
for exterior use, and "Seat"—for 
chsirs, church pews,' and other 
surfaces where unusually hard-
drying is required. 

All Neptunite Varnishes sre 
heat-proof, mv-proof sod water­
proof. They won't turn white dr. 
scratch white. Come in sad let us 

help you get the r%*> 

to do a specific fob. ^Jjipitrc ^Btot/l&ti Y* r n , , n for *»• w o r i t' 
"Interior"—high- ^ ^ ~ you have in mind. 

W. A. PORTER 
HARDWARE — PLUMBING — HEATING 

Phone 19 — East Jordan 

•T 

It's Planting Time — Now! 

We offer' this Spring —• 27 little 
trees —- 4 for a dollar. Come and get 
them — in cans. Same size we plant 
to grow large trees. Included in: the 
list are the following: Horse Chest­
nut, Chinese Elm, Black Walnut, Am­
erican Elm, Mountain Ash. 

Charievoix County Nursery 
East Landing, Ironton Fer-
Ty. P. 0. Address: East 

adv21-4 Jordan, Michigan. 
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Mr. and Mn. Rex Hickox viiited 
Bellaire relative* last Sunday. 

Jean Bugai haa returned home 
from Big Rapids, where she haa been 
attending Ferris institute. 

Wm. Vandermade of Jackson wai 
week end guest of hit parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Sherman. 

There will be a showing of the 
American League baseball movie at 
the Temple Theatre Tuesday June 
4th at 1 p. m. Under auspices of the 
Rotary Club. Everyone invited. No 
admission charge. 

St. Ann's Altar Society will meet 
at St. Joseph school on Thursday 
June 6th. Mrs. John Addis and Miss 
Mabel Addis in charge. 

Ca'ptola Richardson who is attend­
ing school in Traverse City spent the 
week end at the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vern Richardson. 

Week end guests at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs, Mike Gunderson were 
Mr. and Mrs. George Hansen and 
Mrs. Mae Hansen of Grand Rapids, 
N. E. Borgerson of Lowell and Mr. 
and Mrs. Alfred Mortenson and 
daughter of Suttons Bay. 

'hhm 

Let Us Assist You 
With Your Plans 

• We will.be glad to. make you an estimate on 
any New Buildings or Repairs you are planning to 
make. 

• Everything you need to build with priced 
Right and Delivered Right to the Job. 

Come in and see the New Style 

U. S. G. and MASONITE 
TILE ana PLANK ON OUR OFFICE WALLS 

East Jordan Lumber Co 
Phone 111 — We Deliver —- East Jordan, Mich. 

• • • • • » • » • » • » » • • > » • • • • • • • • • • • » • • • • • • • • » • • > » • » • » » » • • • • • 
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raise her boy 
to be a soldier 

In many lands today, mothers are forced to %ioe up thtir childrtn 
—even the youngest. Dictators demand them—and dictator! an 
all-powerful. In peace as in war, they control business and in­
dustry, capital and labor, life itself. Men and women are told 
what work they must do. There is no priufor ambition, no 
hope for the man ttho would like to choose his own career. 

H ow different it is in the United States} Here, governed 
by men responsible jto the people, we choose our life-
work for ourselves. This system of free enterprise makes 
the United States the world's greatest nation. Because 
men are free to dream and work as they see fit, scores of 
industries have grown great in America: the automobile, 
radio, telephone and electrical industries are just a few. 

As typical Americans, the employees of your electric 
company are devoted to the American principle of work, 
ing together, producing more of the good things of life 
and making them available to more people. Through 
their efforts electric service steadily improves; at the 
tame time, its price steadily comes down. 

What inspires the people of your electric company? 
The best answer is this: the employees of this company 
are proud of their part in keeping America great. They 
work as free men to bring better service and value to 
other free men. They are glad to create wealth instead 
of destroying it. 

This company has beep built by free Americans. It is 
built to serve other free Americans, It is free ^ ^ 
from political dictation. Like all industry, it "•fiT 
will succeed as long as there are free Americans U 
to..work for it and free Americans for it to fi, 
work for. . <'• •'.;r;-. 

MICHIGAN .PUBLIC 
SERVICE COMPANY 

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Thomas an 
family have moved into the Dedose 
residence on William Street. 

Born to Mr. and Mrs. Robert Ko-
walski a son, Glen Russell at Charle­
voix hospital, Tuesday May 21. 

Mr. and Mrs. George* Ramsey of 
Cadillac were Sunday guests of the 
former's sister, Mrs. Harry Simmons 
and family. 

Mrs. Louis Miller returned to her 
home in Marquette, Friday after 
spending the past two weeks with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Boyd Hipp and 
other relatives. 

Clayton Montroy returned to his 
work at Thompsonville Sunday even­
ing, after spending the week end with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joseph 
Montroy and other relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Clark and 
daughter, have returned to East Jor­
dan from Bellaire, the former having 
completed his work as teacher in the 
Bellaire schools for the year. 

Mrs. Ralph Wagner and daughter 
Gretchen of Wyandotte are spending 
a couple of weeks with the formers 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Kitsman, 
Mr. Wagner and friend Mr. Metealf, 
also spent the week end here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Hudson, who 
have been spending the winter mon­
ths at Gaylord where Mr. Hudson 
was attendant at the Pinnacle Oil 
Station, returned to their East Jor 
dan home last Saturday where they 
plan to remain. 

Mrs. Wm. Howard, who has been 
spending the winter with her daugh­
ters, Mrs. Frank Reese and family in 
Kansas City, Mo., and Mr. and Mrs 
Irving Townsend in Detroit, is ex­
pected to return. home today Wed­
nesday for the summer months. 

The remains of William Bailey, 
age 66, who passed away at Royal 
Oak, were brought to East Jordan 
Saturday afternoon. A short funeral 
service was held at Sunset Hill con­
ducted by Rev. James Leitch. Mr. 
Bailey was a brother of the former 
Mrs. Henry Roy, deceased. 

Mr. and Mrs. Boyd Keller of Mt. 
Clemens, whose marriage was an 
event of Saturday May 25, spent the 
week end with the former's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Keller and other 
relatives, Mrs. Keller was formerly 
Miss Rachel Howe, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernie Howe, former East 
Jordan residents. 

0 :———• 

Free! 16-Page Color Comic Book 
With Sund*y'> Detroit Newt 

Mrs. R. W. Dye and son Bobbie 
have returned from Chicago and arc 
at the home of the former's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Healey. 

James Gidley returned home last 
Thursday from Petoskey, where he 
had been a surgical patient at Lock-
wood General Hospital the past three 
weekB. 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Hott are at­
tending the graduation exercises at 
Sparrow hospital, Lansing Wednes­
day. .Their daughter, Ruth, is among 
the graduates. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Heath and 
family of Kalamazoo, are expected 
Wednesday to spend the week with 
the former's father, Wm Heath and 
other relatives. 

Rev. and Mrs. J. C. Mathews at­
tended the graduation exercises of 
the eighth graders of Antrim Co. at 
Bellaire last Saturday. Rev. Math­
ews gave the address to the grad­
uates. 

Miss Helen Trojanek, who is tak­
ing a commercial course at the Tra­
verse City Businness College, has a 
position in the Belvedere Hotel of­
fices, Charlevoix, for the summer 
months. 

The Wednesday Evening Circle of 
the Presbyterian Aid will meet with 
Mrs. Evelyn Gidley With Mrs. Jane 
Jackson and Mrs. Mary Glenna Mal-
pass assistant hostesses, Wednesday 
evening June 6. S 

- en • 

STEAL ARABIAN PIPES 

Starting next Sunday, The Detroit 
News includes, In Addition to its big, 
26-comic, Color Comic Section, a 
16page Comic Book which will con-' 
tain three Complete Serials in cartoon 
form. 

If you enjoy heart-throbbing mys­
tery, adventure and daring, watch for 
"Mr. Mystic," "Lady Luck" and "The 
Spirit" whose hair-raising experiences 
will appear in this Color Comic Book, 

To make sure you get a copy of 
this sensational Comic Book, it will 
pay you to order your copy in ad­
vance. Do so now! 

Dearborn — City police are won­
dering what burglars are going to do 
with the loot taken in a recent rob­
bery. Said Nessar reported someone 
had broken into his hojne and taken 
two Arabian pipes four feet high, fit­
ted with long hoses. They were val­
ued at $100. 
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TO QUI. PRESENT 
GEtlERiHIOn 

Glvuvmfi/i-e 

• 
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LEGHL 
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No Business will be 
transacted by this 
Bank on that day. 

Tha y«ax» dp not dim our national 
appreciation of tha sacrifice* of 
America's bravest sons in previous 
wars. 

But as we pay xeverent tribute to 
them on Memorial Day this year, 
the fervent hope rises in our hearts 
that our youth of this generation 
may be given the glorious privilege 
of living for their country—to make 
it by their efforts a world-haven of 
p e a c e , to l erance , and just ice . 

STATE BANK of 
EAST JORDAN 

MEMIE* FEDEtAl DEPOSIT INSUIANCE COtPOtATION 

7lt&ie ii. /Vex SuJj-itUuie. /04 Moneu in the, Ba*d? 

niiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii 

iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiitiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiniiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii 

| Our many years of service in this community assures | 
| you of the same helpful assistance you are accustom- = 
| ed to with your wishes ever the nrst consideration. | 
| Our business is built upon the recommendations of § 
| the people we have served. § 

LAMBS SET RECORD 

Bad Axe — For the fourth succes­
sive year, the same ewe on the Phil­
lip Neesz farm near here has given 
birth to triplet lambs. Each year the 
three lambs from this ewe have lived. 
One of the original trio had twins last 
year and again in 1940. In addition, 
Neesz had three different eyes bear­
ing three lambs each last year. 

I R.G. WATSON FUNERAL HOME | 
§ East Jordan, Mich. 66 Phones 244 § 
SiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiriiiiiiiiiiiMiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii 

TRAGIC PLIGHT OF 
EUROPE'S WAR BABIES 

Writing in The American Weekly 
with the June 2 issue of The Detroit 
Sunday Times, Grand Duchess Marie 
of Russia, Europe's most noted exile 
and cousin of the Czar who, with his 

family, was murdered by Russian 
Communists, tells — in her . own 
words — why there is only one woe 
ahead for tiny heirs to the thrones 
broken or threatened by the lightning 
of invading armies. Be sure to get 
Sunday's Detroit Times. 

St Joseph Church 
East Josdan 

St. John's Church 
Bohemian Settlement 

Rev. Joseph J. Malinewski, Pastor 
Sunday, June 2nd, 1940. 

8:00 a. m. - East Jordan. 
10:00 a. m. — Settlement. 

, — — o — • '. 

" Presbyterian Church 
C. W. Sldebotham, Pastor 
0. R. Harper, Foreign Pastor 

"A Church for Folks." 

10:30 a. m. — Morning Worship. 
11:45 Sunday School. 

First M. E. Church 
Rev. J. C. Matthews. Pastor 

Sunday School — 10:00 a. m. 
Preaching — 11:15 a. m. 
Epworth League — 7:45 p. m. 

0—; ; 
REORGANIZED 

Latter Day Saints Church 
C. H. McKianon, Pastor 

.»»*«»»»»»»»»•**•»«•»•••*»»»»»»»••»•>••»>»••»»•»••»•• 

10:00 a, m. — Church School. 
11:00 a. m. — Morning Service: 
7:80 p. ra. — Evening Service. 
7:80 p. ra., Wednesday Prayer 

Service. 
8:00 p. m., Thursday — Zion's 

League. 

If You're Buying a Washer 
This Year See This 

and save $11.00 if you pur­
chase at once. 

Just one month ago this 
washer sold for $64.95 

NOW - - - - $59.95 
YOU SAVE • $ 5.00 

Plus 60 packages Oxy-
dol Soap Powder Worth $6.00 

YOU SAVE - $11.00 Tha new aclentiiie Spiral 
Dasher washes a big lubiul 
•varr BVk admits*. I< washes 
V> clednSr, V* iaslsj, SM 
Ap.s b. ior. you buy. 

Mennonite Bretheren In 
Christ Church 

Rev. H. L. Matteson, Pastor. 
The Church With A Gospel Message. 

Sunday School — 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship — 11:00 a. an. 
Evangelistic Service — 8:00 p. m 
Mid-week Prsysr Service, Thurs­

day — 8:00 p. m. 
All ar. Wslcoms. .,.i 

See this amazing Washer demonstrated to­
day. Read about it in Saturday Evening 

Post and Colliers. 

W. f\. PORTBR 
PLUMBING HEATING HARDWARE 

AGENCY FOR HOLLAND FURNACE COMPANY 
Let Us Estimate That Job For You — Right Now! 

Phone 19 — We Deliver — Main St. — East. Jordan 

http://will.be
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61 I'V.' 
WEEKLY NEWS ANALYSIS By Farnham F. Dudgeon 

Allies Stage Big Counter-Attack 
In Attempt to Check Nazi Drive; 

Senate Passes Huge Army Bill 
(EDITOR'S NOTE—When opinions are expressed in these columns, they 
are those of the news analyst and not necessarily of-Oils newspaper.) 

(RelcaMd by Waitern Newapapa'r Uiiion. 

Because they (ear invasion of Great Britain by the advancing Ger­
man forces, English officials are.taking concrete steps to defend their 
homeland. In the above picture, beyond-war-age veterans of the last 
World war are shown receiving equipment and arms to be used against 
parachute troops that might be dropped from the sky. While the younger 
men are fighting beside the French on the continent these older men are 
guarding vulnerable spots throughout England. 

THE WAR: 
Revised Edition 

On the fields of northern France 
and Belgium the story of 1914-18 
continued to unfold itself in new, 
grim and bloody chapters. 

This time the forces'of Adolf Hit­
ler were playing the leading German 
role as they made their bid for 
Paris, capital of France and for 
ports on the English channel, gate­
way to Britain. For a time as 
these forces battled their way 
through The Netherlands, across Bel­
gium, into France, it looked that 
there would be no stopping them un­
til they decided to write the final' 
chapter themselves. Even the dis­
patches from the allied war camps 
told of the constant advances made 
by the invading legions. 

Jittery, harassed and worried, the 
British-French war council switched 
control of the army to Gen. Maxime 
Weygand, former commander of the 
French army in the Near East. Vet­
eran of the. World, war, General Wey­
gand swung into action with a dra­
matic plane dash across German 
lines, a return trip to Paris and.the 
issuance of an order to launch ah 
immediate counter-attack. Directing 
this new move—the'first major at­
tack of the allies—with all the vigor 
for which he is famous and respect­
ed, he was successful in stalling the 
German machine, for a short time 
at least. 

Two important key points near 
the channel, Arras and Abbeville, 
were reportedly retaken from the 
Nazis. Soon word came through, 
however, that the Germans were 
pounding at the gates of Calais— 
which is only 26 miles, across the 
Strait of Dover from England. 

This fight for the channel ports 
may well be the most decisive bat­
tle of the current conflict. For as 
long as the English and French con­
trol the channel they are really 
"united." Should these ports fall into 
Nazi hands, however, Hitler would 
be in an excellent position to launch 
his threatened air and land attack 
on Britain—at home. 

Waiting 
Evidence that England was wor­

ried and preparing for such an at-

HEADLINERS 
. . . in the news 

Shadows of Frederick the Great 
fall from the person of Adolf Hitler 
in the opinion of his henchman, 
Field Marshal Goering. In Berlin 
on a short visit from the fighting 
front, he compared Hitler to Fred­
erick and pictured him as a master 
military strategist. 

From Boston came word that 
Senator Bridges (Rep., N. H.) had 
declared that city to be overrun with 
Nazi bundsmen and he called upon 
President Roosevelt to clean up this 
"fifth column" before proceeding 
with the national defense program. 

And another senator, this one 
from Massachusetts itself—Senator 
Lodge (Repm lican) came a sugges­
tion that the Onited States regular 
army be increased to a standing 
force of 750,000 men. He figures 
the present goal of 280,000 men will 
be reached by fall. 

Changing horses in the middle of 
a stream isn't such bad business, 
according to Wendell L. Wiilkie, can­
didate for the Republican presiden­
tial nomination. He voiced this 
theory in a political speech in which 
he assailed the New Peal for what 
he termed "failure" to defend the 
United States "against itself" and 
further charged that it could not be 
trusted (in a third term) to defend 
the nation from outside aggression. 
His speech was made at a Repub­
lican rally in Somerville, N. J., on 
the eve of that state's primary elec­
tion. 

tack was apparent on every hand. 
Winston Churchill, prime minister, 
was given a virtual dictator's pow­
er over all phases of English life. 

Every resource of the nation was 
being mustered to resist the attack 
that was in the offing. While the 
government's power to press the 
war across the channel was being 
approved, internal defense measures 
were also being substantially 
strengthened. Beyond-War-age vet­
erans of the last war were being 
equipped with arms to aid in bat­
tling parachute troops or other in­
vading forces. 

-In 2 hours and 50 minutes the par­
liament passed legislation giving 
the government control to mobilize 
all cash, property, labor, agricul­
ture and industry. It was a totali­
tarian measure designed to meet 
the totalitarian Germany on even 
ground. The drastic action was nec­
essary, the government said, be­
cause the war had reached the stage 
where every available resource had 
to be used to wage the fight against 
the enemy. 

U.S. DEFENSE: 
In the Groove 

President Roosevelt's request for 
immediate action in speeding up ac­
tivity on the U. S. home defense 
front is meeting with widespread 
approval. What is even more im­
portant, definite action is taking 
place. 

As the senate passed a record 
peacetime army supply bill, calling 

for expenditure of 
$1,823,000,000, by a 
74 to nothing vote, 
Jesse Jones, federal 
loan administrator, 
Was telling U.. S. 
business men that 
the Reconstruction 
F i n a n c e Corpora­
tion's huge credit re­
sources were virtu­
ally at their com­
mand for any expan­
sion, which wouldaid 
the defense program. 

Full credit backing to American 
business enlisting in the defense 
drive came as Jones, head of the 
RFC, called on the country's banks 
to give "fullest co-operation" in all 
loans of this type and his lending 
agency would underwrite them in 
the amount of 75 per cent. 

From Detroit, center of the na­
tion's automobile industry, came 
word that spare plant capacity of 
that industry may be utilized to 
speed arms production. -Army and 
navy technical experts have visited 
Detroit and have completed detailed 
studies on how these plants may be 
used. It is understood that the war 
department has in its files mobiliza­
tion plans for the industry should 
need arise for a hurried production 
of fighting tools and equipment. 

The 74 to nothing vote which the 
senate gave to the President in pass­
ing the army supply bill indicates 
the manner in which that body has 
swung behind the ' 'preparedness" 
plea. This bill provides for a full 
peacetime army of 280,000 men, 
about 10,000 planes, tons of muni­
tions, thousands of guns and a 
"blank check" in the amount of 
$132,000,000, for the President to 
spend as he sees fit in building up 
the army. 

Sour Note 
Principal sour note in the general 

approval (see above) which was 
greeting the administration's policy 
of improving national defense, was 
sounded by Col. Charles A. Lind­
bergh in a speech uv which he min­
imized the air peril to the United 
States. While he urged an adequate 
defense program Lindbergh criti­
cized the present administration by 
saying that our recent»poliey "leads 
to neither strength, friendship nor 
peace.' ' 

Jesse Jones 

'Fifth Column' 
. . . what it means 

"Outside the gates of Madrid four 
column! o/ our troop* art engaged. 
But within there it a fifth • column, 
which, at the proper lime, will arise 
and overthrow the defenders." 

Since the day that the Spanish rebel 
general Quiepo de Llano, made that 
now famous remark regarding the"fifth 
column" the term, hat been used to 
refer to all those residents (citizens 
or aliens) of a nation at war or faced 
with the possibility of war at some 
future date, who act or' speak in a 
fashion that may in some way aid 'the 
enemy or- possible enemy. , . ' • - . 

Such aid to. the "enemy'' may come 
in many different ways. It may mean 
sabotage or disclosing military secrets. 
Most striking examples of "fifth col­
umn" activity usually come however, 
as the troops of the enemy are march­
ing into the home country. The "fifth 
column" is already there and has placed 
itself in key positions to aid the ad­
vancing troops. 

Thus far, it is claimed, the German 
forces have successfully used these tac­
tics in Denmark, Norway, Holland and 
Belgium. "Fifth columnists" may or 
may not be citizens of the country in 
which they reside. They filter into the 
nation in limes of peace as students, 
tourists, workmen, refugees or any 
guise which is not apt to be alarming. 

By VIRGINIA VALE 
(Relea'sed by Western Newspaper Union,) 

DOROTHY LAMOUR m a y 
h a v e to r e m a i n in the s a ­

rong tha t m a d e he r f amous , bu t 
J o n Hal l h a s finally g rabbed off 
a role tha t will enab le h im to 
w e a r r e g u l a r clothes—the cu r se 
of " T h e H u r r i c a n e " h a s lifted 
for h im, if not for h e r . 

After his success among its 
winds and waves he was idle for 
two years. Then Producer Edward 
Small asked to borrow him for an­
other South Seas picture, "South of 
Pago-Pago," Near the end of shoot­
ing on it, Small was planning to 
film "Kit Carson," and had already 
signed Randolph Scott for the lead­
ing rdle when Hall appeared at the 
studio one day wearing-a ten gallon 

Secretary 
Wallace 

AGRICULTURE: 
No Acreage Cut 

Further reduction in the acreage 
of major U. S. farm crops has been 
decided against, ac­
cording to Secretary 
of Agriculture Henry 
A. Wal lace . After 
discussing the cur­
rent farm surplus 
situation with Presi­
dent Roosevelt the 
secretary announced 
that the impact of 
the European war 
was making a pro­
found effect upon 
American agricul­
ture. He said that 
because of the w,ar 
future emphasis should be upon in­
creasing domestic consumption and 
storage of crops against future 
needs. 

Exports of U. S. farm products 
have been sharply curtailed because 
of the German invasion of Norway, 
Denmark, Belgium and The Nether­
lands, as these markets have been 
cut off. Then, too, the allies have 
diverted.much of their agricultural 
buying to their own colonies. 

POLITICS: 
Home Stretch 

Republicans have picked virtually 
all of their 1,000 delegates to the 
national convention and yet no can­
didate has.enough publicly instruct­
ed votes to' assure first-ballot nom­
ination for the presidency race. 
On the other side of the political 
fence, with only about three-fourths 
of the delegates chosen -the Demo­
cratic party is apparently going to 
give President Roosevelt another 
chance—IF—he wants it. With the 
war situation being what it is inside 
New Dealers feel certain that the 
President will choose to run. 

Talk of postponing the Republican 
convention, scheduled for Jun'e 24 in 
Philadelphia, was spiked by at least 
one G. O. P. leader, Alf M. Landon. 
He told newsmen in Topeka, before 
he left to keep a luncheon date with 
President Roosevelt m Washington, 
that he was "opposed to any sugges­
tion . . . to postpone . . . the con­
vention" . . . or have the Repub­
lican party . . . "lend itself to any 
intangible coalition which would 
tend to decrease party fesponsibij-
ity." His latter remark referred to 
a suggestion emanating from some 
quarters that the formality of a 
presidential election be abolished 
and a "coalition" government be 
formed to meet any threat of Amer­
ican invasion or any other foreign 
danger. 

Like Mr. Landon, political lead­
ers in both major parties are gen­
erally opposed to any such sugges­
tion, the thought being that the 
ideals of free government can best 
be served even in times of "crisis" 
by proceeding along regular demo­
cratic channels in governmental 
business. 

MISCELLANY: 
C,In California, the Imperial valley 
suffered a series of fairly severe 
earth shocks. At least eight per­
sons were killed and supplies of wa­
ter were cut off in six cities. Esti­
mates of property- loss ran to about 
$3,000,000. 
C. Possibility of a shortage of sttfel 
supplies in the United States was re­
ported by the magazine Iron Age. 
Pointing out that the War-generated 
demand was causing reserve sup­
plies to decline rapidly, it was said 
the pinch would be felt in midsum­
mer. 
C. Times square, New York city, 
witnessed a clash of several thou­
sand Communists and their sym­
pathizers with police as a "peace 
demonstration" was attempted. 
Marching two abreast the demon­
stration blocked traffic on Broad­
way and the police were called,to 
maintain order. ; 
«, In Georgia, Gov. E. D. Rivers 
signed a proclamation ordering all 
aliens in that state to register with 
nearest police officials and be fin­
gerprinted. Similar demands were 
made by various communities scat­
tered throughout the nation, 

JON HALL 

hat and a semi-cowboy outfit. He 
had a' late call for work that day, 
and had spent the early morning 
hours riding with his wife, Frances 
Langford. 

Small met Hall near the actor's 
dressing bungalow—and now it's 
Hall instead of Randolph Scott 
whom you'll see as Kit Carson. 

—*— 
In its latest issue, "The Philip­

pines j 1896-1946," the March of 
Time pictures the new problems 
facing the Philippines as a result 
of-today's mounting war fever, and 
shows how Philippine independence, 
scheduled to take effect in 1946, is 
already threatened by Japan's cur­
rent expansion program in the south 
Pacific. 

It's been announced that Joan 
Blondell plans to retire from the 
screen indefinitely when she fin­
ishes "I Want a Divorce." She has 
been suffering from severe colds 
and inertia for the past year, and 
says that she will travel throughout 
America with a road company, (a 
novel cure for both severe colds and 
inertia!) and later on will make an 
extended tour of South America for 
a change of climate. 

Fred MacMurray has grown to be 
so expert at water polo that a com­
pany that makes short features has 
asked him to make one ori the sport. 

Felix Knight, starred on the 'air­
waves' "All Star Revue," had a bad 
moment recently. After he had 
sung a medley of songs about the 
month of May, gardens and apple 
orchards, the Three Jesters strode 
up, arid down the aisles, tossing ap­
ples and other farm products to the 
audience. Knight swears he was 
scared to death for fear the fruit, 
would be handed right back—hur­
tling through the air straight at him. 

If Columbia's Wayne King wanted 
to start up in the pipe tobacco busi­
ness, he already has a large" clien­
tele all over the country. For 15 
years he has been smoking his own 
private mixture, but he won't tell 
anyone what it is. It's the result 
of four years of experimenting. But 
though he won't give away the 
secret of the mixture, he does give 
away the tobacco—12 pounds of it a 
month. When he travels on per­
sonal appearance tours there's al­
ways a large can of it-on his dress­
ing table—so if his orchestra is play­
ing in your town, and you know any­
one who smokes a pipe, you might 
drop in and get some. 

Deems Taylor, the music critic 
and composer who acts as -master 
of ceremonies on "Musical Ameri­
cana," has a maid who delights in 
taking part.in contests of all kinds. 
She. was greatly exoited. recently 
when she was notified that she had 
qualified among the winners in a 
national contest, and couldn't wait 
to receive her prize. When it came 
it turned out to be an autographed 
copy1' of Taylor's latest book on 
music! 

AROUND 
•h. HOUSE 

Items of Interest 
to the Housewife 

A rubber band wrapped near 
each end of coat hangers will pre­
vent • garments from slipping off 
them. 

* * • 
A pinch of cinnamon or sugar 

burned in a tin can will remove 
objectionable food odors in the 
house 

* * * 
Fasten a large paper sack over 

the end of the food grinder when 
grinding bread or crackers. The 
sack will catch all of the crumbs. 

Always melt marshmallows in 
the top of a double boiler oyer hot 
water. 

,• • • • 

Flour sifters and kitchen strain­
ers should be dried thoroughly be­
fore storing. 

• • • • - • 

Rubber plants cannot be fer­
tilized too highly. Give each plant 
a teaspoon of sulphate ammonia 
once a month and do not be afraid 
of watering too much. They\liRe 
a wet soil. 

Bob Trout maintains that during 
those first few days after war really 
broke loose he averaged, only two 
and one-half hours' sleep out of each 
24, and could have floated a battle­
ship on the amount of coffee he 
drank to keep awake. Newscasting 
isn't all that it's cracked up to be. 

—*— 
Republic"has arranged fo'pjfoduce 

a picture starring Gene Autrey; the 
title will be "Melody Ranch"—same 
as his' radio program—and several 
members of the radio cast will ap­
pear in the picture. 

Mirth Like Lightning 
Mirth is like a flash of lightning 

that breaks through a gloom of 
clouds and glitters for a moment. 

Cheerfulness keeps up a kind of 
daylight in the mind and fills It 
with a steady and perpetual seren­
ity .—Addison. , 

Fully half out families ire getting toojittli 
ti amin: and minerals to{ttUht\ttKst,ss.ys 
the Department of Agriculture. 

It s easy to get more of these essentials 
—merely by making oranges your family's 
summer refreshment! 

reel and eat them. Keep ready a big 
pitcher of fresh orangeade. Or better yet-

Have big, 8-ounce glasses of fresh 
orange juice with breakfast daily.- This 
gives you all the vitamin C you normally 
need. Adds vitamins A, Bi and G and the 
minerals calcium, phosphorus mi mm 

Sunkist U tending you the pick of Cali­
fornia's best-ever crop of wonderfully 
juicy summer oranges. Order a supply 
tight awayl 
Ccrrty*. lMt.Callfciat.lWt Ciwin f i i ^ 

Sunkist 
CALIFORNIA O R A N G E S 

Brs t lot — f/f/f/ 

IOUR Toum-qouR STORES 
I J ° t t * co*""*!*? lodwlef the turn hones tvnoaadlns the town. 
2k4'"fl* *•*»• »*«es are there for the t«coinako&rtio<faad to terra the 

people of our fiu-ta homes. The merchants who adTsnite "specials" ate mer-
chants who are sties they Cain tweet ell competition ia both quality aad prices. 

http://lMt.Callfciat.lWt
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By LEMUEL F. PARTON 

(Consolidated Feature*—WNU Service.) 
[EW YORK.—In 1922, when a 

daughter was born tcrthe Grand 
** Duchess Charlotte of Luxembourg 

there was confusion and embarrass-
„ „ . , ment in the 
Caesar Received p a i a C e be-
Bare.Dues From c a u s e no-
Tiny Luxembourg whefe ta"the 

. • r e a l m w a s 
there a gun with which to salute 
the royal newcomer. That was one 
instance in which the League of Na­
tions had fulfilled its obligation for 
the progressive disarmament of Eu­
rope. Never would Luxembourg 
menace the peace of the continent. 
The French gallantly rushed in a 

' 75, with a crew, and the baby was 
given a thunderous welcome. 

Today the Grand Duchess 
Charlotte, her husband, Prince 
Felix of Bourbon-Parma and 
their six children are safe in 
France, fleeing guns which end 
lives rather than acclaim new 

' life. 1 The terror came in the 
night, after 21 years of peace­
ful home-keeping, in which the 
grand duchess had reared her 
children, played the piano and, 
being a fluent linguist, had kept 
abreast of French, German and 
English literature. She has al­
ways^ said that talk of war and 
politics was distasteful to her. 
As the ruler of her tiny princi­
pality she discharged her du­
ties of state with care and dili­
gence. 

At the eirri* of-, the ^o r l ' d war, 
Charlotte expressed extreme dis­
taste for the Germans. Her elder 
sister, Marie Adelaide, was com­
pelled to retire as ruler, on account 
of her pro-German sympathies and 
Charlotte was elected in plebiscite 
which continued the last grand 

. duchy in Europe, as against a re­
public. 

( , She is tail and handsome, 44 
years old, of the House of Nas­
sau, also the Bouse of Queen 
Wilhelmina of Holland, the rich- . 
est house in Europe. Luxem­
bourg is a land of Millet land-

• scapes and haunted castles. The 
grand duchess has traversed it 
mainly on horseback, riding 
side-saddle. Here the new sav­
agery finds a shining mark of 
age-old decency and simplicity. 

Washington Stirs With War Talk 
As Defense Plan Takes Shape 

President Roosevelt Asks Congress for Billion Dollar 
Military Appropriation in Addition to Regular 

Annual Grants for Army and Navy. 

t^DWARD LESLIE BURGIN, who 
J-1 recently retired as British min­
ister of supply,. knows Sanskrit and' 
six or eight other languages, and 

. , . - . , writes philo-
New Member of s o p n i c a i e s . 
British Cabinet a s a y s . H e 
Stiff Technocrat '?°uW e x P ! ^ 

the war, but 
his critics said he wasn't much help 
in fighting it. Replacing him is the 
one-time grocer's boy, Herbert Mor­
rison, who quit school when he was 
12. Mr. Morrison, who for the last 

• nine years has been lambasting the 
tory government for fumbling and 
faltering, is the only dash of new 
blood in the re-made cabinet. A 
conservative Labor leader, who in 
1934 rushed the last of the left-wing­
ers out of the movement, he has 
been variously appraised. One Brit­
ish friend tells me that "he is an­
other Ramsay MacDonald, ham­
strung by political ambition." An­
other, equally credible, tells me he 
is a vigorous and intelligent public 

'" leader who will greatly strengthen 
the cabinet. 

The son of a laborer, he was 
grocer's boy, elevator operator, 
traveling salesman, telephone 
operator/ and secretary of the 
London Labor party at ¢5 a 
week. When he was a small 
boy, a phrenologist, taking his 
last six pence for a fee, told 
him he would one day rule Eng­
land. He had heard about Dick 
Whittington and laughingly tells 
the story when someone sug­
gests that he may be prime 
minister. It is almost certain 

f that he will if England has an­
other Labor government. 

Significantly, he has contended that 
England must be more hospitable 
to conveyor-belt production, in both 
war and peace, if it expected to 
meet competition. The Germans 
long have been in line-production of 
planes,, while the British have clung 
to hand-craft and quality—tradition­
ally. Judging from Mr. Morrison's 
dossier of the last few years, he 
may help put more technological 
kick'into their war operations. That 
has been one of his big ideas. 

• 
TN HOLLYWOOD they toss out a 
•*• male director and substitute a 
woman for the direction of "Dance, 
Girls, Dance." Miss Dorothy Arzner 
replaces Roy Del Ruth. 

It is the well-worn story of one 
step at a time—stenographer, script 
girl, film editor, scenarist, director. 
When she was a student at the Uni­
versity of Southern California, her 
father asked her to show some 
friends through Cecil De Mille's 
movie lot. She liked the place so 
well that she returned to get a 
stenographer's job. 

By WILLIAM BBUCKABT 
WNU Service, National Press Bldg., 

Washington, D. C. 
WASHINGTON.—I shall try, in 

this article, to provide you with a 
picture of your national capital dur­
ing the last few weeks. It is a situ­
ation, a condition that, in general, 
gives rise to very little pride. 'But 
the facts must be faced, for in this 
capital city things have happened 
that can best be described as the 
screaming and play-panic of chil­
dren playing cops and robbers. 
Only, of course, the screams were 
screams of men and women in 
places of official responsibility and 
the panicky outbursts and .orders 
were the excited and unbalanced 
procedure of leaders in public and 
private life. 

In the midst Of this period which 
I am attempting to describe came 
President Roosevelt's voice, heard 
over the din of the others because 
the President and his office are re­
spected. He drove to the Capitol 
building and there, before a joint 
assembly of senate and house, he 
asked for new national defense 
measures, and he asked for $1,196,-

SEN. HIRAM JOHNSON—He's 
been .in the Senate since the last 
World war and is "still going 
strong." 

000,000 in appropriations to pay for 
an expanded army, navy, marine 
corps, shipbuilding plants, munition 
plants; gun production, etc. 

Mr. Roosevelt foresaw desperate 
need for these things and he told 
congress to speed up these appro­
priations. According to the Presi­
dent's view of the conditions that 
our nation faces, fast' enemy air­
planes can reach Kansas City or St. 
Louis—the heart of America—before 
we can do anything about it. More­
over, parachutists from enemy 
planes might drop in, most any day 
now, and start taking over our cities 
and towns and countrysides. The 
fact is that Mr. Roosevelt made Eu­
rope's war appear so close to Wash­
ington .that we really may expect to 
hear bombs exploding almost any 
minute. 

In view of all of these things, Mr. 
Roosevelt thought we ought to have 
approximately 50,000 airplanes, and 
build them tonight or tomorrow. 

President'» Request Added . 
To Regular Appropriation* 

The vast sum for which the Presi­
dent asked is in addition to about 
$3,27<i,000,000 in appropriations that 
were requested for the military 
services in the regular annual ap­
propriation bills for the fiscal year 
that begins on July 1, 1940. He as­
sured congress there was no over­
lapping of items. This was all new 
stuff; it represented the best thought 
of what ought to be done to meet 
the challenge of Hitler's legions. 

As Hitler's legions overran Hol­
land and Belgium, the war fever of 
Washington hit a new high. It had 
started up when the German dic­
tator went into Norway. Naturally, 
the temperature increased when the 
awful foregs^f the Hitler machine 
were turned loose iri the Low Coun­
tries. Mr. Roosevelt's' speech to 
congress, well advertised in ad­
vance to a nation of people that was 
waiting for decisions from Washing­
ton, turned on all of the vafves of 
excitement as a street cleaner floods 
a street from a fire hydrant. Only 
the Are hydrant gives off cool wa­
ter in which children like to play. 

But before the President's speech, 
there were such sour songs as that 
sung by Senator Austin of Vermont, 
assistant .Republican leader in the 
senate. Mr. Austin rose gravely in 
his place in the senate and there 

WAR TALK 

William Bruckart isn't very 
proud of the way in which gov­
ernment officials in Washington 
have become so excited about 
the danger of U. S. involvement 
in Europe's war. He sees no 
reason for panic. This is a time 
for balanced thinking and not 
muddling. Enemies within, our 
gates or the "fifth column" 
should receive speciej. ittention, 
according to Bruefcart. 

"The Name 
Is Familiar— 

BY 
FELIX B. STREYCKMANS 

and ELMO SCOTT WATSON 

blared forth in loud tones the 
learned wisdom of a statesman, It 
shouted to the world that the United 
States of America must do every­
thing it can to help the allies. Yes, 
we must supply money! And so, 
Senator Austin argued for repeal of 
that so-called Johnson Act. 

Now, it may be remembered that 
Senator ^Hi" Johnson of California 
fought and fought until he was able 
to convince congress that none of 
the foreign nations whof had not paid 
their debts should be allowed to bor­
row any more money in the United 
States. The California' senator is 
one of seven men now in the senate 
who were there during the first 
World war, and he is still going 
strong. 

No Payment on War Debts 
Has Been Made Recently 

The law that he forced through 
congress, almost single handed, was 
a good law when it was passed. It 
is a better law today, considering 
that those nations which we helped 
by men and billions of dollars are 
involved again in a war to save 
democracy. And, incidentally, they 
have paid nothing on their debts in 
the last 10 or 12 years, so that they 
still owe around $13,500,000,000. 

Lights have been turning late in 
the war and navy offices. Mr. 
Roosevelt worked one night until 
two o'clock in the morning. That 
was while he was preparing his de­
fense speech. Even the gambling 
spirit is around. One can get bets 
in the capital city that we will be 
mixed up in Europe's war, and the 
dates that are offered range any­
where from a few weeks to next 
winter. 

And the politicians! Yes, they 
are busy about the thing, also. The 
"inner circle" and the third term 
advocates are smiling with that self-
satisfied appearance that goes with 
a knowledge that they have gained 
ground. Privately, many of them 
will say that the nearness of the 
war makes certain that Mr. Roose­
velt will be elected for a third term. 
They are sure the country will not 
dare to change horses in the middle 
of the stream, not even if France 
and England did change their prin­
cipal leaders. Mr. Roosevelt will 
have to remain on the job because 
his two terms give him a great ad­
vantage in dealing with these for­
eign problems, they are saying. 

'He Kept Us Out of War' 
Is Now Being Revived 

And dear Mr. Secretary Wallace 
of the department of agriculture. 
He couldn't get in on the excitement 
any other way, apparently. So, in 
his keynote speech to the Iowa Dem­
ocratic state convention, he an­
nounced that Mr. Roosevelt had 
kept this nation out of war. That 
was his tribute, but immediately 
there were a good many persons 
able to recall a similar slogan from 
back about 1916 when it was used 
with great effectiveness. 

All through these days that I have 
sought to describe was a steady 
stream of bad news from Europe— 
bad news for all of us who want to 
see the allies (or anybody else who 
can do it) knock Hitler and his gang 
into smithereens. The United 
States is pro-ally. Of that there is 
no doubt. The Hitler drives into 
Holland and Belgium have made it 
certain that f ™ supporters of Hitler 
dare assert themselves in this coun­
try. But I have a hunch that allied 
censorship has been opened s»me-
what in order that we, here in the 
United States, can get the full im­
pact of the slaughter, rape and ar­
son being committed by the Ger­
man legions. I say it is just a 
hunch. You see, it might be pos­
sible after aB that the allies would 
like to have us in the war on their 
side to pay their bills and have our 
soldiers killed, again. 

Anyway, this whole thing gripes 
me beyond expression. It is dis­
gusting to see activities that were 
hardly equaled in the midst of the 
World war. It is more disgusting 
to listen to talk that represents per­
fection in lack of balanced thinking. 

There is no doubt at all that our 
army and our navy ara^far below 
par. That is to say, this nation has 
nothing like the necessary or proper 
defense structure that a great na­
tion must have. But if there is to 
be preparations against enemies, 
why neglect enemies within our 
gates. If we face the facts, it must 
be admitted that we have "fifth col­
umn" dangers within the boundaries 
of America, dangerous "fifth col­
umns." 

I have written in these columns 
before that Chairman Die* of the 
special house committee was doing 
a great job in ferreting out the 
groups in the United States that 
would destroy our government. I 
have written likewise that Mr. Dies 
was fought at every' turn from with­
in the administration which is of the 
same Democratic political faith as 
he. So, it strikes me that prepara­
tion must include defense against 
the "fifth column" of our nation as 
well as the "fifth columns" and the 
guns of other nations. 

FARM GROUNDS 
NEED ATTENTION 

Sanford Cluett 

Bunten B u r n e r 
T"? HAT small gas burner the den-
•*• tist has that makes things so hot 

so fast, is called a Bunsen burner. 
It consists of a straight tube with 
small holes at the bottom where air 
enters and mixes with the gas. The 
oxygen in the air causes the gas to 
burn with a hotter flame. . 

Your gas stove works the same 
way—there are air vents in the pipes 
that lead to the 
burners , so that 
you are burning 
a mixture of gas 
and air, other­
wise you wouldn't 
get much heat 
from the gas 
alone. It really 
d o e s n ' t make 
much difference 
where the holes 
are placed along 
the pipe—as long 
as they are this .. „ 
side of the meter. V o n »i»>»en 

But what we started out to say 
was, this burner is named after 
Robert Wilhelm von Bunsen, a Ger­
man chemist who was born in 1811 
and died in 1899. He was a profes­
sor of chemistry at Kassel in Bres-
lau, and later at the famous uni* 
versity at Heidelberg. 

P. S. Von Bunsen didn't invent 
the burner—either a man by the 
name of Peter Desdga or the famous 
Michael Faraday did. At least, it is 
known that both of them Used the 
same type of burner before Von 
Bunsen. 

» • • 
Sanfor iz ing 

C*OR the fact that your Adam's 
••apple isn't in danger of being 
squeezed out of shape by a tight 
collar after your shirt has been laun­
dered a few times, you can thank a 
66-year-old native of Troy, N. Y.— 
Sanford L. Cluett. He was the in­
ventor of a pre-shrinking process 
which is used to treat one-fifth of 
all the available fabrics in this coun­

try before they 
are made up into 
wearing apparel 
and which has 
added a hew 
word to our ev­
eryday speech— 
sanforizing. 

After the World 
war, American 
men, accustomed 
to khaki shirts, 
wanted to contin­
ue wearing soft 

collars. But they shrank after 
washing and no purchaser knew how 
much shrinkage to expect. Shirt 
manufacturers had shrinking ma­
chines but they didn't do the job 
completely and they had to allow 
three-quarters of an inch for shrink­
age in each collar. The problem 
was to produce a uniformly shrunk 
fabric that would not change its size 
when given the average laundry 
wash. 

In 1919 Cluett, a veteran of the 
Spanish-American war, an engineer 
and an inventor with a number of 
patents to his credit, joined the re­
search department of the company 
of which his name is now a part. 
After a long series of experiments 
he finally produced in 1928 the proc­
ess now known as sanforizing and 
all those devoted to wearing shirts 
With soft collars breathed easier, 
both figuratively and literally! 

* • • 
Nobel P r i ze 

'TPHERE S more than a little irony 
•*• in the fact that the most famous 

of all prizes for the person or or­
ganization who best serves the in­
terests of world peace each year 
is paid out of a fund that had its 
origin in the sale of a product which 
adds to the horrors of war. Yet 
such lis the case of the Nobel prize. 
AlfrecP Bernhard Nobel, Swedish 

chemist and in­
ventor, born in 
1833, was educat­
ed in Russia and 
sent to America 
to study engineer­
ing. But within a 
year he returned 
to Europe to aid 
his father in de­
veloping military 
and naval mines 
and torpedoes. In 
1862 he helped the 
elder Nobel in 
pe r fec t ing the 
manufacture of 

nitroglycerine, called "Nobel's blast­
ing oil," and further research by the 
two led to the invention and com­
mercial production of dynamite, 
originally known as "Nobel's ig-
jiites." 

When. Nobel died in Italy in 1896 
he left a large fund, from the inter­
est of which annual prizes were to 
be awarded achievements in various 
fields, including physics, science, 
chemistry, medicine and literature. 
But the most humanitarian, the No­
bel peace prize, is paid from the 
profits of a "merchant of death." 

(Releaeed by We«Um Newipaper Union.I 

Ancestor of Modern Football 
Every year in January for the last 

600 years they have played at Haxey 
in England an ancient ball game 
which was the ancestor of modern 
football 

Trees and Shrubs Provide 
Best Landscaping Aids. 

By JOHN H. HARRIS 
(EMteasion Landscape SpeclaUst, 

North Carolina StiU Collet'') 
Farmers and city people have dif­

ferent problems in beautifying their 
homes. In the city or town, space 
usually is limited, but long summer 
evenings allow time for the atten­
tion to annual'and perennial plants 
that offer most flowers for the least 
space; — ; 7-

Oh the farm, rush seasons in the 
fields mean long hours and little 
leisure at the very time flower gar­
dens may be most in need of weed­
ing, cultivating, and watering. But 
the grounds around the. farm home 
are usually ample for more of the 
ornamented trees and shrubs than 
those of the town dweller. 

These two sharp differences are 
worth considering when the farm 
family considers plantings to im­
prove the home grounds. Planting 
a few shrubs each season,, and add­
ing a few more from time to time 
will soon make the home more at­
tractive, and will conserve time 
in busy seasons. 

Shrubs and trees will need good 
care and watering for two or three 
seasons, but after that, if they are 
well selected, good woody plants will 
practically take care of themselves. 
What work is needed can be done 
at odd times and when farm work 
is slack. 

Handy End Table 
Made From Spools 

By fcl/TH WVETH SPEARS 
*T~)EAR MRS. SPEARS: I would 
*~* like to make some handy end 

tables of spools for the living 
room, but I can't think of a way 
to make them rigid. Have you 
any suggestions as to how this 
may be done? B. P . " 

Curtain rods are used through , 
the spools to make the legs. Bet-" 
ter take along a spool to try when 

FOR A TABU 26" Hie: I 
USE3BOARDS 
' .WITH HOLES 

BORED IN 
THE 

CORNERS 

USE 52 
SMALL SPOOLS 
AND 24 L ARSE' 
O N E S - ^ - ^ 

SE 4 BRASS 
CURTAIN 
RODS RUN 
THROUGH 

POOLS 
iND BOARDS, 

SPOOLS -—"*"^ 

Alfred Nobel. 

Drouth Years Favored 
Weed Rivals of Crops 

The "weed problem" on Ameri­
can farms has changed radically in 
the last generation, according to L. 
W. Kephart, in charge of weed re­
search in the federal bureau of plant 
industry. From concern over culti­
vation of annual weeds iri tilled 
crops, interest has shifted chiefly to 
the "noxious weeds," mainly peren­
nials which have been spreading 
alarmingly. 

Fifteen years ago the norious 
weed areas did not greatly exceed 
l,0p0,000 acres, Kephart estimates. 
Now. these weeds have "taken" 
about 6,000,000 acres of good farm­
land west of the Mississippi, with 
crop production checked or prevent­
ed, not only on single farms, but 
in whole townships. 

Two factors have played a great 
part in this spread, Kephart finds. 
Since 1930 an unusual series of dry 
years has proved extra favorable 
for seed production by the weeds. 
Economic depression increased 
farm tenancy and a general let­
down in farm care. "The indica­
tions are," says Kephart, "that the 
present situation will not greatly im­
prove and that noxious weeds will 
continue to increase, unless vigorous 
measures are taken to combat 
them." 

The situation has roused many 
farmers. The federal seed law has 
been made more effective. Thirteen 
states have- adopted new laws or 
revised old laws on weed control, 
and eight states are co-operating 
with the bureau of plant industry in 
weed-control research. 

you,shop for the rods; and get 
the type that has,.one piece fitting 
inside the other.' If the spools are 
a little loose on the rod, it won't 
make any difference for they 
must be glued between each spool, 
and also between the spools and 
the table shelves. I have shown 
in the sketch everything else you 
need to know to make this table. 
Good luck to you! 

NOTE: If you ftave an iron bed 
or a rocking chair, you would like 
to modernize be sure to send for 
my Book No. 3. It contains 32 
fascinating ideas of things to make 
for your home. Send 10 cents coin 
to cover cost of book and mailing. 
Send order to: 

MRS. RUTH WYETH SPEARS 
Drawer 10 

Bedford Bills New York 
Enclose 10 cents for Book No. 3. 

Name < 
Address « 

He Put the Words Right 
In Her Mouth to Win Bet 

T*WO fellows who had been din-
* ing rather well were in the 

mood for a ridiculous wager. 
"I'll bet you," said one solemn­

ly, "that the first words my wife 
says, when I get home tonight are 
'My dear.' " 

"And I'll bet you a fiver," said 
the other, "that she won't say, 
'My dear.' " 

They proceeded towards the first 
man's home. He knocked at the 
door and a head appeared at 
the window above. 

"My dear—" began the man. 
His long-suffering wife interrupt­

ed with: " 'My dear' be hanged. 
Wait till you come inside." 

OLD FOLKS 
Htrv Is Amazing Relief of 

Condition* Due to Slu«i*h Bowel* 

/fWjgJgPgylBywWiHy act alike. Just try thJa 
• * ' - " » " " l l f f * J • f * »11 v*««t«bl* laxative. 

So mild, thorough, refreshing, invigorating. D e ­
pendable relief from sicic headache*, bilious «r>elli* 
tired feeling when associated with constipation. 
U f l l l . j ,,» bS»tr get a 25c box of N R from you* 
n i i n O l l I n I S K druggist. Make the tes t—thea 
If not delighted, return the box to us. We w i l 
refund the p u r c h a s e 
price . That's fair. 
Get N R Tablet* today. ' J ^ T O NICHT 

U.S. Wheat Insurance 
Is Expanded in 1940 

Wheat growers of the nation took 
out more than two and one-third 
times as much "all-risk" crop in­
surance for 1940 as for 1939, the 
Federal Crop Insurance corporation 
reports. Increased grower interest 
swelled the number of contracts in 
force from 166,000 in 1939 to almost 
380,000 in 1940. These are estimated 
to cover 11,000,000 acres, insuring 
farmers of income from at least 106,-
000,000 bushels of production. ' 

There was increased enrollment 
in 1940 for all but two states in 
which insurance was offered. The 
greatest increase occurred in the 
major winter wheat states, where in 
1939 growers did not have an oppor­
tunity to make use of advances from 
Agricultural Adjustment adminis­
tration payments to finance premi­
ums. Nebraska and Kansas both 
registered more than a 300 per cent 
increase, Nebraska going from 13,-
000 contracts in 1939 to almost 57,000 
in 1940, and Kansas from 15,000 to 
60,500. 

Pennsylvania leads ift. crop insur­
ance in the eastern winter wheat 
area with 5,900 growers in the pro­
gram, an increase of 158 per cent. 
In the Far West, Idaho leads with 
6,836 contracts, an increase of 325 
per cent. 

Straw Erosion Control 
If you have an old straw stack 

which ypu don't need for feed or fori 
any other purpose, don't burn it,] 
or just let it Btand out in the fleld.t 
You can make good use of the straw 
for erosion control. Straw—as well 
as pine needles, leaves and other 
mulch materials—can be made to 
save your coil. Soil savers have a 
pat slogan for gully control: "Seed 
it, fertiliz* it, mulch it and watch 
the grass choke the gully to death,'.' 
The idea is worth trying. 

Value of Time 
Know the true value of time, 

snatch, seize and enjoy every mo­
ment^ of it. No idleness, no lazi­
ness, no procrastination; never 
put off till tomorrow what you can 
do today.—Chesterfield. 

Kills 
Many Insects 
O N FIOWERS* FRUITS 
VEGETABLES ft SHRUBS 
Demand original sealed 
bottles, from your dealer 

# * 

BUREAU OF 
STANDARDS 

• A BUSINESS 
organization which, wants 
to get the most for the 
money sets up standards 
by which to judge what 
is offered to it, just as in 
Washington the govern­
ment maintains a Bureau 
oi Standards. 

•You can have your own 
Bureau of Standards, too. 
Just consult the advertis-
ing columns oi your news­
paper. They safeguard 
your purchasing/ power 
every day of every year. 



^-*vft*j^»H«in&firW^^ 

THE CHARLEVOIX COUNTY HERALD, (EAST JORDAN, MICH) FRI DAY, MAY 31, 1940. 

Fine Quality 
House Paints 
Buy Now and Save! 

0>r Best 
• • • • • Paint 
A w.ath.r iciitt-
hi*. Houit Paint 
that will siva you 
anany y i i n of 
aanrict. Special 

$3.25 
x GAL 

i 
Premium 
•vttidtHoiiuPtM 
. . a really fine 

'paint at a price. 
> Don't c o n f u t e 

PREMIUM w i t h 
cheap paints. 
Special ~~.—~— 

$2.60 
GAL. 

OUR BEST PAINT, 6 0 % LEAD 

PREMIUM PAIN — 4 0 % LEAD 

Whiteford's 
5c TO $1.00 STORE 

EAST JORDAN — MICH. 

Notice of the Annual 
School District Election 

•Notice is hereby given to the quali­
fied electors of Bast Jordan Consoli­
dated School District No, 2, Charle­
voix County, State of Michigan, that 
the next ensuing Annual School Elec­
tion will be held at the place or places 
in said School District as designated 
below, viz:-— 
EAST JORDAN LIBRARY BLDG. 

— on — 

Monday, June 10th, 1940 
At which election the following 

Trustees will be elected :— 
Two Trustees for a term of three 

years. 
The following candidates have filed 

petitions:— 
H. P. Porter. 
A. L. Darbee. 
The Polls of said Election will be 

open at 8:00 a. m., and will remain 
open until 6:00 p. mM of said day of 
Election. ^ 

Dated this 28th day of May, A. D. 
1940. 

JAMES GIDLEY, 
: - Sec'y of the Board of Education, 
adv. 22-2 

BURNING, GNAWING PAINS 
IN STOMACH RELIEVED 

When excess stomach acid irritates, 
and causes discomfort help neutra­
lize with Adla Tablets — yet eat 
what you want. Adla gives relief or 
money back. Gidley & Mac "Druggists. 

Lemon Juice Recipe Checks 
Rheumatic Pain Quickly 

If you suffer from rheumatic, arthfitta 
or neuritis pain, try this simple inexpen­
sive home recipe that thousands are using. 
Get a package of Ru-Ex Compound today. 
Mix it with a quart of water, add the 
juice of 4 lemons. It's easy. No trouble 

- at all and pleasant. You need only 2 
tablespponfuls two times a day. Often 
within 48 hours — sometimes' overnight — 
splendid results: are obtained. If , the paini 
do not quickly leave and if you do not 
feel better, . Ru-Ex will cost you nothing to 
try as it is sold by your druggist under 
an absolute money—back guarantee. Ru-Ex 
Compound is for sale and recommended by 

HITE DRUG COMPANY 

Dr. H. M. HARRINGTON 
Physician and Surgeon 

Office Hourat 
2 to 5 P. M. — 7 to 8 P. M. l i s t s ' 

Office in Lumber Co. Building 

Office Phone — 140-F2 
Residence Phone — I40-F3 

BENJAMIN BUSTARD 
and PAUL LOVELAND 

GENERAL BUILDING AND 
LICENSED ELECTRICAL 

CONTRACTORS 
New or Repair Work of All Kind. 

REASONABLE TERMS 
Phone 247 — Ea.it Jordan 

Address: P. O. Box 64 , E. Jordan 

R. G. WATSON 
F U N E R A L 

D I R E C T O R 
Phone — 66 

M O N U M E N T S 
EAST JORDAN, - MICH. 

FRANK PHILLIPS 
Tontorial Artist 

WHEN IN NEED OF ANYTHING 

IN MY LINE, CALL IN 

AND SEE ME. 

Insurance 
AUTOMOBILE, LIFE, FIRE 

and WINDSTORM 

CITY and COUNTRY 
RELIABLE COMPANIES 

GEORGE JAQUAYS 
R. F. D. No. 4 Phon . 166-F3 

EAST JORDAN, MICH. 

Northeast Quarter (SEW N E W ) of 
Section Fourteen ( 1 4 ) , Town Thir­
ty-three (33) 'North, Range Four (4) 
West, containing forty acres more or 
less. 
Dated phis third day of March, 1940. 

The Utica Milling Company, 
a corporation, By Howard 
G. Crissman, Vice-President 
Mortgagee. 

Roy J. Crandell 
Att irney for Mortgagee 
Standish, Michigan, 
adv. l i - 1 3 

PROBATE ORDER 

State of Michigan, The Probate 
Court for the County of Charlevoix. 

At a session of said Court, held at 
the Probate Office in the City of 
Charlevoix in said County, on the 
27th day of May A. D. 1940. 

Present, Hon. Ervan A. Ruegseg-
ger, Judge of Probate. In the Matter 
of the Estate .of Mary E. Cole, De­
ceased. 

Robert A. Campbell, Administra­
tor, having filed in said Court his 
final administration account, and his 
petition praying for the allowance 
thereof and for the assignment and 
distribution, of the residue of said es­
tate. 

It is Ordered, That the 19th day of 
June, A.. D. 1940, at ten o'clock in 
the forenoon, at said Probate Office, 
be and is hereby appointed for exam­
ining and allowing said account and 
hearing said petition; -, 

It is Further Ordered, That public 
notice thereof be given by publication 
of a copy of this order, for three suc­
cessive weeks previous to said day 
of hearing, in the Charlevoix County 
Herald, a newspaper printed and cir­
culated in said County. 

ERVAN A. RUEGSEGGER, 
22-3 •' Judge of Probate. 

PROBATE ORDER 
State of Michigan, The Probate 

Court for the County of Charlevoix. 
In the Matter of the Estate of Mor­

timer Tyner, Deceased. 
At a session of said Court, held in 

the Probate Office in the ' c i ty of 
Charlevoix, in said county, on the 
22nd day of May 1940. 

Bresent: Ervan A. Ruegsegger, 
Probate Judge. 

The above estate having been ad­
mitted to probate and Robert _A^ 
Campbell having been appointed ad­
ministrator with will annexed. 

It is Ordered, That two months 
from this date be allowed for credi­
tors to present their claims against 
said estate for examination and ad­
justment, and that all creditors of 
said deceased, are required to pre­
sent their claims to said Court, at the 
Probate Office in the City of Charle­
voix, on or before the 24th day of 
July, 1940 at ten o'clock in the fore­
noon, at which time claims will be 
heard. 

It is Further Ordered, That public 
notice thereof be given by publica­
tion of this order for three successive 
weeks previous to said day of hearing 
in the Charlevoix County Herald, a 
newspaper printed and circulated in 
said county. 

ERVAN A. RUEGSEGGER, 
21-3 Judge of Probate. 

fiMy/w 

sm&w/. 
Now is the time for all food people la 
begin thinking about vacation. And the 
more you think about it, the more likely 
you'll be to spend it in Michigan! 

Here are thousands of lake. In which 
to sail, fish, swim—or merely splash) 

Here are grand forests and State' Parka, 
with many a charming camping lite and 
many a fine trout stream. 

Here are picturesque rocks, waterfalls, 
beaches and sand dunes . . , scenery at 
great natural splendor. 

To bring all these advantages close to 
your door, you have a magnificent system 
of roads for motor touring . . . exciting 
trails of adventure that will carry yon 
smoothly to all parts of the perfect State 
for a perfect vacation! 

• And while you art away, r*m.mb«r taw* 
you arm a. n.dr nom. at fa. ji«ar.ir f.f«»*M«* 

The variety of her scenery addi 
greatly to Michigan't attraction! 
as a vacation playground. JL 

V f c V-"" 

Does your ideal vacation include the 
flash of sunlight on water? Then choose 
Michigan, the land of lakes and streams! 

MICHIGAN BELL TELEPHONE COMPANY 

MORTGAGE SALE 

Default having been made in the 
conditions of a certain mortgage and 
the note accompanying the same da­
ted January 3, 1939, made by Leslie 
R. Horn, a single man, of Detroit, 
Michigan, to the Utica Milling Com­
pany, a Corporation of Utica, Michi­
gan, and recorded in the office of 
the Register of Deeds of Charle­
voix County, Michigan, on January 5, 
1939, in liber 77 of Mortgages, on 
page 495, and default having been 
made in the payments of the interest 
and taxes due on said martgaged pre­
mises, and said default continuing 
and the whole sum unpaid and claim­
ed to be due at the date of this no­
tice for principal and interest, being 
the sum of Eight Hundred Two Dol­
lars and fifty ($802.50) cents, and no 

or proceedings at law or in equi­
ty having been instituted far the re­
covery of the debt now remaining, se­
cured by said mortgage, or any part 
thereof. 

Now Therefore By virtue of the 
power of sale in said mortgage con­
tained, notice is hereby given that 
said mortgage will be foreclosed by 
sale of the premises therein describ­
ed at public auction to the highest 
bidder at the front door of the Char­
levoix County Courthouse, in the City 
of Charlevoix, Charlevoix County, 
Michigan (said building being the 
building where the Circuit Court for 
Charlevoix County is held,) on the 
eighth day of June, 1940, at ten o'­
clock in the forenoon, to satisfy the' 
amount due on said mortgage and all 
legal costs. The said mortgage premi­
ses are situated in the township of 
Chandler,. County of Charlevoix, 
State of Michigan, and a/e described 
as follows: 

The Southest Quarter of the 

HONEY GOES ABROAD 

Grandville — Two carloads of 
Michigan honey, 100,000 pounds in 
all, were recently shipped from here 
for an undisclosed foreign port. Duty' 
on the honey, which was packed in 
60-pound boxes, amounted to more 
than $1,000. • 

FARMERS 
ATTENTION 

DEAD STOCK 
REMOVAL 

Phone Collect 
Prompt Service 

VALLEY 
CHEMICAL CO. 

Telephone Gaylord 123 

r 

Wfien-
I N A RECENT REPRESENTATIVE CROSS 

SECTION SURVEY AT SUNOCO STATIONS 

BY A N UNBIASED A U T H O R I T Y . 

FORMER BUYERS OF EXTRA-PRICED 
GASOLINES VOTED.,. BIG MAJORITY 

THAT 
flu-douu Suntrtxr 
us wAatwe wantmoit 
maaasoune" 

V A N T I - K N O C K • M I L E A G E 
• P O W E R >/ P I C K U P 
>f ALL A R O U N D PERFORMANCE 

Recent ly a survey w a s m a d e a m o n g moto r i s t s , w h o w e r e 

a s k e d , " W h a t d o y o u w o n t m o s t in a g a s o l i n e ? " They 

answe»ed , ' A n t i - k n o c k , Power , M i l e a g e , Pickup and A l l 

A round Per formance." On each of these qual i f ies they w a n t e d , 

t lmy were asked, ' 'Doe* Nu -B lue Sunoco fi l l the b i l l ? " They 

vo ted by a b i g m a j o r i t y t ha t "Nu Blue Sunoco docs g i ve 

us w h o t w e w a n t most in a gaso l i ne . ^ 

and In»»«» a»ata?L, 
H « n swoco MOVED 

•sr 

SILLS AT REGULAR GAS PRICC 

EAST JORDAN CO-OP. CO 
PHONE 179 EAST JORDAN, MICH. 

http://Ea.it

